
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 15,590 LB OPERATING WEIGHT (Specification #42)
 
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat E85 Western $77,955.00
 2019 Bobcat E85 Western -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat E85 Northern $77,955.00
 2019 Bobcat E85 Northern -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat E85 Central $77,955.00
 2019 Bobcat E85 Central -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat E85 Southern $77,955.00
 2019 Bobcat E85 Southern -- NB --
 
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case CX75C Western $85,574.00
 2019 Case CX75C Western -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case CX75C Northern $81,499.00
 2019 Case CX75C Northern -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case CX75C Central $81,499.00
 2019 Case CX75C Central -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case CX75C Southern $81,499.00
 2019 Case CX75C Southern -- NB --
 
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Western $98,926.00
 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Western -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Northern $98,926.00
 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Northern -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Central $98,926.00
 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Central -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Southern $91,909.00
 2019 Caterpillar 308E2 Southern -- NB --
 
Doosan 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Western $90,011.12
 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Western -- NB --
Doosan 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Northern $90,011.12

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 42.pdf


 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Northern -- NB --
Doosan 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Central $90,011.12
 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Central -- NB --
Doosan 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Southern $90,011.12
 2019 Doosan DX85R-3 Southern -- NB --
 
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Western $93,150.00
 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Western -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Northern $93,150.00
 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Northern -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Central $93,150.00
 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Central -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Southern $93,150.00
 2019 Hitachi ZX75US-5 Southern -- NB --
 
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 75G Western $93,150.00
 2019 John Deere 75G Western -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 75G Northern $93,150.00
 2019 John Deere 75G Northern -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 75G Central $93,150.00
 2019 John Deere 75G Central -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 75G Southern $93,150.00
 2019 John Deere 75G Southern -- NB --
 
Cowin Equipment 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Western $81,180.00
 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Western -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Northern $81,649.00
 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Northern -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Central $81,649.00
 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Central -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Southern $81,649.00
 2019 Kobelco SK-75SR-3E Southern -- NB --
 
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Western $75,485.00
 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Western -- NB --
Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Northern $73,250.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Northern $75,085.00
Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Central $73,250.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Central $75,085.00
Creel Tractor 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Southern $74,878.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota KX080-4S Southern $75,485.00
 



Great Southern Equipment 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Western $73,360.00
 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Western -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Northern $73,360.00
 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Northern -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Central $73,360.00
 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Central -- NB --
Great Southern Equipment 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Southern $73,360.00
 2019 Link-Belt 75X3 Southern -- NB --
 
Earthmovers Construction Equipment, LLC 2019 Sany SY75 Western $75,152.00
 2019 Sany SY75 Western -- NB --
Earthmovers Construction Equipment, LLC 2019 Sany SY75 Northern $75,152.00
 2019 Sany SY75 Northern -- NB --
Earthmovers Construction Equipment, LLC 2019 Sany SY75 Central $75,152.00
 2019 Sany SY75 Central -- NB --
Earthmovers Construction Equipment, LLC 2019 Sany SY75 Southern $75,152.00
 2019 Sany SY75 Southern -- NB --
 
Cowin Equipment 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Western $99,521.00
 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Western -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Northern $93,500.00
 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Northern -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Central $93,500.00
 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Central -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Southern $93,500.00
 2019 Takeuchi TB290 Southern -- NB --
 
Cowin Equipment 2019 Volvo ECR88D Western $78,431.00
 2019 Volvo ECR88D Western -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo ECR88D Northern $80,500.00
 2019 Volvo ECR88D Northern -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo ECR88D Central $80,500.00
 2019 Volvo ECR88D Central -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo ECR88D Southern $80,500.00
 2019 Volvo ECR88D Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 15,590 LB OPERATING WEIGHT
SPECIFICATION #42

2019 Caterpillar 308E2 
The Caterpillar 308E2 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $91,909.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

523-7768 1 
304E2 CR 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
DOWNGRADE TO 307E2, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 
MODEL DOWNGRADE TO BASE 304E2 COMPACT RADIUS MINI EXCAVATOR W/FREIGHT &
PREP ONLY 2 

($21,997.00)1 ($48,108.00)2

427-9712 1 
305E2 CR 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO 311F L RR, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 
MODEL DOWNGRADE TO BASE 305E2 COMPACT RADIUS MINI EXCAVATOR W/FREIGHT &
PREP ONLY 2 

$1,356.001 ($41,884.00)2

510-1043 1 
305.5E2 CR 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO 313F, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1 
MODEL DOWNGRADE TO BASE 305.5E2 COMPACT RADIUS MINI EXCAVATOR W/FREIGHT &
PREP ONLY 2 

$25,840.001 ($36,295.00)2

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

520-3055 1 
307E2 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO 313F GC, BSE MACHINE ONLY 1 
MODEL DOWNGRADE TO BASE 307E2 MINI EXCAVATOR W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2 

$16,315.001 ($17,735.00)2

428-2140 1 
428-2140 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
THUMB, HYD + COUPLER, PG, MAN, 8T  1 
THUMB, HYDRAULIC + COUPLER, MANUAL 2 

$4,352.001 $4,352.002

485-5272 1 
HYD
THUMB+HYD
COUPLER 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
THUMB, HYD + COUPLER, PG, HYD, 8T  1 
(428-2145 THUMB, HYDRAULIC + COUPLER, HYDRAULIC) (ALSO INCLUDES 397-7033
HYDRAULICS, AUX, QC, LONG-STK) 2 

$6,543.001 $7,952.002

444-7498 1 
HYD
COUPLER 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
COUPLER, PG, MAN.D.LOCK, 8T  1 
COUPLER, PG, HYD, DUAL LOCK, ALSO INCLUDES 397-7033 2 

$1,555.001 $5,158.002

485-5302 1 
444-7498 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
COUPLER, PG, HYDR.D.LOCK, 8T  1 
COUPLER, PG, MANUAL, DUAL LOCK 2 

$3,746.001 $1,555.002

515-6836 1 
309-1325 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
DOWNGRADE TO CFG2 ARRANGEMENT FOR 308E2  1 
ROTATING BEACON 2 

($4,776.00)1 $144.002

515-6837 1 
415-5178 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
DOWNGRADE TO CFG3 ARRANGEMENT FOR 308E2 1 
TRACK, 450MM RUBBER BELT 2 

($2,701.00)1 $1,565.002

515-6857 1 
415-5183 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO CFG3 VAB ARRANGEMENT FOR 308E2 1 
TRACK, 450MM TG/RUBBER PAD 2 

$5,354.001 $1,952.002

VEHICLE: 308E2 
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $91,909.00



515-6832 1 
415-5084 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
UPGRADE TO DCA2 ARRANGEMENT FOR 308E2 1 
STICK PKG, LONG W/2ND AUX & LKG 2 

$388.001 $1,320.002

415-5183 1 
367-0947 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
TRACK,450MM TG W/RUBBER PAD  1 
COUNTERWEIGHT, EXTRA 2 

$1,952.001 $680.002

415-5084 1 
426-0234 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
STICK PKG, LONG W/ 2ND AUX & LKG  1 
CAB GUARD, FRONT WINDSHIELD 2 

$1,320.001 $1,048.002

486-6632 1 
399-6728 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
STICK PKG, STD W/ 2ND AUX VAB  1 
GUARD, CAB TOP 2 

$1,701.001 $680.002

415-5100 1 
515-6857 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
HYDRAULICS, AUX, QC,(LONG-STK)  1 
308E2 HEXMN CFG 3 VAB- UPGRADE TO BASE 308E2 WITH VARIABLE ADJUSTABLE BOOM 2 

$1,412.001 $10,156.002

DISCOUNT 1 
24%
DISCOUNT 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
24% DISCOUNT OFF OF 308E2 & 307E2; 18% DISCOUNT OFF OF 311F L RR, 313F, & 313F GC.
DISCOUNT APPLIES TO ALL OEM NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS. 16% DISCOUNT OFF OF ALL
CAT WORK TOOLS. 1 
24% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT MODELS 304-310 MINI HYDRAULIC EXCAVATORS.
16% DISCOUNT ON ALL WORK TOOLS. 2 

1 2

Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 

3YR/3000HR
PM PKG 2 

Maintenance Plan – specify 
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OR 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS.
PKG INCLUDES 6 TOTAL PM'S. 2 

$7,409.002

5YR/5000HR
PM PKG 2 

Maintenance Plan – specify 
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 5 YRS OR 5000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS.
PKG INCLUDES 10 TOTAL PM'S. 2 

$11,454.002

Warranty - specify 
3 YEAR / 3,000 HOUR PREMIER. PREMIER WARRANTY AVAILABLE FOR ALL UPGRADED AND
DOWNGRADED MACHINES. 1 

$2,116.001 

Warranty - specify 
3 YEAR / 3,000 HOUR POWERTRAIN. POWERTRAIN WARRANTY AVAILABLE FOR ALL
UPGRADED AND DOWNGRADED MACHINES.  1 

$1,008.001 

VEHICLE: 308E2 
DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $98,926.00 $91,909.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 15,590 LB OPERATING WEIGHT
SPECIFICATION #42

2019 Caterpillar 308E2 

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Caterpillar 308E2 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan – specify 
Maintenance Plan – specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: 308E2 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




