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Name of Dealership

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Type of Vehicle

2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112

2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX

2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

Zone

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00

$103,500.00
- NB --
$102,500.00
--NB --
$102,250.00
$102,500.00
$100,600.00
- NB --

$92,650.00
--NB --
$91,650.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$89,363.00
--NB --

$102,997.00
—-NB --
$102,725.00


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 15.pdf

Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Palm Truck Center

Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series

2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD

2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567

2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
$104,900.00
--NB --
$102,200.00
- NB --

$108,182.00
- NB --
$108,182.00
—-NB --
$108,182.00
--NB --
$108,182.00
- NB --

$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --

$105,204.00
- NB --
$105,204.00
—-NB --
$105,204.00
--NB --
$104,651.00
- NB --

$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00



Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group

2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00

--NB --
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Peterbilt 567

The Peterbilt 567 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00 $104,651.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code
365 !

348 !

Order Code

2057560 !
2057544 2

2074506 !
20557745 2

2057746 !
2059972 2

2059981 !
2072822 2

2072823 !
2057732 2

4052110/40552230 |

4040810 2

4040810 !
4024250 2

Southern
$104,651.00

Western
& Northern
& Central

Southern

567
Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center
Western Northern Central
$105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00
Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify
Peterbilt Model 365 1

Engine/transmission - specify
Peterbilt Model 348 |

Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify

Add Options
Engine upgrade - specify

CUMMINS XI12N CNG 350 HP 1450 LB2 TORQUE X12N 400HP ADD $1,216.00 other available
engine options list -10% see dealer, all components and options are subject to manufacturer

availability. 1
ISX-12 350 HP 2

Engine upgrade - specify

Cummins LIN CNG 320/2200 1000@1300 Model 348/ 567, 365 other available engine options list

-10% see dealer 1
ISX-12 425 HP 2

Engine upgrade - specify
CUMMINS X-12 350 HP 1450 TORQUE other available engine options 1
ISX-15 500 HP 2

Engine upgrade - specify
X15 565@2000 1850@1200 other available engine options list -10% see dealer 1
MX-13 455 HP 2

Engine upgrade - specify
MX-13 485HP 1650@1000 torque |

ISX12-G 400 HP CNG 2

Transmission upgrade - specify
Allison 3500 / 3000 RDSP include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 1

RTO16908LL 2

Transmission upgrade - specify
RTO 16908LL 1

EATON FO17E309-VCS 2

($450.00)"
($18,060.00)"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

Western
& Northern
& Central

$25,640.00"

$12,353.00"

$2.,340.00"

$8,142.00"

$985.00"

$10,671.00"

$1,357.00"

NA
NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

Southern
$2,101.00°

$4,267.00°

$6,173.00°

$500.00>

$29,841.00°

$1,519.00°

$11,180.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

4052420 !

4024080 !

0514020 !

4543430 !
RUSH '
RUSH '

20758409 !

Momentum !

5554100 !

4052410 '
4052420 !

0601500 !

1011350 !

Southern

567

Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center
Western Northern Central

$105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00

Transmission upgrade - specify
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
FO16E308LL-VCS 10 Speed UltraShifi PLUS 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Other Transmission options available -10% off list see dealer 1

58,000 Ib. GVWR package

see Dealer 1
SEE DEALER FOR DEATAL SPEC AND PRICE 2

64,000 1b. GVWR package
10-3/4in Steel Rails 1

22(), 000 LB FRONT 46,000 REAR 425/65R22.2 FRONT TIRES SEE DEALER FOR DEATAL SPEC

GVWR upgrade - specify
Clear Outside Frame Rail Pkg. 1

GVWR upgrade - specify
40T Pintle pkg (including 1"plate,pintle and D-ringa) *Air liiU!.f and electric supplied by dealer 1

GVWR upgrade - specify

Wetline kit PTOfor manual transmisaion 1

GVWR upgrade - specify
PX9 350HP 1150Tourque

GVWR upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify
CNG prep - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Momentum Fuel Technologies 90 DGE Rail Mounted Tanks 80 DGE System Deduct -$1,042.00 60
DGE System Deduct -35,174.00, roof mount and behind the cab mount available see dealer for
specs and pricing.

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
see dealer 1

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent
26" Aluminum 70 gal. 1

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or
approved equivalent

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or
approved equivalent

Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Front Axle: 14,600 b rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Front Axle: 16,000 1b rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

$104,651.00

$21,745.00"
$9.514.00"
$0.00"

$0.00"

$425.00"

$473.00"
$1,918.00"
$11,400.00"
$3,953.00"

NA
Std

Incl.
$38,233.00"

$0.00"
$308.00"

NA
$21,745.00"

$23,047.00"

$1,270.00"
NA
$686.00"
NA

NA

NA
NA
NA

$0.00>

$7.450.00°

NA
NA
NA
NA

NA
Std
Std
NA

NA
$398.00

NA
$24,161.00

$25,608.00

Incl.
NA
$774.00
NA

NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

1011360 !

1526120 !
1604180 !

1603145 !
1604150 !
1603470 !

1821810 !
1827440 !

1821640 !
TBEI !

TBEI '

TBEI !

7852020 !
1687090 !

Ring Power !

Ring Power !

Ring Power !

$3,041.00

$5,673.00
$11,634.00

$12,982.00
$14,882.00
$16,200.00

Std
$4,342.00

$3,867.00
$0.00>

$0.00°

$42,073.00°

Std
$1,824.00°

567
Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center
Western Northern Central Southern
$105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00 $104,651.00
Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and $2,659.001
springs
Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent $1,894.OO1
Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 1b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires $1 1,965.001
with steel wheels
Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 $1 1,888.001
tires with steel wheels
Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires 21313,028.001
with steel wheels
Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 $14,602.001
tires with steel wheels
Rear Suspension: 40,000 1b air ride $993.00!
Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or 393,908.001
equivalent
Rear Suspension: 46,000 Ib air ride $1,535.001
12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. :1516,662.001
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR PRICE AND SPEC 2
18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid. $17,05 1.00"!
AVABLE SEE DEALER FOR PRICE AND SPEC 2
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. $40,200.001
Galbreath U5-OR-174 Cable hoist w/tarp (including hot shift PTO for auto transmission, 48"
toolbox, steel fenders, Pioneer RP4500ARG tarp system) 180-188" CT required 1
GALBREATH 60,000 LB OUTSIDE RAIL WITH TARP SYSTEM SEE DEALER FOR SPEC 2
Cab suspension - air ride $207.00"
Driver controlled differential lock $1,642.001
DIFF LOCKS ON TAMDEM 2
Optional mounted body - specify 51564,213.001

Palfinger T-50 Hook Lift System (Includes Tarp) 66,000 GVWR, 185" - 195" CT 20,000 Front,
46,000 Rear Twin Stick in Cab Electric over Hydraulic Controls, Pioneer RP4500 SARG Tarp
System, 18" x 18’ x36" Steel Tool Box, LED Light Kit 1

AMERICAN OUTSIDE RAOL ROLL/OFF HOIST 60,000LB WITH TARP SYSTEM SEE DEALER
FOR DETAL SPECS 2

Optional mounted body - specify $165 ,695.001
Palfinger Q150284 + ART60-22 (Combo Unit) 66,000 GVWR 20,000 Front, 46,000 Rear Top Seat

Control with two joysticks, two foot pedals, Oil Cooler, 22'x 84" x 84" MPHD Beau Roc Body (44

cu. yd. capacity), Dump Hoist, Epsilon rotator RB10F, 42" Bakker refuse grapple, 18" x 18" x 36"

Underbody Tool Box, 4 Corner Corner Strobe Lights. Above Rail ART60/ CNG Compatible,

Pioneer SARG Tarp System 1

GAR-P DUMP BODY MODEL GAR-16 16' SEE DEALER FOR DETAL SPECS 2
Optional mounted body - specify $174,3 50.00"
Palfinger S260L 130 Canal Maintenance Crane Package 210 CT/66,000 GVWR 20,000 Front,

46,000 Rear Center mounted top seat, Controls with two joysticks, two foot pedals, Oil Cooler, 22'

x 84" x 84" MPHD Beau Roc Body (44 cu. yd. capacity), Dump Hoist, Kinshofer PZR 601 GF

hydraulic rotator, Kinshofer HPX HD Drive Grapple Head with perforated grapple jaws, 18" x

18" x 36" Underbody Tool Box, 4 Corner Corner Strobe Lig/'tts.1

LOADMASTER EXCEL S-25 25 YD REAR LOADER SEE DEALER FOR DETAL SPECS 2

$47,727.00°

$16,382.00°

$62,535.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Ring Power !

Ring Power !

SSES - REL !

WEP- Roll-Offs !

WEP - RELs '

Wastebuilt - REL !

Wastebuilt - ROL !

Container Systems -
RELs '

RDK - REL

Petersen Ind.
Grapple !

Pac-Mac !

567

Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center
Western Northern Central

$105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00

Optional mounted body - specify

Palfinger A-line Loader M134 Effective 207.4 CA/94" AF, 66,000 GVWR 20,000 Front, 46,000
Rear Right Side Operators Station with two joysticks, Oil Cooler, 22' x 84" x 84" MPHD Beau Roc
Body (44 cu. yd. capacity), Dump Hoist, Epsilon rotator RB10F, 42" Bakker refuse grapple, 18" x
18" x 36" Underbody Tool Box, 4 Corner Corner Strobe Lights1

J&J ALUNINUM DUMP BODY 16' SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC AND PRICE 2

Optional mounted body - specify

ARO ART60-22 Cable Roll Off $62,799.00 176" CA (186" CA for Tarp) 60,000 Capacity, 22 fi.
Hoist, Outiside Rail Capability, Dual Automatic front and left container stops and locks, Manual
nylon strap winch rear continer hol downs, body props, Inside Air Controls, LED Light Kit,
Pioneer Rack and Pinion RP4500 SARG Autotarper, 18" x 18" x 36" Tool Box 1

J&J STEEL DUMP BODY 16' SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC AND PRICE 2

Optional mounted body - specify
New Way King Cobra 25RL Rear Loader Refuse Body, New Way Cobra Magnum 25RL Rear
Loader Refuse Body Deduct -$3,343.00 1

PAC MAC KNUCKLE BOOM CRANE MODEL KBF 2224 SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC
AND PRICE 2

Optional mounted body - specify

Galbreath AF-OR-174 60K Hoist W/PIONEER STRONG-ARM RACK N' PINION SARG.
Galbreath U5-OR-174 60K Hoist Deduct -32,911.00 see dealer for other Galbreath products and
options. AMREP 60K Roll Off $44,727 1

AMPLR%OLL HOOK LIFT MODEL AMP-160-232-22 50,000LB CAP SEE DEALER FOT DETAL
SPEC

Optional mounted body - specify
E-Z Pack G4100—25 REL, E-Z Pack G300C-25 REL Deduct -37,000.00 CNG Option Add
$49,445.00

SUPER VAC RECYLING NWATER SYSTEM SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC 2

Optional mounted body - specify
32yd LEACH 2 R-III, 29yd LEACH 2 R-IlI DEDUCT -$1,306.00, 25yd body Deduct -$3,113.00 1

LEACH 2RIl 25YD REAR LOADER SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC 2

Optional mounted body - specify
GALFAB, 60K OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL-OFF HST Above Frame, DEDUCT -$1,840.00 FOR
GALFAB, 75K OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL-OFF, HOIST 60k Galfab O/R Deduct -$2,702.00 1

OX DUMP BODY 16' SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2

Optional equipment - specify
Loadmaster Excel S-25 REL 33yd Body Add +8$2,000.00 27yd Body Add +$1,660.00 / Pac-Mac
RLX25 Add +$4,026.00 1

GAR-P DUMP BODY MODEL GAR-P-16' SEE DEALER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2

Optional equipment - specify
25 YARD HIGH COMPACTION REAR LOADER |

GALFAB OUTSIDE RAIL ROLL/OFF HOIST MODEL OR60174S072 60,000 LB CAP SEE
DEALEER FOR DETAIL SPECS 2

Optional equipment - specify
MODEL ALI BASE LOADER MODEL 2236-MHX HARDOX BODY 1

Optional equipment - specify
Pac-Mac KB222A4-CN- MJ 2440 Body 1

Optional equipment - specify
McNeilus Concrete Mixers, Ledwell, GAR-P, Heil, Neway, Palfinger, Petersen Ind., Galbreath,
American, and others see dealer for pricing and specs.

Southern
$104,651.00
$113,659.00" $0.002
$62,799.00" $0.00°
$68,577.00" $0.00>

$52,631.00"  $45,497.00°

$83,410.00"  $258,927.00°

$66,162.00"  $61,176.00°

$49,617.00"  $18,751.00°

$61,070.00" = $16,382.00°

$63,176.00"  $45,492.00°

$97,574.00" NA
$84,154.00" NA
$0.00" NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

McNeilus !

Heil !

TES

9402783 !

9402659 !
9401704 |

9402705 !

567

Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center
Western Northern Central

$105,204.00 $105,204.00 $105,204.00

Optional equipment - specify
McNeilus Model 3216: 3.5HD 32 yd Rear Loader, 2516 25 yd Deduct -$1,317.00 75DGE CNG
MOUNTED BEHIND CAB ADD $35,000.00 1

Optional equipment - specify
Dura-Pack 5000 25yd Rear Loader. 60/40 Split Body Option ADD $ 93,119.00 1

Optional equipment - specify
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus FSA Fees. 1

Optional equipment - specify
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models bid. Discount
applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to Spec #15 only. 1

Optional equipment - specify
BRIDGEPORT 25YD RENEGADE REAR LOADER 1

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Mobile options available see dealer for pricing 1

SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC AND PRICE 2

Maintenance Plan - specify
Scheduled programs available see dealer for pricing 1

Maintenance Plan - specify
Full maintenance plans available see dealer for pricing options. 1

Warranty - specify
Cummins LIN CNG Protection Plan 1 5yr./150K 1
SEE DEALER FOT DETAL SPEC AND PRICE 2

Warranty - specify
Cummins XI2N CNG Protection Plan 1 5yr./150K 1

Warranty - specify
Basic Vehicle 2/200k 1

Diesel Warranty - specify
Cummins ISX Protection Plan 1 5yr./200K 1

Southern

$104,651.00
$79,768.00" NA
$73,241.00" NA
Incl.! NA
Incl.1 NA
$58,330.00" NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
Incl. NA
Incl. NA
Incl. NA
$0.00" $0.00>
$0.00" NA
$0.00" NA
$2,500.00" $0.00°
$2.100.00" NA
$1,265.00" NA
$1,185.00" NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

9402534 !

9404001 !

Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Palm Truck Center

567
Western Northern
$105,204.00 $105,204.00

Diesel Warranty - specify
Paacar PX-9 Protection Plan 1 5yr./150 1

Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR MX Comprehensive Coverage 5/300 1

Central
$105,204.00

Southern

$104,651.00

$2,700.00" NA
$1,685.00" NA
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Peterbilt 567

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Peterbilt 567 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

567 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western

BASE PRICE: - No bid -

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify

Engine/transmission - specify

Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify

Add Options

Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify

58,000 Ib. GVWR package
64,000 1b. GVWR package
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify
CNG prep - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: 567 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 1b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify



VEHICLE:

567 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western
BASE PRICE: --No bid --

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --





