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Name of Dealership

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Type of Vehicle

2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112

2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX

2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

Zone

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00

$103,500.00
- NB --
$102,500.00
--NB --
$102,250.00
$102,500.00
$100,600.00
- NB --

$92,650.00
--NB --
$91,650.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$89,363.00
--NB --

$102,997.00
—-NB --
$102,725.00


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 15.pdf

Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Palm Truck Center

Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series

2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD

2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567

2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
$104,900.00
--NB --
$102,200.00
- NB --

$108,182.00
- NB --
$108,182.00
—-NB --
$108,182.00
--NB --
$108,182.00
- NB --

$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --

$105,204.00
- NB --
$105,204.00
—-NB --
$105,204.00
--NB --
$104,651.00
- NB --

$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00



Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group

2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00

--NB --
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Mack MHD

The Mack MHD purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

Order Code

1364540 !
1364511 !
1362131 !

1362158 !

14F44R !

20F44R !

20F46R '

MHD

Nextran Nextran

Western Northern

$96,955.00 $96,955.00
Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify

Add Options

Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify

Transmission ngrade - specify
Allison 4500 RDS

Transmission upgrade - specify
Allison 3000 RDS

Transmission upgrade - specify
Eaton Fuller 14908LL, Includes: Transmission Cooler (1390001 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
Eaton Fuller 169134, Includes: Transmission Cooler 1

Transmission upgrade - specify
58,000 Ib. GVWR package

Nextran
Central
$96,955.00

Nextran
Southern
$96,955.00

Includes Options: 14K Front Axle (2401507), 44K Rear Axle 1122.5 Tires (9001176), Upgraded Frame Rail (2741028) 1

64,000 1b. GVWR package

Includes Option: 20K Front Axle (2401501), 44K Rear Axle, (2681004), 425 Front Tires (9001364), Steel 12.25 Wheels
(5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211) Heavy Frame Rail (2741029) 1

GVWR upgrade - specify

66,000 Ib GVWR Package, Includes Options: 20K Front Axle (2401501) 46K Axle Suspension (1861035), 425 Front Tires

(9001364), Steel 12.25 Wheels (5312726), Upgraded Steering Box (2452211) Heavy Frame Rail (2741029) 1

GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify

All Zones
NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

All Zones
NA

NA
NA
NA
NA
$12,460.00"

$6,689.00"
$1,393.00'
$2.510.00"

NA
$3,510.00"

$4.092.00"

$5,815.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

2902A50 !

1364540 !
2710208 !

2401507 !

2401500 !
2401501 !
2381026 !

NEX 13
RDA !

NEX 13 SDA !

NEX 20
RDA !

NEX 20 SDA

1862420 !
1861508 !
NEX 12 SD !
NEX 18 SD !

NEX 60
174RP4500 |

2540401 !
NEX 18 ST !

NEX 20 RRL !
NEX 25 RRL '

NEX 32 RRL

MHD

Nextran Nextran Nextran Nextran
Western Northern Central Southern
$96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00

CNG prep - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 1b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.

Cab suspension - air ride
Driver controlled differential lock

Optional mounted body - specify
16FT. 18yd. Stampede Body 1

Optional mounted body - specify
20 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader |

Optional mounted body - specify
25 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader 1

Optional mounted body - specify
32 Cubic Yard Refuse Rear Loader 1

NA
NA

NA
$561.00"
NA

NA
$12,460.00"
$1,930.00"
NA
$764.00"
NA
$2,877.00"
$3,926.00"
$2,875.00"
$6,146.00"

$7,657.00"
$6,952.00"
$8,450.00"

NA
$3,044.00"
$1,734.00"

$15,770.00"

$19,500.00"
$36,270.00"

Std
$953.00"
$23,025.00"

$53,815.00"
$78,875.00"

$80,200.00"



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

66K GVW
Lube Fuel
TK !

6x6 Option !
NEX 60 KGF !

5,000 GL
Tanker !

6x6 Wetline |

MFG. List !

AT1 !

TL3 !

1919007 !

BV !

HLT '

25 Ton Pintle
Hook !

33K GVW
Lube Fuel
TK !

MHD

Nextran Nextran Nextran Nextran
Western Northern Central Southern
$96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00 $96,955.00

Optional mounted body - specify $ 120,880.001
66K GVW Lube Fuel Truck 1

Optional mounted body - specify $46,850.001
6x6 Option From Mod Center 1

Optional mounted body - specify $53,025.001
60,000 Ib Above Frame Roll-off Hoist and Tarp 1

Optional mounted body - specify $1 12,664.001
5,000 GL Tanker 1

Optional mounted body - specify 3318,500.001
6x6 Wet Kit and Catwalk Option with Skid Plates 1

. . 1
Optional mounted body - specify NA
We furnish refuse bodies from the following, Ox, GarP, Rogers, Bridgeport, E-Z Pack, Galbreath, Heil, Loadmaster,

McNeilus, New-Way, Pac-Mac, Palfinger, Wayne, Labrie, and others.

Optional equipment - specify $98,305.00"
Grapple Loader with Dump 2236 Dump Body 1

Optional equipment - specify $72,800.001
Grapple Loader with 1824 Dump Body 1

Optional equipment - specify $224.00"
Factor Prep PTO 1

Optional equipment - specify $843.00"
Body Vibrator 1

Optional equipment - specify $l,740.001
High Lift Tailgate 1

Optional equipment - specify $2,500.001
25 Ton Pintle Hook with Electric and Air Hook Up 1

Optional equipment - sPecify $92,475.001
33K GVW Lube Fuel Truck

Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA
Optional equipment - specify NA

Optional equipment - specify NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Transfer !

New !

2y1/250K !

MHD

Nextran Nextran
Western Northern
$96,955.00 $96,955.00

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify
2 year 250K Mile warranty 1

Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Nextran
Central
$96,955.00

Nextran
Southern
$96,955.00

NA
Incl.
$100.00"
$300.00"
NA

NA

NA

Std'

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Mack MHD

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Mack MHD purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

MHD (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western

BASE PRICE: - No bid -

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify

Engine/transmission - specify

Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify

Add Options

Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify

58,000 Ib. GVWR package
64,000 1b. GVWR package
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify
CNG prep - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: MHD (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Double Frame: full steel insert

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 1b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify



VEHICLE:

MHD (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western
BASE PRICE: --No bid --

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --





