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Name of Dealership

52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK (Specification #15)

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Type of Vehicle

2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112

2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX

2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

Zone

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern

* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western

Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00

$103,500.00
- NB --
$102,500.00
--NB --
$102,250.00
$102,500.00
$100,600.00
- NB --

$92,650.00
--NB --
$91,650.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$89,363.00
--NB --

$102,997.00
—-NB --
$102,725.00


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 15.pdf

Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Palm Truck Center

Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series

2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD

2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567

2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

—-NB --
$104,900.00
--NB --
$102,200.00
- NB --

$108,182.00
- NB --
$108,182.00
—-NB --
$108,182.00
--NB --
$108,182.00
- NB --

$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --

$105,204.00
- NB --
$105,204.00
—-NB --
$105,204.00
--NB --
$104,651.00
- NB --

$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00



Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group

2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00

--NB --
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52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 International HV

The International HV purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00 $89,363.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

HV6071 2
12EHU 3

HV6072 2
12EHV *

HV6073 2
12EHX

HV6074 2
12EHY 3

HV6071 !
29007D 2
29007

HV6072 !

HV6073 |
HV6074 !

29007D !

HV

Maudlin International
Trucks

Western
$92,650.00

Maudlin International
Trucks

Northern
$91,650.00

Sun State International
Trucks, LLC

Central
$91,620.00

Rechtien International

Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify

NAVISTAR HV607 MODEL 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 300 HP ENGINE , MANUAL

vy RANS]zlﬂSSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Cummins L9 300 HP / 860 fi/lb torque engine with manual transmission. Factory
option code 12EHU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Engine/transmission - specify

NAVISTAR HV607 MODEL 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 330 HP ENGINE , MANUAL
TRANS/zl/IISS]ON Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Cummins L9 330 HP / 1000 ft/Ib torque engine with manual transmission. Factory
option code 12EHV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Engine/transmission - specify

NAVISTAR HV607 MODEL 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 350 HP ENGINE , MANUAL

T RANSZZMISSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Cummins L9 350 HP / 1150 fi/Ib torque engine with manual transmission. Factory
option code 12EHW. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Engine/transmission - specify

NAVISTAR HV607 MODEL 6 X 4 CUMMINS L9 370 HP ENGINE , MANUAL

y RANS]zl/HSSION Reference Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Cummins L9 370 HP / 1250 ft/Ib torque engine with manual transmission. Factory
option code 12EHY. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Delete Option - Specify
HV607 vlvith Cummins L9 300HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from
MSRP.

SPAREZTIRE AND WHEEL Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Spare tire - 11R22.5 14-ply tire and wheel equal to standard. Contact dealer for
additional tire sizes. Tire and wheel assembly shipped loose and banded to chassis. No
mounting carrier included. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Delete Option - Specify
HV607 vlvith Cummins L9 330HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from
MSRP.

Delete Option - Specify
HV with Cummins L9 350HP engine Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Delete Option - Specify
HV with Cummins L9 370HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Delete Option - Specify

Delete spare tire and wheel. |

Western
& Northern

NA

NA

NA

NA

$8,895.00"

$8.125.00"

$4.490.00"
$3,790.00"

$450.00"

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00
Central Southern
$8,895.00>  $10,909.00°
$8,125.00°  $10,076.00°
$4,490.00°  $9,891.00°
$3,790.00°  $8,206.00°
$450.00° $400.00°
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA
NA NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code

12BDX !
12BDX 2
12BDX °

12BDZ !
12BDZ 2
12BDZ 3

12BEA !
12BEA
12BEA °

12BEB !
12BEB 2
12BEB 3

7SDK !
7SDK 2
7SDK 3

13AVR !
13AVR 2
13AVR 3

13GHP !
13GHP 2
13GHP 3

13GHS !
13GHS 2
13GHS *

HV

Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International Rechtien International

Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC Trucks, Inc.
Western Northern Central Southern
$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00 $89,363.00

Western
Add Options & Northern Central
Engine upgrade - specify NC! NC
A26 356HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

International A 26 365 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

International A26 365 HP 1250 ft/Ib torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.

Engine upgrade - specify $200.00" $200.00°
A26 390HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

International A 26 390 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

International A26 390 HP 1450 ft/lb torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.

2

Engine upgrade - specify $600.00" $600.00°
A26 410HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

International A 26 410 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

International A26 410 HP 1450 ft/Ib torque engine. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.

Engine upgrade - specify $800.00" $800.00°
A26 430HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

International A 26 430 HP engine Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

International A26 430 HP 1550 fi/lb torque engine. Requires factory code 13GHP. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Engine upgrade - specify $2,050.00' = $2,050.00

Engine compression brake. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
JAKE BRAKE Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Engine compression brake by Jacobs with selector switch and on/off switch. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Transmission upgrade - specify $8,400.00'  $8,450.00°

Allison 3000 series transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Allison 3000 RDS automatic transmission for use with A 26 365 HP engine
codel2BDD Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Allison 3000 RDS automatic transmission. For use with order codes HV607300,
HV607330, HV607350, HV607370, & HV613365. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.3

Transmission upgrade - specify $880.00" $880.00°

Fuller FIRO 15210-C 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from
MSRP.

Fuller 15210 C 10-speed manual transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Eaton Fuller FRO-15210C 10-speed manual with overdrive. A minimum discount of
6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Transmission upgrade - specify $1,250.00'  $1,250.00°
Fuller FiRO 16210-C 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from
MSRP.

Fuller 16210 C 10-speed manual transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Eaton Fuller FRO-16210C 10-speed manual with overdrive. A minimum discount of

Southern
NC

3

$211.00°

$597.00°

$1,846.00°

$2.033.00°

$7.999.00°

$1,352.00°

$1,714.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

13GWp !
13GWP 2
13GwWp *

13GHX !
13GHX 2
13GHX ?

58GVWR !
58GVW 2
58GVWR °

64GVWR
64GVW 2
64GVWR *

60GVWR !
60GVW >
60GVWR >

66GVWR !
66GVW >
66GVWR >

56GVWR !
56GVW 2
56GVWR >

HV

Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC

Western Northern Central

$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00

6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Transmission upgrade - specify
Eaton Fuller Ultra shift fully automated 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5%
minimum discount from MSRP.

{Eaton Fuller UltraShifi} 10-Speed Fully Automated Manual; with Aluminum Clutch
Housing, Overdrive, Electronic Shift Controls, Electric Clutch Actuation, Air Range
Shift, Internal Lube Oil Pump, Hill Start Aid 2

Eaton Fuller UltraShift+ FO-16E308LL-VCS 10-speed Fully automated manual with
overdrive, Electronic shift controls, and electric clutch actuation. A minimum discount
of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Transmission upgrade - specify

{Fuller RTO(F)-16908LL} 10-Speed Manual; Double Lo with Overdrive. Includes a
5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Fuller RTO 16908LL Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Fuller RTO(F)-16908LL - 10-Speed Manual; Double Lo with Overdrive, Internal
Lube Pump and with Air Shift. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied.3

58,000 1b. GVWR package
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

18,000 IEA WR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

18,000 Ibs. front axle, 40,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code 2ARZ. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

64,000 Ib. GVWR package

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
18,000 };A WR & 46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

18,000 Ibs. front axle, 46,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code 2ARZ & 14GRD. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

GVWR upgrade - specify

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
20,000 gA WR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

60,000 GVWR pkg. 20,000 Ibs. front axle, 40,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code
24RY. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

GVWR upgrade - specify
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

20,000 FZA WR & 46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

66,000 GVWR pkg. 20,000 Ibs. front axle, 46,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code
24RY & 14GRD. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

GVWR upgrade - specify

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
16,000 FAQWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSR

56,000 GVWR pkg. 16,000 Ibs. front axle, 40,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code
2ARU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

$13,800.00"

$4,525.00"

$6,900.00"

$9,200.00"

1

$7,500.00

$9.500.00"

$5.800.00"

Rechtien International

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00

$13,800.00°

$4.540.00°

$6,900.00°

$9,200.00>

$7,500.00°

$9.500.007

$5.800.00>

$13,725.00°

$4.507.00°

$5.682.00°

$10,943.00°

$6,045.00°

$11,306.00°

$4.586.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

54GVWR !
54GVW 2
54GVWR >

Saftey !
SAFETY 2
SAFETY *

15DY7J !
15DY]J 2
15DYJ 3

13ATR !
13ATR 2
13ATR 3

13AUW !
13AUW 2
13AUW 3

1GBP !
01GBP 2
1GBP *

2ARV !
2ARV 2
2ARV 3

HV
Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC
Western Northern Central
$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00
GVWR upgrade - specify $3,OOO.001

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

14,000 FAQWR & 40,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSR

54,000 GVWR pkg. 14,000 Ibs. front axle, 40,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes order code
24RV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

GVWR upgrade - specify
Safety kit. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

SAFETY KIT 2
Safety kit - Fire extinguisher & triangle reflectors. Dealer installed. 3

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG prep - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)
Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Dual 70 gallon fuel tanks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Dual 7% gallon fuel tanks Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Dual fuel tanks - 70 gal. each; Total Capacity 140 US Gal. (530L), left & right side
mounted, back of cab. CA restricted - contact dealer for availability. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES

295 or approved equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Allison 4000 RDS automatic transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Allison 4000RDS automatic transmission. Includes factory option codes 13WAW,
13WBL, 13WLM, 13WUC, & 13WYU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES

295 or approved equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Allison 4500 RDS automatic transmission Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Allison 4500RDS automatic transmission. Includes factory option codes 13WAW,
I13WBL, 13WLM, 13WUC, & 13WYU. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3

Double Frame: full steel insert
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Double frame Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Full double frame. Includes factory option code 1GBP. A discount of a minimum of
6.5% of the manufacturers list prices is applied. 3

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

14,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

14,000 Ibs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADD and 12R22.5 tires. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

$150.00"

NA
NA
NA
NA
$750.00"

NA
$14,500.00"

$15,800.00"

$1,500.00"

$895.00"

Rechtien International

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00

$3,000.00°

$160.007

NA
NA
NA
NA
$695.00°

NA

$14,500.00°

$15,800.00°

$1,580.00>

$895.00°

$1,939.00°

$150.00°

NA
NA
NA
NA
$857.00°

NA
$14,569.00°

$15,641.00°

$1,601.00°

$1,939.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

2AUR !
2AUR 2
2ARU 3

2ARZ
2ARZ
2ARZ

2ARY !
2ARY 2
2ARY 3

14GRR !
14HRB >
14GRD *

14WLN !
14WLN 2

14WNH !
14WNH 2
14WNH °

14WLM !
14WLM >
14WLM 3

HV

Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC

Western Northern Central

$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00

Front Axle: 14,600 b rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

16,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

16,000 Ibs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADD and 315/80R22.5 tires. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

18,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

18,000 Ibs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADG, SPTB and 385/65R22.5
tires. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

20,000 FAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

20,000 lbs. front axle. Includes factory option codes 3ADG, SPTB and 425/65R22.5
tires. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Rear Axle: 46,000 Ib Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
46,000 RAWR Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

46,000 Ibs. rear axle. Includes factory order codes 14UHK, 14WAL, & 14WMK. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include

11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Rzigid 13,200 Ibs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include

11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

SteeRRaZble 13,200 Ibs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Rigid 20,000 Ibs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2

Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3

NA

$5,200.00"

$5,850.00"

$4.300.00"

$4.400.00"

$7.500.00"

$9,500.00"

$9.500.00"

Rechtien International
Trucks, Inc.

Southern
$89,363.00

NA NA

$5,250.00°  $4,586.00°

$5.895.00°  $5,682.00°

$4,325.00°  $6,045.00°

$4,450.00°  $5,261.00°

$7,500.00° NA

$9,500.00>  $9,318.00°

$9,500.00°  $9,112.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

14WNM !
14WNM 2
14WNM 3

14UNU !
14UNU 2
14ULU 3

14ULY !
14ULY 2
14ULY *

14UNX !
14UNX 2
14UNX *

0X12YD !
GODWIN400 >
12DMP *

0X18YD
GODWIN500 2
18SDMP *

ROLLOFF !
ROLLOFF 2
ROLLOFF *

HV

Maudlin International Maudlin International

Trucks Trucks Trucks, LL

Western Northern Central

$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00
Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include

11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Sleerablze 20,000 Ibs. pusher Includes a 4% minimum discount from Manufacturers
MSRP

Cab to Axle restricted - contact dealer. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

40,000 air ride rear suspension Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2

Hendrickson HAS 420-55 air ride. Includes factory option code 14899. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo

"T" ride or equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

46000 SIMX rear suspension Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP

Hendrickson HMX-460-54 Walking beam type suspension. Includes factory option
codes I14WAL, 14WBYV. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

45500() Primax air ride Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP

Hendrickson PRIMAX EX 55" air ride. Includes factory option code 14899. A
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model
bid.

Ox Maverick. 1

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid 2

Steel body with electric tarp system. Gar-P or equal. Recommend order code
S4GVWR - 54,000 Ibs. GVWR minimum. 3

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model
bid.

Ox Maverick 1

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid 2

Steel body with electric tarp system. Gar-P or equal. Recommend order code
64GVWR - 64,000 Ibs. GVWR minimum. 3

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.

Gal Fab 1

Roll off hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. Galfab Standard Equipment
included Steel Fenders, In cab and outside controls, 16"X 24"X 48" toolbox,light
bar,50 gallon hyd tank Hotshift PTO for automatic Pioneer RP4500SA RG tarp
system

60K outside rail with tarp. Requires automatic transmission order codes 13AVR,
13ATR, or 13AUW. Recommend 58GVWR - 58,000 [bs. GVWR minimum. 3

Cab suspension - air ride

Sun State International

C

$12,950.00"

$2.200.00"

$3,900.00"

$5,740.00"

$18,200.00"

$19,500.00"

$4,400.00"

Std

Rechtien International

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00

$12,950.00°

$2.200.007

$3,895.00%

$5.750.00>

$18,400.00°

$19,500.00°

$44,000.00°

Std

$11,384.00°

$2.374.00°

$3,011.00°

$3,998.00°

$19,422.00°

$20,284.00°

$43,783.00°

Std



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

14GVM !
14GVM 2
14GVN 3

vac!

\Z/ACCHASSIS

VAC?

NW25RL !
25YDRRLD 2
NW25RL >

NWSsW31 !
31YDASL >
NWsw31 3

4000D !
WATER
TANK 2
4000WTR *

Lelys :
LEYSST 2
LELYSV *

Lelya !
LEYAST 2
LELYAV >

Unpublished '
ALUM

DUMP 2
LELYSVHST >

HV
Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC
Western Northern Central
$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00
Driver controlled differential lock $1,420.001

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

For use with 40,000 Ibs. rear axle. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. 3

Optional mounted body - specify $5,500.00"
VAC CHASSIS PREP. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

SEWER VAC CHASSIS SPEC 2
VAC Chassis Prep. 3

Optional mounted body - specify $70,950.001
New Way 25yd King Cobra rear loader garbage body. 1

25yd. Loadmaster Excel Automated Rear Loader HIGH COMPACTION Body 2

New Way King Cobra 25RL or equal 25 cubic yard rear load refuse body. Requires

order code 64GVWR minimum and 13AVR, 13ATR, or 13AUW automatic

transmission.

Optional mounted body - specify $121,000.OO1
New Way Sidewinder 31YD side loader. 1

31yd. Loadmaster Eclipse Automated Side Loader Body w/1200 Ib. Lift, 12' Reach 2
New Way Sidewinder 31 YD side loader 3

Optional mounted body - s]pecify $39,995.00"

4000 Gallon steel water tanker.
4100 Gallon DOLPHIN WATER TANK 650 §pm Pump, 50'x 3/4" Hose w/ Reel, 4-Air
Power Spray Heads w/ In-Cab Control Box

Lely or equal - 4000 gallon steel water tank with hydrant fill and PTO driven pumping
system, spray bars, hose reel. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR
minimum. Recommend automatic transmission.

Optional mounted body - specify $66,995.001

4200 gallon steel sewer sucker
LEY STEEL 4200 GALLON 2

Lely or equal - 4000 gallon steel single compartment septic tank with PTO driven
vacuum pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum.
Recommend automatic transmission.

Optional mounted body - specif]y $75,000.001

4200 Gallon aluminum sewer sucker.
LEY ALUMIMUM 4200 GALLON 2
Lely or equal - 4000 gallon aluminum single compartment septic tank with PTO

driven vacuum pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR
minimum. Recommend automatic transmission.

Optional mounted body - specify Nc!
All non listed/unpublished options will be offered at a discount from MSRP. Applies to
all specifications.

ALUMINMUM DUMP BODY 2
Lely or equal - 4000 gallon steel single compartment septic tank with PTO driven

vacuum pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR minimum.
Recommend automatic transmission.

Rechtien International
Trucks, Inc.

Southern
$89,363.00

$1,300.00° | $1,418.00°

$5,500.00°  $5,350.00°

$70,600.00°>  $72,577.00°

$126,500.00° | $122.551.00°

$39,995.00%  $35,750.00°>
$66,995.00°  $77,849.00°
$75,000.00°  $89,424.00°

11334,000.002 $101,356.003



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

ALdump !
IZABIRCATOR

LELYAVHST >

Viberate !
UNPUB 2
SWPZ 3

16SNP

14HRE '
14HRE 2
7BKS *

5708 !
5708 2
14HRE *

5710 !
5710 2
5708 3

16sDC !
16SDC 2
57103

16WIU !
16WJU 2
16SDC 3

Silver I
10WJH 2
16WJU *

HV
Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC
Western Northern Central
$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00
Optional mounted body - specify $34,000.001
Aluminum dump body. 1
DUMP FABICATORE 2
Lely or equal - 4000 gallon aluminum single compartment septic tank with PTO
driven vacuum pumping system. Requires order code 64GVWR - 64,000 GVWR
minimum. Recommend automatic transmission.
Optional mounted body - specify $995.00"
Dump body vibrator. 1
Optional body - specify All non-listed/unpublished equié)ment/options will be offered
at a discount from MSRP. Applies to all specifications
Test Exterior Lights, Pre-Trip exterior light inspection. A minimum discount of 6.5%
of manufacturers list price is applied.
Optional mounted body - specify NA
(2) Mirrors - Power Adjust, Thermostatically Controlled Heated Heads, Black Heads.
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.
Optional equipment - specify $1,840.001
46,000 driver controlled diff locks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
46,000 RAWR driver controlled diff lock Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2
Horizontal after-treatment device with vertical exhaust tailpipe. A minimum discount
of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3
. . . 1
Optional equipment - specify $110.00
Tilt steering wheel. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Tilt steering column Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Driver controlled differential lock for use with 46,000 Ibs. rear axle. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3
. . . 1
Optional equipment - specify $425.00
Tilt and telescoping steering wheel. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Tilt & Telescopic Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Tilt steering column. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3
Optional equipment - specify $225.00"
Exterior grab handles. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Exterior grab handles Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Tilt & telescopic steering column. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. 3
Optional equipment - specify $350.001
Power windows and door locks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Power windows & door locks Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2
Exterior grab handle(s) for use with standard cab. Use order code 16SDD for 4 door
cab-Price $445.00. Unit(s) spec'd out with vertical exhaust, only (1) grab handle will
be provided on driver side. Please use order code 16SJA and add $111.00. 4
minimum discount of 6.5% of manufactures list price is applied. 3
. . . 1
Optional equipment - specify $160.00

Silver package. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Silver package Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Power windows & door locks for use with standard cab & extended cab. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Rechtien International
Trucks, Inc.

Southern
$89,363.00

$995.00> $113,856.00°

NAZ $40.00°

NA $303.00°

$1,840.00°  $1,140.00°

$110.00>  $1,184.00°

$420.00° $118.00°

$250.00° $436.00°

$350.007 $222.00°

$175.00% $346.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

16RPV !
16RPV 2
SILVER *

sMIU |
SMIJU 2
16PPN *

LEDPKG
LEDPKG >
SMJU °

15SGR !
15SJR 2
LEDPKG °

15LKX !
15LKX 2
15SIR *

60AAA !
60AAA >
15LKY 3

SWRB
SWRB
29007 3

STRlights !
STORBE
LIGHTS 2
60AAA >

4 CORNER STOBE LIGHT DEALER INSTALLED 2

Remote Power Module for body builder interface. 6 inputs & 6 outputs with switches
on dash. Includes factory option codes 60ABE & 60ABM. A minimum discount of
6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied. 3

HV
Maudlin International Maudlin International Sun State International Rechtien International
Trucks Trucks Trucks, LLC Trucks, Inc.
Western Northern Central Southern
$92,650.00 $91,650.00 $91,620.00 $89,363.00
Optional equipment - specify $180.00" $180.00° NC?
Air ride passengers seat. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
A 2ir ride passenger seat Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP
Silver Package. A discount of a minimum of 6.5% of the manufacturers list prices is
applied. 3
Optional equipment - specify $175.00" $170.00° $587.00°
3 2850 CCA batteries. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
(Fleetrite} Batteries Maintenance-Free, (3) 12-Volt 2850CCA Total cludes a 4%
minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Air ride passenger seat. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3
. . . 1 2
Optional equipment - specify $525.00 $570.00 $169.00°
LED light package does not include head lights. Includes a 5% minimum discount
firom MSRP.1
LED lighting pkg Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Three (3) batteries, 12-Volt 2850CCA. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3
Optional equipment - specify $260.00" $250.00° $528.00°
100 GALLON FUEL TANK. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
or 15SJR - 100 gallon fuel tank Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2
LED lighting package for cab & chassis and mounted equipment. Includes factory
option codes 8TRS, SWPH, & 8XGT. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers
list price is applied. 3
. . . 1 2
Optional equipment - specify $400.00 $400.00 $285.00°
Davco fuel water separator. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Davco fuel water seperator Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP 2
Fuel tank, 100 gallon capacity non-polished aluminum. Optional 80 gallon capacity
non-polished aluminum fuel tank use order code 15SJZ - Price $140.00 3
Optional equipment - specify $600.00" $550.00° $397.00°
Remote power module. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
Remote power module Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2
Davco fuel water separator. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price
is applied. 3
Optional equipment - specify $35.00" $35.002 Incl.>
Headlights on with wipers, STD with day time running lights. Includes a 5% minimum
discount from MSRP. 1
Head li§hts on with wipers Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers
MSRP
Spare tire - 11R22.5 14-ply tire and wheel equal to standard. Contact dealer for
additional tire sizes. Tire and wheel assembly shipped loose and banded to chassis. No
mounting carrier included. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied. 3
. . . 1 2
Optional equipment - specify $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $711.00°
4 corner strobe lights dealer installed. Includes a 5% minimum discount from
MSRP. 1



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

27DMC !
27DMC 2
SWRB >

28DMC !
28DMC 2

16SMP !
16SNP 2

7BKS !
7BKS 2

Un Pub !
UNPUB 2

Temp !
TEMP >
TEMPTAG °

Transfer !
TRANSFER
TAG 2
TRANTAG *

NewTag !
NEW TAG °
NEWTAG *

40PJW !
40PTW 2
40PTW 3

HV

Maudlin International
Trucks

Western
$92,650.00

Optional equipment - specify

Aluminum front wheels. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Maudlin International
Trucks

Northern
$91,650.00

Sun State International
Trucks, LLC

Central
$91,620.00

$580.00"

Aluminum Front wheels 22" x 8.25" Check with Dealer for Upcharge for 9" & 12.25"
Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Headlights on with wipers automatically. A minimum discount of 6.5% of

manufacturers list price is applied.

Optional equipment - specify

Aluminum rear wheels. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

Aluminum Rear Wheels Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers

MSRP?2

Optional equipment - specify

Heated and power mirrors. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

$2,300.00"

$300.00"

HEATED MIRRORS Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Optional equipment - specify

Vertical Exhaust. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1
VERTICAL EXHAUST SYSTEM Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers

MSRP 2

Optional equipment - specify

All unpublished options includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 1

$2,950.00"

NC

All non-listed/unpublished equipment/options will be offered at a discount from MSRP.

Applies to all specifications 2

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag
TEMP 2

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

TRANSFER TAG 2

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

NEW TAG 2

Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

NA
$15.00"

$200.00"

$300.00"

NA
NA
NA
$2,200.00'

24 months 100,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes

a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

NAVISTAR 24 MONTH 100K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from

manufacturers MSRP 2

Extended Vehicle Coverage To 24-Month/100,000 Miles, Excludes Extended
Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Rechtien International

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00

$580.00°

$2,300.00>

$300.00°

$2,950.00>

NC

NA
$50.00>

$235.002

$295.00°

NA
NA
NA
$2,200.00°

$21.00°

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA
$10.00°

$95.00°

$250.00°

NA
NA
NA
$1,920.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

40py7 !
40PJZ >
40PJZ >

40PKD !
40PKD
40PKD °

408SV !
40SSV 2
40STU

408Sz !
40887 >
40STY 3

40STG !
40STG >
40SYE >

HV

Maudlin International
Trucks

Western
$92,650.00

Warranty - specify
36 months 150,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes
a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

NAVISTAR 36 MONTH 150K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Extended Vehicle Coverage To 36-Month/150,000 Miles, Excludes Extended

Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.

Warranty - specify
48 months 200,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes
a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 1

NAVISTAR 48 MONTH 200K MILES EXTENEDED WARRANTY COVERAGE
EXCLUDES ENIGNE & TRANMISSION Includes a 4% minimum discount from
manufacturers MSRP 2

Extended Vehicle Coverage To 48-Month/200,000 Miles, Excludes Extended

Warranty for Engine and Transmission. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied. 3

Diesel Warranty - specify

A26 36 months 300,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from

MSRP. 1

Navistar} To 36-Month/300,000 Miles (480,000 km), 10,800 Hours; Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for Navistar A26
Engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Extended Coverage To 36-Month/300,000 Miles, 10,800 Hours, Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar A26 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing. 3

Diesel Warranty - specify

A26 48 months 400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from

MSRP. 1

Navistar} To 48-Month/400,000 Miles (480,000 km), 10,800 Hours; Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for Navistar A26
Engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP

Extended Coverage To 48-Month/400,000 Miles, 14,400 Hours, Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar A26 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing. 3

Diesel Warranty - specify

A26 60 months 400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from

MSRP. 1

Navistar} To 60-Month/400,000 Miles (480,000 km), 10,800 Hours, Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump and Fuel Injectors, for Navistar A26
Engines Includes a 4% minimum discount from manufacturers MSRP 2

Extended Coverage To 60-Month/400,000 Miles, 14,400 Hours, Includes Engine,
Engine Electronics, Turbocharger, Water Pump, Fuel Injectors, and after-treatment
system for Navistar A26 Engines. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. Contact dealer for Cummins L9 pricing. 3

Maudlin International

Sun State International
Trucks, LLC

$5.100.00"

$8,250.00"

$2,000.00"

$4.000.00"

$5.500.00"

Rechtien International

Trucks, Inc.
Southern
$89,363.00

$5,100.00°

$8,250.00>

$2,000.00>

$4,000.00°

$5.500.00°

$4,320.00°

$7,040.00°

$2,520.00°

$5,280.00°

$6.,640.00°



FAC

FLORIDA
COUNTIES
-
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

52,000 LB GYVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 International HV

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The International HV purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00 -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE: HV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00

Order Code Delete Options
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify

HV6071 Delete Option - Specify
HV607 with Cummins L9 300HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

HV6072 Delete Option - Specify
HV607 with Cummins L9 330HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

HV6073 2 Delete Option - Specify
HV with Cummins L9 350HP engine Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

HV6074 2 Delete Option - Specify
HV with Cummins L9 370HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

29007D 2 Delete Option - Specify

Delete spare tire and wheel.

Order Code Add Options
12BDX ? Engine upgrade - specify
A26 356HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

12BDZ ? Engine upgrade - specify
A26 390HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

12BEA 2 Engine upgrade - specify
A26 410HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

12BEB 2 Engine upgrade - specify
A26 430HP engine. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

7SDK 2 Engine upgrade - specify

Engine compression brake. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

13AVR 2 Transmission upgrade - specify

Allison 3000 series transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

13GHP 2 Transmission upgrade - specify
Fuller FRO 15210-C 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

13GHS 2 Transmission upgrade - specify
Fuller FRO 16210-C 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Southern
-- No bid -
Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral
NA
NA
NA
NA
$8.895.00°
$8,125.00°
$4.490.00>
$3,790.00°
$450.00°
Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral
NC?
$200.00°
$600.00°
$800.00°
$2,050.00°
$8.400.00>
$880.00°
$1,250.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

13GWP 2

13GHX 2

58GVWR 2
64GVWR 2
60GVWR 2
66GVWR 2
56GVWR 2
54GVWR 2

Saftey 2

15DYJ 2

13ATR 2

13AUW 2

1GBP 2

2ARV

2AUR

2ARZ

HV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Maudlin International Trucks
Western Northern Central
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00

Transmission upgrade - specify

Eaton Fuller Ultra shift fully automated 10 speed transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Transmission upgrade - specify

{Fuller RTO(F)-16908LL} 10-Speed Manual; Double Lo with Overdrive. Includes a 5% minimum discount from

MSRP. 2

58,000 1b. GVWR package
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

64,000 Ib. GVWR package
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

GVWR upgrade - specify
Safety kit. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Bi-fuel model - specify

CNG prep - specify

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent
Dual 70 gallon fuel tanks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved

equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved

equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Double Frame: full steel insert
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Front Axle: 14,600 b rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 b rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

$13,800.00°

$4.525.00°

$6,900.00°
$9,200.00°
$7,500.00°
$9,500.00°
$5,800.00°
$3,000.00°

$150.00°

NA
NA
NA
NA
$750.00°

NA
$14,500.00°

$15,800.00°

$1,500.00>
$895.00°

NA
$5.200.00>

$5.850.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

2ARY 2
2
14GRR

14WLN 2

14WNH >

14WLM 2

14WNM 2

14UNU 2
2
14ULY
14UNX 2
2
OX12YD
OX18YD 2

ROLLOFF 2

14GVM 2

VAC ?
NW25RL 2
NWSW31 2
4000D >

Lelys 2

HV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Maudlin International Trucks
Western Northern Central
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00

Front Axle: 20,000 lb. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP.

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel

wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with

steel wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel

wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with

steel wheels
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Rear Suspension: 40,000 1b air ride

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP.

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

12 yd. dum% body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
Ox Maverick.

18 yd. dumg body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
Ox Maverick

Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.
Gal Fab 2

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock
Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Optional mounted body - specify
VAC CHASSIS PREP. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Optional mounted body - specify
New Way 25yd King Cobra rear loader garbage body. 2

Optional mounted body - specify
New Way Sidewinder 31YD side loader. 2

Optional mounted body - szpecify
4000 Gallon steel water tanker.

Optional mounted body - specify

4200 gallon steel sewer sucker

Southern
-- No bid --

$4,300.00°
$4,400.00°

$7.500.00°

$9,500.00°

$9.500.00°

$12,950.00°

$2,200.00°
$3,900.00°
$5,740.00°
$18,200.00°
$19,500.00°
$4,400.00°

Std
$1,420.00°

$5,500.00°
$70,950.00°
$121,000.00°
$39,995.00°

$66,995.00°



VEHICLE: HV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00 -~ No bid --

Lelya 2 Optional mounted body - specifzy $75,000.002
4200 Gallon aluminum sewer sucker.

Unpublished 2 Optional mounted body - specify NC?
All non listed/unpublished options will be offered at a discount from MSRP. Applies to all specifications. 2

ALdump 2 Optional mounted body - specify $34,000.002
Aluminum dump body. 2

Viberate > Optional mounted body - specify $995.007
Dump body vibrator. 2
Optional mounted body - specify NA

14HRE 2 Optional equipment - specify $1,840.002
46,000 driver controlled diff locks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

5708 2 Optional equipment - specify $110.00°
Tilt steering wheel. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

5710 2 Optional equipment - specify $425.002
Tilt and telescoping steering wheel. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

16SDC 2 Optional equipment - specify $225.00°
Exterior grab handles. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

16WJU 2 Optional equipment - specify $350.007
Power windows and door locks. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Silver 2 Optional equipment - specify $1 60.00°
Silver package. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

16RPV 2 Optional equipment - specify $180.00°
Air ride passengers seat. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

8MJU 2 Optional equipment - specify $175.00°
3 2850 CCA batteries. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

LEDPKG > Optional equipment - specify $525.002
LED light package does not include head lights. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

15SGR 2 Optional equipment - specify $260.00°
100 GALLON FUEL TANK. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

15LKX 2 Optional equipment - specify $400.00>
Davco fuel water separator. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

G0AAA 2 Optional equipment - specify $600.002
Remote power module. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

SWRB ° Optional equipment - specify $35.00°
Headlights on with wipers, STD with day time running lights. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

STRlights 2 Optional equipment - specify $1,150.002
4 corner strobe lights dealer installed. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

27DMC 2 Optional equipment - specify $580.002
Aluminum front wheels. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

28DMC 2 Optional equipment - specify $2,300.OO2

Aluminum rear wheels. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

16SMP 2
7BKS 2

Un Pub 2

Temp 2
Transfer >
NewTag 2

40PTW 2

40PJZ 2
2

40PKD

40SSV 2
40887 2

40STG 2

HV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Maudlin International Trucks
Western Northern Central
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- $91,650.00

Optional equipment - specify

Heated and power mirrors. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Optional equipment - specify
Vertical Exhaust. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Optional equipment - specify
All unpublished options includes a minimum of 5% discount from MSRP. 2

Optional equipment - specify

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Maintenance Plan - specify

Warranty - specify

24 months 100,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount
from MSRP. 2

Warranty - specify
36 months 150,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount
from MSRP. 2

Warranty - specify
48 months 200,000 miles chassis warranty excludes engine and transmission. Includes a 5% minimum discount
from MSRP. 2

Diesel Warranty - specify
A26 36 months 300,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Diesel Warranty - specify
A26 48 months 400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Diesel Warranty - specify
A26 60 months 400,000 miles engine warranty. Includes a 5% minimum discount from MSRP. 2

Southern
-- No bid --

$300.00>

$2.950.00°

NC?
NA
$15.00°
$200.00°
$300.00°
NA

NA

NA
$2,200.00°

$5.100.00>

$8,250.00°

$2,000.00>
$4.000.00>

$5.500.00°





