
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

15,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4 (Specification #09)
 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Western $40,144.00

 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Western -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Northern $40,144.00

 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Northern -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Central $40,144.00

 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Central -- NB --

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Southern $40,144.00

 2019 Chevrolet Silverado 4500HD WT
(CK56403/C7R) Southern -- NB --

 
Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Western $36,568.00
ALT - Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Western $36,577.00
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Northern $36,544.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Northern $36,568.00
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Central $36,577.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Central $37,162.00
Coggin Auto (Ford) 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Southern $36,577.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-450 (F4H) Southern $37,162.00
 
 2019 International CV Western -- NB --
 2019 International CV Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International CV Northern $49,380.00
 2019 International CV Northern -- NB --
Sun State International Trucks, LLC 2019 International CV Central $49,377.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International CV Central $49,380.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 9.pdf


Rechtien International Trucks, Inc. 2019 International CV Southern $49,494.00
 2019 International CV Southern -- NB --
 
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Western $43,499.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Western $44,094.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Northern $43,499.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Northern $43,994.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Central $43,499.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Central $43,794.00
AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Southern $43,499.00
ALT - Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula 2019 Ram 4500 (DP9L63) Southern $43,794.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

15,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #9

2019 International CV
The International CV purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options WesternNorthern Central Southern
Gas engine in lieu of diesel engine NA NA NA 
Air conditioning NA NA NA 
AM/FM stereo radio NA NA NA 
Passenger air bag NA NA NA 
On-Star NA NA NA 
Satellite radio NA NA NA 
AFT tank for 18 gallon mid ship NA NA NA 
Limited slip differential on rear axles NA NA NA 

29007 4 Delete Option - Specify 
Spare tire - 11R22.5 14-ply tire and wheel equal to standard. Contact
dealer for additional tire sizes. Tire and wheel assembly shipped loose
and banded to chassis. No mounting carrier included. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

NA NA $400.004

Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 

 
Order Code Add Options WesternNorthern Central Southern

Engine upgrade - specify NA NA NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA NA NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA NA NA 
Gas engine, 8 cylinder NA NA NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA NA NA 
CNG prep - specify NA NA NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 

15DSZ 2 
15DSZ 3 
15DSZ 4 

Dual fuel tanks 
Total 65 gallons' Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp TOTAL OF 65 GALLONS  3 
40 gal mounted between frame rails and behind rear axle & standard
25 gal mid-ship tank. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied.  4 

$816.002 $816.003 $809.004

17500GVWR 4 17,500 lb. GVWR 
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

NA NA $2,826.004

Allison authorized snythetic oil, TES 295 or approved
equivalent (required for extended warranty) 

Std Std Std 

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



8GJB 2 
8GJB 3 
8GJB 4 

Alternator, extra HD 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
ALTERNATOR 220 AMP includes discount from msrp  3 
12-volt 220 amp. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied.  4 

$142.002 $142.003 $141.004

8GJC 2 
8GJC 3 

Dual alternators 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp  3 

$361.002 $361.003 NA 

12WGG 2 
12WGG 3 

Idle control 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp  3 

$408.002 $408.003 NA 

8HBW 2 
8HBW 3 
8HBW 4 

Electric brake controller 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp  3 
Factory installed. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied.  4 

$256.002 $256.003 $1,058.004

16VKK 4 Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) 
Diamond interior package. For crew cab, use code 16VKM - ADD:
$2440. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is
applied.  4 

NA NA $2,177.004

16WAK 2 
16WAK 3 

Power windows/door locks 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp  3 

$235.002 $235.003 Incl. 

Speed control/tilt steering wheel Std Std Std 
8RNS 2 
8RNM 3 

AM/FM radio with single CD 
CD player. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
AM/FM Stereo/Clock/Bluetooth 7" Color Display INCLUDES
DISCOUNT MSRP  3 

$100.002 $353.003 NA 

Sliding rear window NA NA NA 
40/20/40 seat in vinyl Std Std NA 

16KVR 2 
16KVR 3 

40/20/40 seat in cloth 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp  3 

$115.002 $115.003 NA 

Side air bags NA NA NA 
3K 1 
3K 2 
3K 3 
3K 4 

Third key 1 NA2 NA3 $18.004

Extended cab NA NA NA 
16196 2 
16196 3 
16196 4 

Crew cab model 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
Crew Cab / 4 Door 6 Person INCLUDED DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 
Includes 84" C/A minimum. Power windows & power locks. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$2,190.002 $2,190.003 $3,664.004

Cutaway cab NA NA NA 

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



Cab steps Std Std Std 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen
bulb, dealer installed 

NA NA NA 

Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear
halogen bulb, dealer installed 

NA NA NA 

Vent visors - stick-on style NA NA NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA NA NA 

9WAC 2 
9WAC 3 
9WAC 4 

Bug shield 
Bug Screen behind grill. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
Mounted Behind Grill included discount from MSRP  3 
Screen mounted behind grill. A minimum discount of 6.5% of
manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$125.002 $125.003 $124.004

Wrap-around grille guard NA NA NA 
SOBL 4 Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 

Commercial grade spray-on bed liner applied to cargo floor, sides,
compartment tops, bulkhead, tailgate & rear bumper. For crane body or
utility bodies up to 11 ft long. Call for pricing on different bodies. 4 

NA NA $1,720.004

G622 2 
G622 3 
7779448102 4 

All terrain tread tires on rear 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
INCLUDED DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$19.002 $19.003 $19.004

26DTX 2 
26DTX 3 

Full size spare tire & rim 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
INCLUDEDS DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 

$172.002 $172.003 Incl. 

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA NA NA 
Daytime running lights Std Std Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA NA NA 
Shift on the fly NA NA NA 

13AWY 2 
13AWY 3 
13AWY 4 

PTO provision, automatic 
Allison RDS. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
ALLISON RDS INCLUDES DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 
Allison 1700 RDS. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list
price is applied. 4 

$331.002 $331.003 $739.004

PTO transmission driven, manual (dealer installed) NA NA NA 
PTO transmission driven, automatic (dealer installed) NA NA NA 

EC4000 2 
EC4000  3 
EC4000 4 

4,000 lb. EH Auto Crane, or approved equivalent, with
crane reinforcements with manual outriggers 
Crane and Boom Support 3 
Stellar or equal. Crane & Boom Support "ONLY". Requires appropriate
body.  4 

$17,995.002 $18,125.003 $16,570.004

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



6108D54 2 
6108D54 3 
4KCRBDY 4 

Appropriate Auto Crane body with shelf package, 12"
bumper with crank outriggers, or approved equivalent 
9' Utility Body, Incl. Crane Reinforcement, shelving, bumper, crank
outriggers. 3 
Knapheide or equal crane body for cranes up to 4,000 lbs
capacity(16,000 ft lbs).  4 

$9,500.002 $9,899.003 $14,143.004

EC5000 2 
5005EH  3 
EC5000 4 

5,000 lb. EH Auto Crane, or approved equivalent, with
crane reinforcements with manual outriggers 
Crane and Boom Support ec5000 MODEL  3 
Stellar or equal. Crane & Boom Support "ONLY" Requires appropriate
body.  4 

$2,100.002 $22,245.003 $18,090.004

15LG 2 
G2-Tommygate  3 
EC5000 4 

1,500 lb. lift gate 
1600 LB 3 
Fold-up lift gate. Requires appropriate body. 4 

$3,995.002 $3,875.003 $3,925.004

Winch 2 
WARN 3 

12,000 lb. winch with remote 
Electric Winch 12,000 lb.  3 

$2,600.002 $2,600.003 NA 

3WAP 2 
13WAB  3 
3WAP 4 

Front stabilizer bars 
included discount from MSRP  3 
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$690.002 $690.003 $686.004

Tow package 2 
Class IV Hitch  3 
DTP 4 

Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers,
wiring for trailer plug (7 prong round), and class IV
frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square removable
receiver, 1" shank with 2" ball. May be dealer installed. 
For Service Body 3 
Include factory electric brake controller. Requires appropriate body.  4 

$995.002 $875.003 $870.004

2yard 2 
GODWIN184U-9  3 
3YD60 4 

2-3 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires
60" CA) 
9'Long, 2/3yd., 13" Fixed Sides, Electric Hoist, Manual Tarp  3 
Electric hoist.  4 

$11,000.002 $10,780.003 $11,995.004

3yard 2 
GODWIN184U-11 3 
3YD84 4 

2-3 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires
84" CA) 
11'Long, 2/3yd., 13" Fixed Sides, Electric Hoist, Manual Tarp 3 
Electric hoist.  4 

$11,500.002 $11,250.003 $12,495.004

PVMX12 2 
PTC1296SFB  3 
12SB 4 

12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires
84" CA) 

$6,500.002 $5,895.003 $6,563.004

PVMX16 2 
PTC1696SFB  3 
16SB 4 

16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires
120" CA) 

$7,800.002 $7,680.003 $7,815.004

PVMX163C 2 
16DUMP 3 
16CD 4 

16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp,
14" sides (requires 120" CA) 
16' Long, 14" Fixed Sides and Manual Tail Gate, Electric Hoist,
Manual Tarp 3 
Electric Hoist 4 

$13,900.002 $13,650.003 $13,465.004

CA84 3 
84CA 4 

84" cab to axle NC NC3 NC4

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



CA120 3 
120CA 4 

120" cab to axle NC $379.003 $382.004

6132D54 2 
6132D54  3 
11UTL 4 

11 ft. utility (requires 84" CA) 
11' Wide Utility Body  3 

$9,995.002 $9,785.003 $10,148.004

6108 2 
6108D54  3 
9SCVB 4 

Manufacturer's certified factory standard wide service
body for dual rear wheels to include appropriate mirrors -
specify. May be dealer installed. (NOTE: If you are
ordering a service body, we are advising you to contact
your awarded vendor.) 
9' Wide Utility Body  3 
9' long by approximate 7' wide.  4 

$7,500.002 $7,345.003 $8,305.004

14DV 2 
14DRYVAN  3 
14DF 4 

Manufacturer's certified factory 14' dry freight wide body
with pine floor for dual rear wheels to include appropriate
mirrors - specify. (Requires 111" CA). May be dealer
installed. (NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we
are advising you to contact your awarded vendor.) 
CA of 108 required.  4 

$6,650.002 $6,410.003 $8,511.004

14DV 2 
16DRYVAN  3 
16DF 4 

Manufacturer's certified factory 16' dry freight wide body
with pine floor for dual rear wheels to include appropriate
mirrors - specify. (Requires 129" CA). May be dealer
installed. (NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we
are advising you to contact your awarded vendor.) 
CA of 120 required.  4 

$6,850.002 $6,790.003 $8,811.004

20DV 2 
20DRYVAN  3 
20DF 4 

Manufacturer's certified factory 20' dry freight wide body
with pine floor for dual rear wheels to include appropriate
mirrors - specify. (Requires 129" CA). May be dealer
installed. (NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we
are advising you to contact your awarded vendor.) 
CA of 150 required.  4 

$8,000.002 $8,120.003 $9,423.004

TC330-9 2 
AT37-G 3 
6132DL30 4 

Optional body - specify 
Service body with 2 yd dump 2 
Altec AT37-G Aerial Device, 37' Reach, Insulated. Check with Dealer
for Details. 3 
Knapheide or equal crane body for cranes up to 5,000 lbs. capacity /
25,000 to 30,000FT. lbs. with 12" bumper.  4 

$23,000.002 $78,545.003 $19,015.004

Un Pub 2 
AT48M/P 3 
6132DLR-44K 4 

Optional body - specify 
All unpublished options ncludes a discount from MSRP. 2 
Altec AT48M/P Aerial Device, 48' Reach, Insulated. Check with Dealer
for Details 3 
11' crane body with torq-isolator crane support system. For cranes up
to 7,500 lbs capacity (38,000 ft lbs) Exclusive 12 stage K-coat
protection, (6) recessed cargo tie-downs in floor - 6,000# capacity,
LED stop/tail/turn lights and backup lights. 21" work surface bumper
with thru compartment, vise plate & 2" receiver tube. Hydraulics: PTO,
hydraulic pump for crane, hydraulic reservoir with guard. Master
Locking System, Cab Protector, (4) halogen work lights installed,
hydraulic out/hydraulic outriggers and 97db audible alarm included.
44" high side packs and 60" high right front vertical comp with 3-pt
t-handles. 7 drawer unit 1st vertical compartment, Gas bottle retainer,

NC2 $128,997.003 $33,780.004

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



vented top & bottom.  4 
TC330-9  3 
S7621 4 

Optional body - specify 
SERVICE BODY WITH 2 YARD DUMP  3 
Stellar 7621 Crane or equal. 38,000 ft.-lbs. double-acting cylinders
w/integral holding valves, boom support, wireless remote with back up
pendant control.  4 

NA $23,000.003 $21,132.004

UNPUB 3 
HAC 4 

Optional body - specify 
All unpublished options includes a discount from MSRP. 3 
Boss 36 CFM hydraulic compressor or equal, with 50'x1/2" hose reel
and roller fairlead through the right rear compartment FLR system and
underbody air tank included with compressor.  4 

NA NC3 $7,269.004

UDC 4 Optional body - specify 
Underdeck PTO driven Air compressor: Boss 8060-UBI or equal, Under
deck compressor. 1/2" hose by 50 ft. reel and roller fairlead thru right
rear comp., FLR system.  4 

NA NA $11,248.004

SOBL 4 Powder coating for utility body 
Commercial grade spray-on bed liner applied to cargo floor, sides,
compartment tops, bulkhead, tailgate & rear bumper. For 11 ft. crane
body or 11 ft. utility body.  4 

NA NA $1,720.004

Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) NA NA NA 
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup
bed) 

NA NA NA 

Pipe rack w/expended metal basket over cab (for utility
body) 

NA NA NA 

Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or
curbside) 

NA NA NA 

8THB 2 
8THB 3 
8THB 4 

Backup alarm - Factory Installed 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
Factory Back-up includes discount from msrp 3 
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$114.002 $114.003 $113.004

DLBA 4 Backup alarm - Dealer Installed 
A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

NA NA $120.004

8RNY 2 
8RNY 3 
8RNY 4 

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to
provide wide angle field of vision at rear of vehicle) -
Factory Installed 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
includes discount from msrp 3 
Includes camera, mounting, wiring, and interface to monitor for back up
camera system. A minimum discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price
is applied.  4 

$394.002 $394.003 $391.004

14DTG 2 
14DTG 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Air ride rear suspension. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
air ride suspension rear includes discount from msrp 3 

$1,235.002 $1,235.003 NA 

SAFETY 2 
SAFETY 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
SAFETY 3 

$150.002 $160.003 NA 

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



MUD 2 
MUDFLAPS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Mud flaps. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
MUDFLAPS  3 

$75.002 $75.003 NA 

Tool box 2 
TOOLBOX 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Tool Box 2 
TOOLBOX  3 

$850.002 $850.003 NA 

16SPS 2 
16SPS 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Power mirrors. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
POWER MIRRORS, INCLUDES DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 

$365.002 $365.003 NA 

4SBX 2 
4SBX 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Air compressor. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
AIR COMPRESSOR INCLUDES DISCOUNT FROM MSRP  3 

$340.002 $340.003 NA 

4EBD 2 
4EBD 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Air Dryer. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
AIR DRYER INCLUDES DISCOUNT FROM MSRP 3 

$480.002 $480.003 NA 

Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA NA 

New Tag 2 
TEMP 3 
NEWTAG 4 

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
TEMP TAG 3 

$300.002 $50.003 $250.004

Transfer 2 
TRANSFERTAG 3 
TRANTAG 4 

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
TRANSFER TAG 3 

$200.002 $235.003 $95.004

Temp 2 
NEWTAG 3 
TEMPTAG 4 

Temporary tag 
NEW TAG 3 

$15.002 $295.003 $10.004

Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA NA NA 

40PNG 2 
40PNG 3 
40PNJ 4 

Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes discount
from msrp  3 
Navistar To 60-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$3,740.002 $3,740.003 $4,480.004

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



40PNN 2 
40PNN 3 
40PNN 4 

Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes discount
from msrp  3 
Navistar To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$4,730.002 $4,730.003 $4,550.004

40PNT 2 
40PNT 3 
40PNT 4 

Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes discount
from msrp  3 
Navistar To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$4,928.002 $4,928.003 $4,738.004

40SYA 2 
40SYA 3 
40SYC 4 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes
discount from msrp  3 
Navistar To 60-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$1,850.002 $1,850.003 $2,280.004

40SYH 2 
40SYH 3 
40SYH 4 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes
discount from msrp  3 
Navistar To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$2,630.002 $2,630.003 $2,529.004

40SYM 2 
40SYM 3 
40SYM 4 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit  2 
Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit includes
discount from msrp  3 
Navistar To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (240,000 km), Engine and
Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6 Powered Unit. A minimum
discount of 6.5% of manufacturers list price is applied.  4 

$2,740.002 $2,740.003 $2,638.004

VEHICLE: CV
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks Sun State International

Trucks, LLC
Rechtien International Trucks,
Inc.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $49,380.00 $49,377.00 $49,494.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

15,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X4
SPECIFICATION #9

2019 International CV

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The International CV purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options

Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral

Gas engine in lieu of diesel engine NA 
Air conditioning NA 
AM/FM stereo radio NA 
Passenger air bag NA 
On-Star NA 
Satellite radio NA 
AFT tank for 18 gallon mid ship NA 
Limited slip differential on rear axles NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
&
Northern
&
SouthernCentral

Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Engine upgrade - specify NA 
Gas engine, 8 cylinder NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 

15DSZ 2 Dual fuel tanks 
Total 65 gallons' Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$816.002

17,500 lb. GVWR NA 
Allison authorized snythetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent (required for extended
warranty) 

Std 

8GJB 2 Alternator, extra HD 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$142.002

VEHICLE: CV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid --



8GJC 2 Dual alternators 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$361.002

12WGG 2 Idle control 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$408.002

8HBW 2 Electric brake controller 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$256.002

Manufacturer's model upgrade package (specify pkg. bid) NA 
16WAK 2 Power windows/door locks 

Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
$235.002

Speed control/tilt steering wheel Std 
8RNS 2 AM/FM radio with single CD 

CD player. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
$100.002

Sliding rear window NA 
40/20/40 seat in vinyl Std 

16KVR 2 40/20/40 seat in cloth 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$115.002

Side air bags NA 
3K 1 
3K 2 

Third key 1 NA2

Extended cab NA 
16196 2 Crew cab model 

Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
$2,190.002

Cutaway cab NA 
Cab steps Std 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Vent visors - stick-on style NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA 

9WAC 2 Bug shield 
Bug Screen behind grill. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$125.002

Wrap-around grille guard NA 
Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) NA 

G622 2 All terrain tread tires on rear 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$19.002

26DTX 2 Full size spare tire & rim 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$172.002

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 
Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA 

VEHICLE: CV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid --



Shift on the fly NA 
13AWY 2 PTO provision, automatic 

Allison RDS. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 
$331.002

PTO transmission driven, manual (dealer installed) NA 
PTO transmission driven, automatic (dealer installed) NA 

EC4000 2 4,000 lb. EH Auto Crane, or approved equivalent, with crane reinforcements with manual
outriggers 

$17,995.002

6108D54 2 Appropriate Auto Crane body with shelf package, 12" bumper with crank outriggers, or
approved equivalent 

$9,500.002

EC5000 2 5,000 lb. EH Auto Crane, or approved equivalent, with crane reinforcements with manual
outriggers 

$2,100.002

15LG 2 1,500 lb. lift gate $3,995.002

Winch 2 12,000 lb. winch with remote $2,600.002

3WAP 2 Front stabilizer bars $690.002

Tow
package 2 

Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer plug (7 prong
round), and class IV frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square removable receiver, 1" shank
with 2" ball. May be dealer installed. 

$995.002

2yard 2 2-3 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 60" CA) $11,000.002

3yard 2 2-3 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) $11,500.002

PVMX12 2 12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) $6,500.002

PVMX16 2 16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) $7,800.002

PVMX163C 2 16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA) $13,900.002

84" cab to axle NC 
120" cab to axle NC 

6132D54 2 11 ft. utility (requires 84" CA) $9,995.002

6108 2 Manufacturer's certified factory standard wide service body for dual rear wheels to include
appropriate mirrors - specify. May be dealer installed. (NOTE: If you are ordering a service
body, we are advising you to contact your awarded vendor.) 

$7,500.002

14DV 2 Manufacturer's certified factory 14' dry freight wide body with pine floor for dual rear
wheels to include appropriate mirrors - specify. (Requires 111" CA). May be dealer installed.
(NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we are advising you to contact your awarded
vendor.) 

$6,650.002

14DV 2 Manufacturer's certified factory 16' dry freight wide body with pine floor for dual rear
wheels to include appropriate mirrors - specify. (Requires 129" CA). May be dealer installed.
(NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we are advising you to contact your awarded
vendor.) 

$6,850.002

20DV 2 Manufacturer's certified factory 20' dry freight wide body with pine floor for dual rear
wheels to include appropriate mirrors - specify. (Requires 129" CA). May be dealer installed.
(NOTE: If you are ordering a service body, we are advising you to contact your awarded
vendor.) 

$8,000.002

VEHICLE: CV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid --



TC330-9 2 Optional body - specify 
Service body with 2 yd dump 2 

$23,000.002

Un Pub 2 Optional body - specify 
All unpublished options ncludes a discount from MSRP. 2 

NC2

Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Optional body - specify NA 
Powder coating for utility body NA 
Cab shield headache rack (protects back of cab) NA 
Pipe rack w/expanded metal basket over cab (for pickup bed) NA 
Pipe rack w/expended metal basket over cab (for utility body) NA 
Single ladder rack side mounted (specify street or curbside) NA 

8THB 2 Backup alarm - Factory Installed 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$114.002

Backup alarm - Dealer Installed NA 
8RNY 2 Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at

rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$394.002

14DTG 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Air ride rear suspension. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$1,235.002

SAFETY 2 Optional equipment - specify $150.002

MUD 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Mud flaps. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$75.002

Tool box 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Tool Box 2 

$850.002

16SPS 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Power mirrors. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$365.002

4SBX 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Air compressor. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$340.002

4EBD 2 Optional equipment - specify 
Air Dryer. Includes a discount from MSRP. 2 

$480.002

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

New Tag 2 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $300.002

VEHICLE: CV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid --



Transfer 2 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $200.002

Temp 2 Temporary tag $15.002

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

40PNG 2 Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered
Unit  2 

$3,740.002

40PNN 2 Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered
Unit  2 

$4,730.002

40PNT 2 Warranty - specify 
{Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Chassis Coverage for International 6.6 Powered
Unit  2 

$4,928.002

40SYA 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 60-Month/100,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6
Powered Unit  2 

$1,850.002

40SYH 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 72-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6
Powered Unit  2 

$2,630.002

40SYM 2 Diesel Warranty - specify 
Navistar} To 84-Month/150,000 Miles (160,000 km), Engine and Powertrain Coverage for International 6.6
Powered Unit  2 

$2,740.002

VEHICLE: CV (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Maudlin International Trucks
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $49,380.00 -- No bid --




