
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #13)
 
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Western $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Western $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Northern $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Northern $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Central $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Central $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Southern $60,991.00
 2019 Hino 338 Southern -- NB --
 
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $49,890.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $49,890.00
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $40,499.00
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Western $64,750.00
 2019 International MV Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Northern $63,750.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 13.pdf


 2019 International MV Northern -- NB --
Sun State International Trucks, LLC 2019 International MV Central $63,450.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Central $63,750.00
Rechtien International Trucks, Inc. 2019 International MV Southern $62,700.00
 2019 International MV Southern -- NB --
 
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Western $69,423.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Western -- NB --
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern $69,173.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Central $71,000.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern $71,923.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Western $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Western -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Northern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Northern -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Central $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Central -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Southern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central -- NB --
Palm Truck Center 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern $71,042.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern -- NB --
 
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Western $72,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Central $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Western Star 4700
The Western Star 4700 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Gas engine in lieu of diesel NA 
Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify NA 
Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify NA 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission NA 
Wheel seals NA 
AM/FM stereo radio NA 
Satellite radio NA 
On-Star NA 
Power Take Off (PTO) NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 
101-22P 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 

300HP 1 
$1,862.001

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 

811-1AJ 1 Engine hour meter Incl.1

864-001 1 Trans oil temp meter NC1

35T-001 1 Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended
warranty) 

Incl.1

171-007 1 Premium hoses Incl.1

201-151 1 Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks 
DUAL 60 GALLON 1 

$628.001

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



480-009 1 Air dryers 
BENDIX AD-9 1 

Incl.1

477-006 1 Moisture ejectors $81.001

452-001 1 Driver controlled differential lock $647.001

Power windows, only NA 
654-001,655-005 1 Power windows/door locks $535.001

149-012 1 Speed control Incl.1

Tilt steering wheel NA 
532-002 1 Telescopic and tilt steering wheel Incl.1

746-1B4 1 AM/FM radio with single CD $437.001

Side air bags NA 
3K 1 Third key $19.001

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Crew cab (84" CA) NA 
Super cab (84" CA) NA 
Cutaway cab NA 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify NA 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify NA 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify NA 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify NA 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify NA 

316-021 1 Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed $175.001

316-020 1 Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed $365.001

Vent visors - stick-on style NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA 
Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) NA 

KN-36 1 Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent $750.001

74B-080 1 Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors $175.001

727-097 1 Airhorn Incl.1

714-001,720-002,722-002 1 Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles $149.001

Front stabilizer bars NA 
439-001 1 Rear shock absorbers $162.001

622-1MG 1 Auxiliary rear springs $180.001

122-077 1 Heated fuel water separator $115.001

019-001 1 Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) $614.001

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



019-001 1 Trailer towing package - specify $614.001

019-001 1 Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes $614.001

019-001 1 Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes $614.001

DLR-MF 1 Mud flaps $87.001

Full size spare tire & rim NA 
Jack and wheel wrench NA 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 

311-001 1 Daytime running lights $51.001

Immobilize daytime running lights NA 
6132 1 Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) $19,025.001

3YDDMP 1 Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent
(requires 84" CA) 

$20,639.001

5YDDMP 1 5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) $21,791.001

12STK 1 12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) $16,482.001

12CDMP 1 12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84" CA) $19,850.001

14STK 1 14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA) $17,104.001

14CDMP 1 14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108" CA) $20,385.001

16STK 1 16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) $17,354.001

16CDMP 1 16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA) $20,687.001

18STK 1 18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138" CA) $17,854.001

19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) NA 
20STK 1 20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156" CA) $18,240.001

20FTVAN 1 20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) $19,175.001

24FTVAN 1 24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) $20,143.001

24STK 1 24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186" CA) $19,187.001

18TD 1 Optional body - specify 
18FT TRASH DUMP 1 

$22,048.001

20TD 1 Optional body - specify 
20FT TRASH DUMP 1 

$24,343.001

22TD 1 Optional body - specify 
22FT TRASH DUMP 1 

$25,393.001

24TD 1 Optional body - specify 
24FT TRASH DUMP 1 

$25,913.001

IMT-12 1 Optional body - specify 
IMT 12FT LUBE PACKAGE 1 

$49,977.001

CHIPPER 1 Optional body - specify 
14FT CHIPPER WITH REMOVABLE TOP 1 

$24,300.001

Optional body - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



Optional body - specify NA 
Powder coating for utility body NA 

545-450 1 108" cab to axle $35.001

545-480 1 120" cab to axle $333.001

545-525 1 138" cab to axle $503.001

545-572 1 156" cab to axle $503.001

545-632 1 180" cab to axle $926.001

545-647 1 186" cab to axle $1,067.001

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD NA 
545-450 1 33,000 GVWR 108" CA $35.001

545-480 1 33,000 GVWR 120" CA $333.001

545-572 1 33,000 GVWR 156" CA $503.001

545-632 1 33,000 GVWR 180" CA $926.001

545-647 1 33,000 GVWR 186" CA $1,067.001

GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 

2KLG 1 2,000 lb. lift gate $5,700.001

3KLG 1 3,000 lb. lift gate $8,100.001

12 ton jack cab mounted, if available NA 
50KCB 1 Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank outriggers,

or approved equivalent 
$61,500.001

6KEHCB 1 Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 

$46,500.001

HOR 1 Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent $6,500.001

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



6406H 1 Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis
springs, or approved equivalent 

$54,300.001

8406H 1 Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis
springs, or approved equivalent 

$55,200.001

721-001 1 Backup alarm - Factory Installed $78.001

Backup alarm - Dealer Installed NA 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of
vision at rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 

NA 

IMT-11 1 Optional equipment - specify 
11FT MECHANICS TRUCK 1 

$79,500.001

ATR-55 1 Optional equipment - specify 
SIGNALIER MODEL ATR-55 1 

$121,400.001

IMT-16 1 Optional equipment - specify 
IMT 16FT KNUCKLEBOOM FLATBED W/OUTRIGGERS 1 

$62,500.001

PTL-3 1 Optional equipment - specify 
PETERSEN LIGHTNING LOADER 1 

$81,032.001

A300-20 1 Optional equipment - specify 
GALIATH A300 20TD REAR LOADER 1 

$89,200.001

PRS-3 1 Optional equipment - specify 
PETERSEN LIGHTNING LOADER REAR STEER 1 

$109,800.001

NWC20RL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
NEW WAY COBRA 20YD REAR LOADER 1 

$72,800.001

NWV13RL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
NEW WAY 13YD REAR LOADER 1 

$65,300.001

TRV-589 1 Optional equipment - specify 
ALTEC LRV-58 WITH CHIPPER BODY  1 

$132,000.001

M10072 1 Optional equipment - specify 
EPSILON M100L72 GRAPPLE LOADER WITH 28YD DUMP 1 

$109,800.001

NWV20RL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
NEW WAY VIPER 20YD REAL LOADER 1 

$74,800.001

C-MODEL 1 Optional equipment - specify 
BRUSH HAWG C-MODEL GRAPPLE 1 

$79,890.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 

TT 1 Temporary tag NC1

TRT 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NC1

NT 1 New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NC1

Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Warranty - specify 
SEE DEALER 1 

NA1

Warranty - specify NA 
Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 4700
DEALER: Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group Southport Truck Group
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $72,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00 $73,440.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Western Star 4700

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Western Star 4700 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for
this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base
price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Gas engine in lieu of diesel 
Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify 
Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission 
Wheel seals 
AM/FM stereo radio 
Satellite radio 
On-Star 
Power Take Off (PTO) 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Bi-fuel model - specify 
CNG prep - specify 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Engine hour meter 
Trans oil temp meter 
Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended warranty) 
Premium hoses 
Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks 
Air dryers 
Moisture ejectors 

VEHICLE: 4700 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Driver controlled differential lock 
Power windows, only 
Power windows/door locks 
Speed control 
Tilt steering wheel 
Telescopic and tilt steering wheel 
AM/FM radio with single CD 
Side air bags 

3K 1 Third key 1

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Crew cab (84" CA) 
Super cab (84" CA) 
Cutaway cab 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Vent visors - stick-on style 
Rainshields - flange style 
Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent 
Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors 
Airhorn 
Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles 
Front stabilizer bars 
Rear shock absorbers 
Auxiliary rear springs 
Heated fuel water separator 
Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) 
Trailer towing package - specify 
Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes 
Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes 

VEHICLE: 4700 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Mud flaps 
Full size spare tire & rim 
Jack and wheel wrench 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
Daytime running lights 
Immobilize daytime running lights 
Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) 
Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent (requires 84"
CA) 
5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) 
12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) 
12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84" CA) 
14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA) 
14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108" CA) 
16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) 
16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA) 
18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138" CA) 
19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) 
20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156" CA) 
20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) 
24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) 
24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186" CA) 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Powder coating for utility body 
108" cab to axle 
120" cab to axle 
138" cab to axle 
156" cab to axle 
180" cab to axle 
186" cab to axle 

VEHICLE: 4700 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD 
33,000 GVWR 108" CA 
33,000 GVWR 120" CA 
33,000 GVWR 156" CA 
33,000 GVWR 180" CA 
33,000 GVWR 186" CA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
2,000 lb. lift gate 
3,000 lb. lift gate 
12 ton jack cab mounted, if available 
Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank outriggers, or
approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or approved
equivalent 
Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 
Backup alarm - Factory Installed 
Backup alarm - Dealer Installed 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
Optional equipment - specify 

VEHICLE: 4700 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --



Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 

VEHICLE: 4700 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --




