
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #13)
 
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Western $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Western $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Northern $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Northern $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Central $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Central $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Southern $60,991.00
 2019 Hino 338 Southern -- NB --
 
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $49,890.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $49,890.00
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $40,499.00
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Western $64,750.00
 2019 International MV Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Northern $63,750.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 13.pdf


 2019 International MV Northern -- NB --
Sun State International Trucks, LLC 2019 International MV Central $63,450.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Central $63,750.00
Rechtien International Trucks, Inc. 2019 International MV Southern $62,700.00
 2019 International MV Southern -- NB --
 
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Western $69,423.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Western -- NB --
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern $69,173.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Central $71,000.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern $71,923.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Western $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Western -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Northern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Northern -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Central $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Central -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Southern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central -- NB --
Palm Truck Center 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern $71,042.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern -- NB --
 
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Western $72,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Central $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Kenworth T370
The Kenworth T370 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $69,423.00 $69,173.00 $71,000.00 $71,923.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

Gas engine in lieu of diesel NA NA NA 
2050121 1 
2051122 2 
2050121 3 

Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify 
Eaton Fuller FS5406A 6spped  1 
FULLER FS5406A 6-SPEED MANUAL TRANSMISSIO 3 

($3,424.00)1 $2,821.002 ($3,527.00)3

Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify NA NA NA 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission Std NA Incl. 
Wheel seals NA NA NA 

8601421 1 
8601421 2 

AM/FM stereo radio ($212.00)1 ($163.00)2 Incl. 

Satellite radio NA NA NA 
On-Star NA NA NA 
Power Take Off (PTO) NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA NA NA 

 

Order Code Add Options
Western
& Northern Central Southern

0120241 1 
0120241 2 
0120241 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PACCR PX-7 240 2017 240@2400 235@2600 560@1600 Includes turbo
exhaust brake  1 
Paccar PX7-240hp / 560 ft/lb  2 
PX-7 240 HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES EXHAUST BRAKE 3 

$1,125.001 $1,333.002 $1,286.003

0120262 1 
0120262 2 
0120251 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PACCR PX-7 240 2017 260@2400 250@2600 660@1600 Includes turbo
exhaust brake  1 
Paccar PX7-260hp / 660 ft/lb  2 
PX-7 250 HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES EXHAUST BRAKe 3 

$1,665.001 $2,017.002 $1,753.003

0120301 1 
0120282 2 
0120262 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PACCR PX-7 300 2017 300@2600 660@1600 Includes turbo exhaust brake  1 
Paccar PX7-280hp / 660 ft/lb  2 
PX-7 260 HP 2017 560 FT/LB TORQUE INCLUDES INCLUDES EXHAUST
BRAKE 3 

$2,302.001 $2,260.002 $1,946.003

2010859 1 
0120301 2 
0120282 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 2500RDS 1 
Paccar PX7-300hp / 660 ft/lb  2 
PACCAR PX-7 280 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE 3 

$225.001 $2,731.002 $2,180.003

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central

Florida
Kenworth of South Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $69,423.00 $69,173.00 $71,000.00 $71,923.00



2011228 1 
120241/2011205 2 
0120301 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3500RDS 1 
PX7-240hp-560 ft/lb - 3000RDS  2 
PACCAR PX-7 300 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE 3 

$4,502.001 $6,038.002 $2,635.003

0129502 1 
120262/2011205 2 
0120262/2011205 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PACCR PX-9 300 2017 300@2000 860@1300 Includes turbo exhaust brake.
Includes Allison 3000RDS  1 
PX7-260hp-660ft/lb - 3000RDS 6spd  2 
PX7-260hp-660ft/lb - WITH ALLISON 3000RDS AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION 3 

$9,552.001 $6,723.002 $6,677.003

0129532 1 
120301/2011205 2 
0120301/ 2011205 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PACCR PX-9 330 2017 330@2000 1000@1400 Includes turbo exhaust brake.
Includes Allison 3000RDS  1 
PX7-300hp-660ft/lb - 3000RDS  2 
PACCAR PX-7 300 HP/660 FT/LB TORQUE WITH ALLISON 3000RDS
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 3 

$10,886.001 $7,437.002 $7,391.003

129502/2011205 2 
0129502/2011205 3 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
PX9-300hp-860ft/lb-3000RDS 6spd  2 
PACCAR PX-9 300 HP/860 FT/LB TORQUE WITH ALLISON 3000RDS
6-SPEED AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSIO 3 

NA $12,470.002 $12,581.003

0410/128922 2 Bi-fuel model - specify 
Bi-Fuel N/A Substitute CNG CNG-T440 L9N 320hp - 3000RDS s/axle (Must
Add CNG Tanks) 2 

NA $55,508.002 NA 

0810/128922 2 CNG prep - specify 
CNG T880 L9N 320hp S/axle (Must Add CNG Tanks) 2 

NA $56,584.002 NA 

CNGTNKS 2 CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
CNG Tanks 80DGE includes: FMM-defuel valve-transit fill Upgrade to 90DGE
= $37474  2 

NA $36,260.002 NA 

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA NA NA 
Engine hour meter Std Incl. Std 

8226667 1 
8226667 2 
8222667 3 

Trans oil temp meter 
Trans oil temp meter - Indicator light  2 

$30.001 $30.002 $29.003

Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent
(required for extended warranty) 

Incl. Incl. Incl. 

Premium hoses Std Incl. Incl. 
7135045 1 
7132045 2 
7010056 7012056 3 

Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks 
7210056/7212056 Dual 56 gal alum fuel tanks ILO dual 45gal $1363  2 
DUAL @ 56 GALLONS CAPACITY ALUMINUM, ROUND TANKS, ONE
EACH SID,UNDER CAB.  3 

$620.001 $887.002 $1,073.003

Air dryers Incl. Std Incl. 
9102040 1 
9102040 2 
9102040 3 

Moisture ejectors 
Two Bendix DV-2 drain valves on service tanks  1 
Two Bendix DV-2 drain valves on service tanks 2 

$215.001 $225.002 $217.003

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central

Florida
Kenworth of South Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $69,423.00 $69,173.00 $71,000.00 $71,923.00



3531001 1 
3531000 2 
3531000 3 

Driver controlled differential lock 
FOR SINGLE CHASSIS. PLEASE INQUIRE FOR TANDEM CHASSIS 3 

$886.001 $962.002 $928.003

8879213 1 
8879213 2 
8879213 3 

Power windows, only $96.001 $122.002 $104.003

8879213 1 
8879213/8700188 2 

Power windows/door locks 
Pwr windows w/ Keyless entry  2 
Door locks are standard. Powers windows are optional  3 

$96.001 $414.002 $104.003

Speed control Std Incl. Std 
Tilt steering wheel NA NA NA 

8201200 1 
8201200 2 
8201200 3 

Telescopic and tilt steering wheel $425.001 $483.002 $466.003

8601422 1 
8601422 2 
8601422 3 

AM/FM radio with single CD 
AM/FM/WB/USB/CD 2 

$354.001 $158.002 $381.003

Side air bags NA NA NA 
3K 1 
3K 2 
8203060 3 

Third key 
5 SETS OF KEYS  3 

$30.001 $24.002 $23.003

2561010 1 
2562012/232239 2 
2561010/2322239 3 

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) 
Fabco FSD-10A Front Drive Axle at 10,000lbs. Includes Allison 3000RDS
Transmission, Freewheel locking hubs  1 
Upgrade to 4x4:Factory Installed FSD12A; TC237 2spd  2 
FABCO FSD-10A DRIVING FRONT AXLE/FABCO TC-237 2-SPEED
TRANSFER CASE, WITHOUT P.T.O.; FACTORY INSTALLED AND
WARRANTED 3 

$26,122.001 $30,669.002 $25,216.003

0410/129569 2 
T470 3 

Model upgrade - specify 
T440 PX9-370 3000RDS 23k s/axle  2 
UPGRADE TO T470 MODEL 4X2 OR 6X4. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER
FOR SPECIFICATIONS AND PRICING. 3 

NA $27,433.002 $0.003

0810/129569 2 
T440 3 

Model upgrade - specify 
T880 PX9-350 3000RDS 23k s/axle  2 
UPGRADE TO T440 MODEL 4X2 OR 6X4. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER
FOR SPECIFICATIONS AND PRICING 3 

NA $34,018.002 $0.003

DRSCC 1 
CREWCAB 2 
CREW CAB 3 

Crew cab (84" CA) 
Factory approved crew cab conversion 52", includes Rear Bench Seat, Seat
belts, & Access Steps 2 
CREW CAB CONVERSION, 4 DOORS, W/REAR BENCH SEAT, (5) SEAT
BELTS,  3 

$29,750.001 $32,873.002 $34,500.003

Super cab (84" CA) NA NA NA 
Cutaway cab NA NA NA 

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central

Florida
Kenworth of South Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $69,423.00 $69,173.00 $71,000.00 $71,923.00



8867202 1 
8879911 2 
8865001 3 

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Dual Motorized Mirrors  1 
Cab corner Windows  2 
MIRRORS Dual Kenworth Aero Heated  3 

$402.001 $475.002 $302.003

8480060 1 
8867202 2 
8478330 3 

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Two Man Bench Seat  1 
Dual motorized Mirrors  2 
TWO-MAN BENCH PASSENGER SEAT VINYL 3 

$404.001 $426.002 $418.003

6056680/6141650 2 
5045162/5245162 3 

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Double Frame Includes 10 3/4 x 3/8 main frame  2 
ALCOA 88367 ALUMINUN WHEELS (6 3 

NA $3,001.002 $1,016.003

8480060 2 
WELDON 3 

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
2 man passenger bench seat  2 
26 INCH EXTENDED CAB CONVERSION, FACTORY-APPROVED 3 

NA $424.002 $20,400.003

3836300 2 
8049001 3 

Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Rear Stabilizer Bar  2 
FACTORY EXTENDED CAB OPTION FOR T440 & T470 MODEL
UPGRADES 3 

NA $941.002 $3,455.003

LHSL 1 
Golight 2 
GOLIGHT 3 

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb,
dealer installed 
Single Go Light 2 

$575.001 $831.002 $725.003

L&RHSL 1 
AWStrobes 2 
GOLIGHT2 3 

Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear
halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Left & Right Roof Mounted Amber Strobes with 2 Side & 4 Corner Amber LED
Strobe Lights  2 

$995.001 $3,160.002 $1,025.003

VVSO 1 Vent visors - stick-on style $250.001 NA NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA NA NA 

CMH 1 
Linex 2 

Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) $925.001 $1,150.002 $1,100.00 

TOOL 1 
18x18x36 2 
TB24 3 

Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent 
18x18x36 steel 2 
KNAPHEIDE STEEL TOOLBOX 24X18X18 3 

$625.001 $805.002 $360.003

8850817 1 
8850817 2 
8850817 3 

Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors 
Dual Fender mtd convex mirrors  2 
Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors  3 

$191.001 $190.002 $184.003

8841411 1 
8841618 2 
8410303 3 

Airhorn 
Single air horn under cab 1 
Air horn Dual (Single = $141.00)  2 
SINGLE RECTANGULAR 23" DIAMETER AIR HORN, TOP-OF-CAB
MOUNTED 3 

$95.001 $215.002 $136.003

9490213/404 2 
9490206/ 9490404 3 

Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles 
Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles 3 

Incl. $145.002 $136.003

3836300 1 
3836300 3 

Front stabilizer bars 
N/A - Rear Stabilizer Bar 1 
Front (N/A Rear) Stabilizer Bar 3 

$952.001 NA $930.003

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central

Florida
Kenworth of South Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $69,423.00 $69,173.00 $71,000.00 $71,923.00



3836310 1 
3836310 2 
3836310 3 

Rear shock absorbers 
Rear Shock absorbers for Reyco 79K 3 

$207.001 $224.002 $216.003

3636422 2 
3636422 3 

Auxiliary rear springs NA $394.002 $381.003

1323004 1 
1321121 2 

Heated fuel water separator 
Davco 245 or Equiv. 2 

NA1 $388.002 NA 

9110020 1 
6591612/911068 2 
9110020 3 

Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) 
Full Truck Kit: Glad Hands and Seven Way Plug mounted at the end of frame 

 1 
Trailer tow pkg: 5th whl/deck/ valves/hoses-1/4fndrs  2 
FULL TRUCK KIT FOR TRAILER CONNECTIONS, NO PINTLE HOOK 3 

$452.001 $7,224.002 $484.003

DOTTP 1 
20TPINTL 2 

Trailer towing package - specify 
Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer
plug(7 prong round) and Class IV frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square
removable receiver. 1" shank with 2" ball. Dealer installed  1 
Pintle hook/plate - Only 2 
FULL TRUCK KIT, INCLUDING TRAILER AIR BRAKE & ELECTRICAL
CONNECIONS + 15T PINTLE HOOK, FRAME-MOUNTED 3 

$1,152.001 $1,450.002 $1,298.003

DOTTP 1 
20TPINTAIR 2 

Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes 
Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer
plug(7 prong round) and Class IV frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square
removable receiver. 1" shank with 2" ball. Dealer installed  1 
Trlr tow pkg: Air Brk -7prong plug;20ton pintle  2 
FULL TRUCK KIT, INCLUDING TRAILER AIR BRAKE & ELECTRICAL
CONNECIONS + 15T PINTLE HOOK, FRAME-MOUNTED DEALER
INSTALLED $ 3 

$1,155.001 $1,763.002 $1,256.003

DOTTP 1 
20PINTELEC 2 

Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes 
Trailer towing package, to include heavy duty flashers, wiring for trailer
plug(7 prong round) and Class IV frame mounted trailer hitch with 2" square
removable receiver. 1" shank with 2" ball. Dealer installed  1 
Trlr tow pkg: Elec Brk -7prong plug;20ton pintle Includes Elec Brake
Controller 2 

$1,155.001 $2,760.002 NA 

6721102/2094 2 
6721102/6722000 3 

Mud flaps 
BETTS B-25 MUDFLAPS ARMS/REAR MUD FLAP SHIELDS  3 

Std $162.002 $111.003

FSSP 1 Full size spare tire & rim $750.001 NA NA 
Jack and wheel wrench NA NA NA 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA NA NA 

9090000 1 
9090000 2 
9090000 3 

Daytime running lights $142.001 Incl.2 $133.003

Immobilize daytime running lights NA NA NA 
EC-GT6132D54 1 
HDR132ADW 2 
6132D54 3 

Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires
84" CA) 
Knapheide 6132D54 11' utility body  1 
11' Service Body Reading HDR132ADW  2 
KNAPHEIDE 11' LONG WIDE UTILITY BODY FOR DRW CHASSIS 3 

$8,960.001 $13,764.002 $9,778.003
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EC-OXFA00082163 1 
OX2-3CY 2 
KDBF1112AT 3 

Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or
approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) 
11' 2/3 yd dump for 84" CA (including hotshift PTO for automatic transmission,
manual or air tailgate, ground level control tarp system) 1 
2-3yd OX dump w/man grd contrl tarp w/Hot Shift PTO CA-84"  2 
KNAPHEIDE 11' LONG 2/3 YARD DUMP BODY, 12" SIDES & GROUND
LEVEL CRANK/TARP  3 

$14,553.001 $15,972.002 $12,490.003

EC-DCGTG300 1 
OX5CY 2 
GPD10 3 

5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) 
Godwin's 5 yd 10' dump with tarp 1 
5yd Ox dump w/man grd contrl tarp w/Hot Shift PTO 2 
GAR-P 10' LONG DUMP BODY 5/6 YARD, 3/16" FLOOR,AIR TAILGATE,
ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM FOR 84" CA 3 

$15,600.001 $15,972.002 $15,342.003

GT12SK 1 
12STAKE 2 
PVMXS-103C 3 

12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84"
CA) 
12' flat stake PVMXS 40" stake side, front & rear 1 
KNAPHEIDE 12' LONG DRW FLATBED W/40" BULKHEAD, SCREENED
WINDOW, 40" STAKE SIDES & ICC BUMPER  3 

$5,100.001 $5,520.002 $5,476.003

GT12DT 1 
12CONTD 2 
GPCD12 3 

12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14"
sides (requires 84" CA) 
12' HD Contractors Dump BR12,14" sides, trap  1 
12' OX Contractor dump w/man grd Tarp & 14"sides  2 
GAR-P 12' LONG CONTRACTORS DUMP, 14" SIDES, 3/16" FLOOR, TWIN
BARN DOORS OR DROP-DOWN, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM 3 

$13,150.001 $15,899.002 $15,882.003

GT14SK 1 
14STAKE 2 
PVMXS-143C 3 

14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108"
CA) 
14' Knapheide PVMXS flat stake, 40" stake sides & front  1 
KNAPHEIDE 14' LONG DRW FLATBED W/40" BULKHEAD, SCREENED
WINDOW, 40" STAKE SIDES & ICC BUMPER  3 

$5,300.001 $6,472.002 $6,347.003

GT14DT 1 
14CONTD 2 
GPCD14 3 

14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14"
sides (requires 108" CA) 
14' HD Contractor Dump BR14 14" sides trap 1 
14' OX Contractor dump w/man grd Tarp & 14"sides 2 
GAR-P 14' LONG CONTRACTORS DUMP, 14" SIDES, 3/16" FLOOR, TWIN
BARN DOORS OR DROP-DOWN, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM 3 

$13,800.001 $16,884.002 $16,482.003

GT16ST 1 
16STAKE 2 
GPF16 3 

16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120"
CA) 
16' Knapheide PVMXS flat stake, stake sides & rear bulkhead  1 
GAR-P 16' LONG STEEL FLATBED BODY, EXPANDED METAL WINDOW,
40" METAL STAKES & SLATS 3 

$6,300.001 $7,128.002 $10,200.003

GT16DT 1 
16CONTD 2 
GPCD16 3 

16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14"
sides (requires 120" CA) 
16' Contractor dump BR16, 14" sides, tarp 1 
16' OX Contractor dump w/man grd Tarp & 14"sides 2 
GAR-P 16' LONG CONTRACTORS DUMP, 14" SIDES, 3/16" FLOOR, TWIN
BARN DOORS OR DROP-DOWN, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM 3 

$14,300.001 $17,165.002 $16,962.003

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central

Florida
Kenworth of South Florida
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EC-OXFA00081870 1 
18STAKE 2 
GPF18 3 

18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138"
CA) 
18' stake body (includes 40" high steel racks both sides and rear) 1 
GAR-P 18' LONG STEEL FLATBED BODY, EXPANDED METAL WINDOW,
40" METAL STAKES & SLATS 3 

$9,326.001 $7,492.002 $10,760.003

GT19RB 1 
KY19/JD19 3 

19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) 
19' Godwin Roll Back 1 
KYLAR OR JERR-DAN 19' X 96" STEEL DECK ROLLBACK WRECKER,
WHEEL LIFT & REMOVABLE SIDES 3 

$28,300.001 NA $36,500.003

GT20ST 1 
20STAKE 2 
GPF20 3 

20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156"
CA) 
20' Knapheide PVMXS flatbed, 40" stake side front & rear 1 
GAR-P 20' LONG STEEL FLATBED BODY, EXPANDED METAL WINDOW,
40" METAL STAKES & SLATS 3 

$7,800.001 $8,011.002 $10,860.003

GT20VAN 1 
20VAN 2 
SVA20 3 

20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) 
20' Van COM 20 1 
SUPREME 20' X 96" SIGNATURE DFV W/ROLL-UP DOOR 3 

$10,700.001 $10,319.002 $13,880.003

GT24VAN 1 
24VAN 2 
SVA24 3 

24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) 
24' Van COM 24 1 
SUPREME 24' X 96" SIGNATURE DFV W/ROLL-UP DOOR 3 

$10,600.001 $11,324.002 $16,006.003

GT24ST 1 
24STAKE 2 
GPF24 3 

24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186"
CA) 
24' Knapheide PVMXS flat/stake 40" side & rear  1 
GAR-P 24' LONG STEEL FLATBED BODY,EXPANDED METAL WINDOW,
40" METAL STAKES & SLATS 3 

$9,200.001 $9,022.002 $12,840.003

LUBESVCBODY 2 
GPT20 3 

Optional body - specify 
Lube Specialists Lube-Fuel Body (35k GVW PKG REQ)  2 
GAR-P 20' STEEL TRASH DUMP, UP TO 32 YARD, ALL 3/16" STEEL,
ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM, TWIN BARN DOORS, HOT SHIFT PTO 3 

NA $93,481.002 $22,482.003

GrappleTL3 2 
SVG20 3 

Optional body - specify 
Petersen TL3 loader w/18ft 24 cy hardox body Quad Stick Control Model Add:
$10,328 Route Assistant Add: $44,300  2 
SUPREME 20' X 96" KOLD KING REFRIGERATED BODY. PLEASE
CONTACT CHOSEN BRAND TO DETERMINE DIESEL OR
DIESEL-ELECTRIC COOLING. 3 

NA $63,479.002 $23,160.003

GrappleRS3 2 
SVG24 3 

Optional body - specify 
Petersen RS3 Rear Steer Grapple  2 
SUPREME 24' X 96" KOLD KING REFRIGERATED BODY. PLEASE
CONTACT CHOSEN BRAND TO DETERMINE DIESEL OR
DIESEL-ELECTRIC COOLING. 3 

NA $93,534.002 $25,261.003

GrappleG2224C 2 
KB-20H-ML 3 

Optional body - specify 
Brush Hawg C Series Grapple With 24.5yd Body  2 
RDK GRAPPLE LOADER W/18' 28 YARD DUMP BODY, 20' REACH
BOOM 3 

NA $71,422.002 $73,498.003

GrappleKB20 2 
C-MODEL 3 

Optional body - specify 
Pac Mac KB20 30yd Hardox 1/4 floor (Req 35K GVW)  2 
BRUSH HAWG GRAPPLE LOADER W/18' TAPERED STEEL DUMP
BODY 3 

NA $76,799.002 $83,868.003

VEHICLE: T370
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ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
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WaterTruck2K 2 
TL3 3 

Optional body - specify 
2000 Gallon Water tank w/ 4 Spray Heads Direct PTO  2 
PETERSEN INDUSTRIES GRAPPLE LOADER, H.D., STEEL DUMP BODY,
18" LONG 3/16" FLOOR 3 

NA $32,391.002 $86,708.003

WaterTruckSS 2 
AL1 3 

Optional body - specify 
2500 Gallon Stainless Water Tanker  2 
PETERSEN INDUSTRIES GRAPPLE LOADER, H.D., W/HARDOX STEEL
BODY, 22' LONG, 3/16" THROUGHOUT 3 

NA $60,675.002 $117,489.003

GAL SLCH-R 2 
CS9120A 3 

Optional body - specify 
LCH 8000 Loaded container handler 8000R container carrier w/out rotation =
$34,764  2 
RDK 23 YARD STEEL FULLY AUTOMATED SIDE LOADER REFUSE
BODY. REQUIRES 16,000# FRONT AXLE & 26,000# REAR AXLE 3 

NA $39,149.002 $125,885.003

PWDRCT 2 
CS9133A 3 

Powder coating for utility body 
RDK 33 YARD STEEL FULLY AUTOMATED SIDE LOADER REFUSE
BODY. REQUIRES 16,000# FRONT AXLE & 40,000# TANDEM REAR
AXLE 3 

NA $1,108.002 $141,882.003

2406201 2 108" cab to axle NC NC2 NC 
2406419 2 120" cab to axle NC NC2 NC 
2406801 1 
2406801/206 2 
2406801 /6054410 3 

138" cab to axle 
206"W.B 3 

$375.001 $661.002 $945.003

2406801 1 
2406804/232 2 
2406801 /6054410 3 

156" cab to axle 
232"W.B. 3 

$375.001 $1,017.002 $945.003

2406801 1 
2406802/245 2 
2406801 /6054410 3 

180" cab to axle 
245" WB 3 

$375.001 $1,442.002 $945.003

2406801 1 
2406820/256 2 
2406801 /6054430 3 

186" cab to axle 
256"WB 3 

$375.001 $2,264.002 $1,244.003

0120240/203/2203 1 
120241/205/190 2 
0120241 2011203 3 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic
transmission (3000RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional
wheelbase prices 
PACCAR PX-7 240HP-3000RDS 5-Speed  1 
33k GVW - 240hp PX7 - 3000RDS - 6spd (Includes Rear Shocks)  2 
PACCAR PX-7 240 HP/ALLISON 3000RDS 5-SP AUTOMATIC FOR OTHERS
POWER TRAIN COMBINATIONS CALL THE DEALER  3 

$5,225.001 $8,629.002 $5,926.003

0120240/228/203 1 
120262/228/190 2 
0120241 2011228  3 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic
transmission (3500RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional
wheelbase prices 
PACCAR PX-7 240HP-3500RDS 5-Speed 1 
33k GVW - 260hp PX7 - 3500RDS - 5spd (Includes Rear Shocks)  2 
PACCAR PX-7 240 HP/ALLISON 3500RDS 5-SPD FOR OTHERS POWER
TRAIN COMBINATIONS CALL THE DEALER  3 

$5,412.001 $9,238.002 $5,868.003

VEHICLE: T370
DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Jacksonville Kenworth of Central
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0120240/228/203 1 
120301/205/190 2 
0129461/2011203 3 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic
transmission (3000RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional
wheelbase prices 
PACCAR PX-7 240HP-3000RDS 6-Speed  1 
33k GVW - 300hp PX7 - 3000RDS - 6spd (Includes Rear Shocks)  2 
PACCAR PX-9 260 HP/ALLISON 3000RDS 5-SP AUTOMATIC FOR OTHERS
POWER TRAIN COMBINATIONS CALL THE DEALER 3 

$5,225.001 $9,872.002 $10,700.003

0120240/228/203 1 
0129532/232/190 2 
0129461/2011203 3 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic
transmission (3500RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional
wheelbase prices 
PACCAR PX-7 240HP-3500RDS 6-Speed 1 
33k GVW - 330hp - PX9 3500RDS - 6spd (Includes Rear Shocks)  2 
PACCAR PX-9 300 HP/ALLISON 3000RDS 5-SP AUTOMATIC FOR OTHERS
POWER TRAIN COMBINATIONS, UP TO 350 HP & 1125 TORQUE PLEASE
CALL THE DEALER 3 

$5,412.001 $16,344.002 $12,581.003

2562012 1 
2562012/232237 2 
2561012/ 3 

33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD 
Fabco FSD-12A Front Drive Axle at 10,000lbs. Includes Allison 3000RDS
Transmission, Freewheel locking hubs  1 
33k GVW PX7-260hp-2500RDS-23k r/a - FACTORY INSTALLED 4X4 -
Upgrade Transfer Case to PTO Model 2322247 $4865.00  2 
FABCO FSD-12A DRIVING FRONT AXLE, 12000# & FABCO TC-237
2-SPEED TRANSFER CASE 3 

$26,446.001 $33,080.002 $26,926.003

33K108CA 1 
2406452/176 2 

33,000 GVWR 108" CA $725.001 NC2 NC 

33K120CA 1 
2406452/188 2 

33,000 GVWR 120" CA $725.001 NC2 NC 

33K156CA 1 
2406802/232 2 
2406801 /6054410 3 

33,000 GVWR 156" CA 
33k GVW 156" Cab to Axle - 232" wb SPL Driveline 2 
232" WB 3 

$955.001 $1,367.002 $945.003

33K180CA 1 
2406802/244 2 
2406801 /6054410 3 

33,000 GVWR 180" CA 
33k GVW 180" Cab to Axle - 244"wb SPL Driveline 2 
245'WB 3 

$955.001 $1,446.002 $945.003

33K186 1 
2406820/260 2 
2406801 /6054430 3 

33,000 GVWR 186" CA 
33k GVW 186" Cab to Axle - 254"wb SPL Driveline 2 

$955.001 $2,213.002 $1,244.003

120282/2011205 2 
40K 3 

GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
PX7-280hp-660ft/lb - 3000RDS 33K 2 
40000# GVWR UPGRADE, CONSISTING OF 14000# FRONT
AXLE,SPRINGS & POWER STEERING & 26000# DANA SPICER REAR
AXLE,REYCO 26000# 79KB SUSPENSION & FRAME REINFORCEMENT 3 

NA $8,732.002 $5,355.003

120301/2011205 2 
3122245 3730028 3 

GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
PX7-300hp-660ft/lb - 3000RDS 33K  2 
52,000 GVW IMCLUDES 12,000# FRONT AXLE AND 40,000 REAR AXLE
WIHT AIR SUSPENSION  3 

NA $9,145.002 $9,775.003
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129502/2011205 2 GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
PX9-300hp-860ft/lb-3000RDS 6spd 33K  2 
60,000# GVW INCLUDES 16,000# FRONT AXLE AND 44,000# REAR AXLE
WITH HENDRIKSON RT463 46K SUSPENSION CA AND DOUBLE FRAME
CHARGES MAY APPLY CONTACT DEALER  3 

NA $14,732.002 $19,851.003

35GVW PKG 2 
42K 3 

GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
35K GVW Package w PX9 260 HP 3500RDS Includes 248 WB 180" CA 3/8"
Frame  2 
42000# GVWR UPGRADE, CONSISTING OF 16000# FRONT AXLE,
SPRINGS & POWER STEERING & DANA 26000# REAR AXLE W/REYCO
26000# 79KB SUSPENSION & FRAME REINFORCEMENT 3 

NA $16,472.002 $6,900.003

66K 3 GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
66000# GVWR UPGRADE, CONSISTING OF 20000# FRONT AXLE,
SPRINGS DUAL POWER STEERING & 46,000# REAR AXLE WITH
HENDRICKSON RT463 46000# SUSPENSION & DOUBLE FRAME. PLEASE
CONTACT DEALER TO CONFIRM ANY CHANGES. 3 

NA NA $22,500.003

46K 3 GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
46000# GVWR UPGRADE, CONSISTING OF 16000# FRONT AXLE,
SPRINGS & POWER STEERING & DANA 30000# REAR AXLE W/REYCO
31000# 79KB SUSPENSION & FRAME REINFORCEMENT 3 

NA NA $9,950.003

TRACTOR 3 GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
T370 H.D. TRACTOR PACKAGE, PX9-350, ALLISON 3000RDS, 4S/4M ASB
BRAKES W/ATC,SEMI-TRAILER BRAKES & ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS,
RSD-RATED BRAKES, 50,000# RATED FIFTH WHEEL, GVWR OF 35,000#,
CONSISTING OF 12000# FRONT AND 23000# REAR AXLES. GCWR OF
60000#. 3 

NA NA $16,981.003

TRACTOR2 3 GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
T440 X.H.D. TRACTOR PACKAGE,INCLUDING SEMI-TRAILER BRAKES &
ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS, RSD-RATED BRAKES, 50,000# RATED
FIFTH WHEEL, GVWR OF 35000#. CONSISTING OF 12000# FRONT AND
23000# REAR AXLES. GCWR OF 66000#. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER
FOR PRICING. 3 

NA NA $0.003

GT2000LG 1 
2KTUCK 2 
TE-20 3 

2,000 lb. lift gate 
2000# Waltco Liftgate Tuckaway  1 
2,000 lb Lift Gate - tuckaway  2 
MAXON 2000# LIFTGATE 3 

NA1 $3,929.002 $3,612.003

3K TUCK 2 
TE-33 3 

3,000 lb. lift gate 
3,000 lb Lift Gate - tuckaway 2 
MAXON 3300# LIFTGATE 3 

NA $4,239.002 $5,782.003

12 ton jack cab mounted, if available NA NA NA 
AC50K11 2 
6132DLHH-60KJ 3 

Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24"
bumper with crank outriggers, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 50K-11 Crane Body , Bumper, & Shelf kit  2 
KM-2 MECHANICS TRUCK, 11' CRANE BODY 3 

NA $26,722.002 $42,036.003

ACHC6 2 
EC6000 3 

Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support &
chassis springs, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane HC6  2 
STELLAR 6000# CRANE & BOOM SUPPORT 3 

NA $29,089.002 $21,247.003
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GTAUTOCRANE 1 
ACHYDRIGG 2 

Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 60k-22 24" bumper, manual outriggers  1 
Auto Crane hydraulic in-out / up-down outriggers  2 
PRICE UPON REQUEST 3 

$26,700.001 $4,232.002 $0.003

GTACHC7 1 
ACHC6 2 
HC-7X 3 

Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump,
boom support & chassis springs, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane HC7 hydraulic crane  1 
Auto Crane HC6 2 
AUTO CRANE HC-7X 30' HYDRAULIC BOOM, BOOM SUPPORT, MANUAL
OUTRIGGERS, SPRING KIT, PTO, PUMP, HOSES, OIL RESERVOIR,
RADIO REMOTE CONTROL. 3 

$29,800.001 $29,089.002 $36,777.003

GTACHC8 1 
AC8406 2 
HC-8 3 

Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump,
boom support & chassis springs, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane HC8 hydraulic crane  1 
Auto Crane 8406 Hyd Crane inc hotshift PTO  2 
AUTO CRANE HC-8 BOOM, BOOM SUPPORT, MANUAL OUTRIGGERS,
SPRING KIT TO LEVEL CHASSIS, PTO,PUMP, RESERVOIR W/OIL. 3 

$37,800.001 $32,564.002 $38,666.003

9090126 1 
9090126 2 
9090126 3 

Backup alarm - Factory Installed $98.001 $89.002 $86.003

DOBUA 1 
BUALARM 2 
BUA 3 

Backup alarm - Dealer Installed $250.001 $155.002 $225.003

BUC 1 
BU CAMERA 3 

Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide
wide angle field of vision at rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
NAVPLUS FOR BACK CAMERA INSTALLATION 3 

NA1 NA $2,175.003

BRUSHHAWG 1 
BUC 2 
1099301 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
C-Model Grapple Loader Body 30" Slewing Ring bearing 2 stage planetary
gear drive hotshift PTO direct mount pump 4-way adjustable stabilizers  1 
Dealer Installed Back Up Camera 2 
PRE-FILTER HOOD-MOUNTED FOR AIR CLEANER & HVAC 3 

$69,890.001 $1,370.002 $164.003

8879911 1 
5045295/5859011 2 
3630021 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Two Cab Corner and one rear stationary Windows 1 
Alum wheels-polished (per set of 2) 2 
KENWORTH AIRGLIDE 21K SUSP. 3 

$525.001 $726.002 $845.003

3630021 1 
Elliott L60R 2 
8879911 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Rear Suspensions: Kenworth Air Glide 210L 1 
L60R HiReach 63' working height 2 man work platform  2 
CAB CORNER WINDOWS 3 

$775.001 $145,348.002 $458.003

3632277 1 
Terex XTPRO 2 
3531000 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Rear Suspension: Hendrickson HAS230L 1 
Terex XTPRO 60 Forestry Unit w 12.5' Chip Body  2 
DRIVER-CONTROLLED DIFFERENTIAL LOCK,SINGLE AXLE ONLY. FOR
TANDEM AXLE, PLEASE CONTACT DEALER. 3 

$852.001 $117,901.002 $928.003
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DISUNL 1 
NEWAY 20REL 2 
TK130 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15% Discount off current MSRP for any non-specified options on the current
model listed. This discount does not apply to any other make or model.  1 
Neway Cobra 20yd REL  2 
130-PIECE TOOL KIT W/CASE 3 

Incl.1 $54,821.002 $65.003

UNPUBBOD 1 
HEIL 20REL 2 
1900996 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Unpublished bodies are available at cost plus 5% including fees  1 
Heil PT1000 20yd rear loader  2 
JUMP START TERMINALS UNDER HOOD 3 

Incl.1 $65,255.002 $139.003

Carahee 2 
8496559 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Heil/Carahee 13yd Rear Loader 2 
ORANGE (SAFETY) SEAT BELTS 3 

NA $53,841.002 $39.003

LOAD LEG REL 2 
K210 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Loadmaster Legacy3 20yd REL  2 
KLEIN 2100 GALLONS CAPACITY STEEL WATER TANK, INCLUDING
HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON
OPTIONS. 33000# GVWR REQUIRED. 3 

NA $55,080.002 $33,600.003

EZ A300 2 
K400 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
E-Z Pack Apollo A300C 20yd REL 2 
KLEIN 3950 GALLONS CAPACITY STEEL WATER TANK, INCLUDING
HOT SHIFT P.T.O. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER FOR SPECIAL ADD-ON
OPTIONS. 56000# GVWR REQUIRED 3 

NA $74,967.002 $43,200.003

Chagnon REL 2 
KTT 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Chagnon Hiker 20Cy REL Tracker 8CY REl = $58,102 2 
KTT 30' CUSTOM MOBILE COMMAND/OPERATIONS CENTER. FULL
DESCRIPTION UPON REQUEST. SUITABLE FOR BOTH LAW
ENFORCEMENT AND DISASTER RELIEF EFFORTS. INCLUDES 40600#
GVWR AND FULL PERSONNEL TRAINING AT KENTUCKY TRAILER
TECHNOLOGIES, WALLED LAKE, MI, HEADQUARTERS.  3 

NA $73,796.002 $274,500.003

TCM 42580DHE 2 
VT2500S 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Pro Patch TCM42580DHE Asphalt Pot Hole Patcher (Requires 35K GVW
Chassis)  2 
EAM CARBON STEEL VACUUM TANK, 2500 GALLONS CAPACITY,
INCLUDING P.T.O. AND ALL NECESSARY HARDWARE, INSTALLED.
REQUIRES 33000# GVWR 3 

NA $83,507.002 $45,224.003

ENPAC 2 
VT2500A 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Miller ENPAC Comp,Gen,Engine,Pump Welder Available with Service / Crane
Bodies  2 
EAM ALUMINUM VACUUM TANK, 2500 GALLONS CAPACITY,
INCLUDING P.T.O. AND ALL NECESSARY HARDWARE, INSTALLED.
REQUIRES 33000# GVWR 3 

NA $27,711.002 $52,323.003

ChipperBody 2 
CARD2500 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
14' Chipper Body 60" with 12" Removable Top  2 
EAM CARDINAL CLASSIC 2500 GALLONS CAPACITY FUEL TANK,
POLISHED ALUMINUM W/REAR CANOPY AND PUMP, P.T.O.,
INSTALLED. REQUIRES 33000# GVWR  3 

NA $19,142.002 $65,625.003
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Discount % 2 
CARD4000 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional
models bid. This discount ONLY applies to a downgrade or an upgrade to the
model listed in this specification. It does not apply to a completely different
make or model  2 
EAM CARDINAL CLASSIC 4000 GALLONS CAPACITY FUEL TANK,
POLISHED ALUMINUM W/REAR CANOPY AND PUMP, P.T.O.,
INSTALLED. REQUIRES 56000# GVWR  3 

NA Incl.2 $73,980.003

05UNPUB 2 
AMTHOR2 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost + 5% including fees  2 
EAM CARBON STEEL WATER TANK, 2000 GALLONS CAPACITY,
INCLUDES PUMP & INSTALLATION. REQUIRES 33000# GVWR 3 

NA Incl.2 $44,487.003

TT 1 Temporary tag Incl.1 Incl. NC 
DOTT 1 Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $79.751 Incl. $200.00 

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA Incl. $525.00 
9202808 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 

Warranty:Kenworth Base Vehicle Extended 5Yr/100k  2 
NA $730.002 NA 

9202809 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty:Kenworth Base Vehicle Extended 5yr/200k  2 

NA $1,008.002 NA 

9202878 2 Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty:Towing Coverage for warrantable failures 5 Years / Unlimited Miles
 2 

NA $1,451.002 NA 

9202622 1 
3000 5yr 2 
9202622  3 

Warranty - specify 
US Basic Vehicle Warranty 2yr/200,000 miles  1 
Allison 3000RDS-3yrs Std+2yrs {Refuse $910}Utility = 2500 5yr Same Pricing 
 2 
EXTENDED BEASE VEHICLE COVERAGE 2 YEARS/300,000 MILES 3 

$375.001 $529.002 $375.003

9202633 1 
9206535 2 
9202633 3 

Warranty - specify 
US Basic Vehicle Warranty 3yr/300,000 miles  1 
Engine CNG L9N PP1 5yr/150k  2 
EXTENDED BASE VEHICLE COVERAGE 3 YEARS/300,000 MILES 3 

$1,100.001 $2,519.002 $1,100.003

9202133 1 
9209647 2 
9202762 3 

Warranty - specify 
US Heater and Air Conditioner 3yr/300,000 miles  1 
Engine PX7 PP1 5yr/100,000 mile  2 
Air Conditioner 3Y/200,000 miles FOR OTHERS EXTENDED WARRANTY
CALL DEALER 3 

$200.001 $655.002 $125.003

5/2 PP1AT 1 
9209658 2 
9209645 9209656 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
PACCAR PX-7 PP1 and After treatment 5yr/200,000 miles  1 
After Treatment PX7 5yr/100,000 miles **MUST PURCHASE PP1
WARRANTY  2 
PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN 1 4 YEARS/150,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT FOR OTHERS EXTENDED WARRANTY CALL DEALER 3 

$1,850.001 $479.002 $1,275.003

5/25 PP1AT 1 
9209689 2 
9209649 9209660 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
PACCAR PX-7 PP1 and After treatment 5yr/250,000 miles  1 
Engine PX-9 PP1 5yr/100,000 miles  2 
PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN 1 5 YEARS/300,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT. FOR OTHERS EXTENDED WARRANTY CALL DEALER 3 

$2,250.001 $2,166.002 $1,850.003
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5/3 PP1AT  1 
9209707 2 
9209651 9209662 3 

Diesel Warranty - specify 
PACCAR PX-7 PP1 and After treatment 5yr/300,000 miles  1 
After Treatment PX9 5yr/100,000 miles **MUST PURCHASE PP1
WARRANTY  2 
PX-7 PROTECTION PLAN 1 5 YEARS/300,000 MILES WITH AFTER
TREATMENT. 3 

$2,350.001 $1,411.002 $2,350.003
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Kenworth T370

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Kenworth T370 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Gas engine in lieu of diesel 
Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify 
Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission 
Wheel seals 
AM/FM stereo radio 
Satellite radio 
On-Star 
Power Take Off (PTO) 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 
Delete Option - Specify 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Bi-fuel model - specify 
CNG prep - specify 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) 
Engine hour meter 
Trans oil temp meter 
Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended warranty) 
Premium hoses 
Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks 
Air dryers 
Moisture ejectors 
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Driver controlled differential lock 
Power windows, only 
Power windows/door locks 
Speed control 
Tilt steering wheel 
Telescopic and tilt steering wheel 
AM/FM radio with single CD 
Side air bags 

3K 1 Third key 1

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) 
Model upgrade - specify 
Model upgrade - specify 
Crew cab (84" CA) 
Super cab (84" CA) 
Cutaway cab 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed 
Vent visors - stick-on style 
Rainshields - flange style 
Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent 
Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors 
Airhorn 
Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles 
Front stabilizer bars 
Rear shock absorbers 
Auxiliary rear springs 
Heated fuel water separator 
Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) 
Trailer towing package - specify 
Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes 
Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes 
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Mud flaps 
Full size spare tire & rim 
Jack and wheel wrench 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire 
Daytime running lights 
Immobilize daytime running lights 
Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) 
Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent (requires 84"
CA) 
5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) 
12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) 
12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84" CA) 
14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA) 
14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108" CA) 
16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) 
16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA) 
18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138" CA) 
19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) 
20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156" CA) 
20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) 
24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) 
24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186" CA) 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Optional body - specify 
Powder coating for utility body 
108" cab to axle 
120" cab to axle 
138" cab to axle 
156" cab to axle 
180" cab to axle 
186" cab to axle 
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33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or approved
equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD 
33,000 GVWR 108" CA 
33,000 GVWR 120" CA 
33,000 GVWR 156" CA 
33,000 GVWR 180" CA 
33,000 GVWR 186" CA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify 
2,000 lb. lift gate 
3,000 lb. lift gate 
12 ton jack cab mounted, if available 
Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank outriggers, or
approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or approved
equivalent 
Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 
Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 
Backup alarm - Factory Installed 
Backup alarm - Dealer Installed 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at rear
of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
Optional equipment - specify 
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Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Optional equipment - specify 
Temporary tag 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Maintenance Plan - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
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