
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2 (Specification #13)
 
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Western $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Western $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Northern $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Northern $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Central $60,991.00
ALT - Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Hino 338 Central $63,808.00
Truckmax, Inc 2019 Hino 338 Southern $60,991.00
 2019 Hino 338 Southern -- NB --
 
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Western $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $47,500.00
ALT - Bozard Ford 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Northern $48,278.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Central $49,890.00
Palmetto Truck Center 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $47,500.00
ALT - Duval Ford LLC 2019 Ford F-750 (F7D) Southern $49,890.00
 
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Western $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Northern $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Central $40,499.00
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $35,750.00
ALT - Orlando Freightliner 2019 Freightliner M2 Southern $40,499.00
 
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Western $64,750.00
 2019 International MV Western -- NB --
Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Northern $63,750.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 13.pdf


 2019 International MV Northern -- NB --
Sun State International Trucks, LLC 2019 International MV Central $63,450.00
ALT - Maudlin International Trucks 2019 International MV Central $63,750.00
Rechtien International Trucks, Inc. 2019 International MV Southern $62,700.00
 2019 International MV Southern -- NB --
 
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Western $69,423.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Western -- NB --
Kenworth of Jacksonville 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern $69,173.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Northern -- NB --
Kenworth of Central Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Central $71,000.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Central -- NB --
Kenworth of South Florida 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern $71,923.00
 2019 Kenworth T370 Southern -- NB --
 
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Western $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Western -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Northern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Northern -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Central $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Central -- NB --
Nextran 2019 Mack MHD Southern $90,980.00
 2019 Mack MHD Southern -- NB --
 
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Western -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Northern -- NB --
Rush Truck Center - Tampa 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central $69,954.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Central -- NB --
Palm Truck Center 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern $71,042.00
 2019 Peterbilt 337 Southern -- NB --
 
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Western $72,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Western -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Northern -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Central $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Central -- NB --
Southport Truck Group 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern $73,440.00
 2019 Western Star 4700 Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Hino 338
The Hino 338 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model
and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options All Zones 
Gas engine in lieu of diesel NA 
Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify NA 
Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify NA 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission NA 
Wheel seals NA 
AM/FM stereo radio ($75.00) 
Satellite radio NA 
On-Star NA 
Power Take Off (PTO) NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 

 
Order Code Add Options All Zones 
PBFX 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 

ALLISON 3000RDS 1 
$4,611.001

PBFX35 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
ALLISON 3500RDS 1 

$4,520.001

ALT180A1BATZC 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
BRUSHLESS ALTENATOR(12V-180A)(REQUIRESS G31 BATTERY) W1 GROUP 31X3 (700 CCA.X3) 1 

$373.001

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Engine hour meter NA 
Trans oil temp meter NA 
Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended warranty) NA 
Premium hoses NA 

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



STD50X2 1 Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks 
DUAL 50 GALLON FUEL TANK 1 

$901.001

Air dryers Std 
Moisture ejectors Std 

RDLZA 1 Driver controlled differential lock $1,151.001

Power windows, only NA 
PWDLZA 1 Power windows/door locks 

POWER WINDOWS & POWER LOCKS 1 
$493.001

Speed control Std 
Tilt steering wheel Std 
Telescopic and tilt steering wheel Std 
AM/FM radio with single CD Std 
Side air bags NA 

3K 1 Third key $42.001

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Crew cab (84" CA) NA 
Super cab (84" CA) NA 
Cutaway cab NA 

D68AR 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
AIR RIDE SUSP3311011 - HENDRICKSON 1 

$1,937.001

SEARSVIN 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
VINYL (BLACK), UPGRADE DRIVER AND SIL IGLE PASSENGER 1 

$1,299.001

Z05XH 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
ALCOA POLISHED ALUMINUM WHEELS (ALL SIX WHEELS) 1 

$1,108.001

120K 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
120,000 PSI FRAME RAIL 1 

$795.001

VPIPE 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
VERTICAL EXAUST 1 

$1,208.001

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Vent visors - stick-on style NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA 
Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
SEE DEALER 1 

$0.001

Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent NA 
FNDMIRL0 1 Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors $274.001

AH 1 Airhorn $125.001

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



SK 1 Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles $112.001

Front stabilizer bars NA 
RSA 1 Rear shock absorbers $705.001

RSPRING 1 Auxiliary rear springs 
AUXILIARY RUBBER SPRING (REQUIRED AIR SUSPENSION) 1 

$309.001

Heated fuel water separator Std 
Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) NA 
Trailer towing package - specify NA 
Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes NA 
Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes NA 
Mud flaps 
SEE DEALER 1 

$0.001

Full size spare tire & rim NA 
Jack and wheel wrench NA 
Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 
Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights NA 
Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) NA 
Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent (requires
84" CA) 

NA 

5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) NA 
12X8SF40 1 12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) 

STEEL FLATBED 2-FT X 8-FT. 40'' STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4'' STRUCTUAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW, ICC
BUMPER, 3 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS, PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY TAPE
DOT APPROVED, 4 -INSIDE RAIL S, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (152 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$7,580.001

12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84" CA) NA 
14X8SF40 1 14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA) 

STEEL FLATBED 14-FT X 8-FT 40'' STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTURAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW,
ICC BUMPER, 3 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY
TAPE DOT APPROVED, 4-IN SIDE RAILS, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (175 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$8,190.001

14SLB 1 14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108" CA) 
STEEL FLATBED 14-FT X 8-FT 40'' STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTURAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW,
ICC BUMPER, 3 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY
TAPE DOT APPROVED, 4-IN SIDE RAILS, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (175 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$9,700.001

16X8SF40 1 16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) 
STEEL FLATBED 16-FT X 8-FT 40'' STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTUAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW, ICC
BUMPER, LIGHTS, 4 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, WINCH BAR,PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE
SAFETY TAPE DOT APPROVED. (187 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$9,000.001

16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120" CA) NA 
18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138" CA) NA 

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



20SR 1 19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) 
20' LONG X 102''JD GLOSS BLACK STEEL ROLLBACK, REMOVABLE RAILS, 8000LB WARN WINCH,
ADJUSTABLE HEADBOARD, 3500LBS IRL WHEELS LIFT WITH STEEL TUBULAR L-ARMS, BALL HITCH
MOUNTING PLATE, FEDERAL 22 HEAD LED AMBER LIGHTBAR, 11 GALLON PE MIN-HYDRAULIC PUMP 1 

$31,940.001

20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156" CA) NA 
20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) NA 

24' AVB 1 24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) 
24' ALUMINUM VANBODY / 102''WIDE / 103''HEIGHT/ HARDWOOD FLOOR/ SLAT LINING. REAR DOOR
OPENING 94''. (253 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$13,497.001

24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186" CA) NA 
MCF116DF 1 Optional body - specify 

16' X96''X85'' VANBODY HARDWOOD FLOOR/ SLAT LINING, REAR DOOR 88''WIDE OPENING. (187
WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$11,376.001

12X8SF 1 Optional body - specify 
STEEL FLATBED 12-FT X 8-FT NO STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTURAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW,
ICC BUMPER, 3 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY
TAPE DOT APPROVED, 4-IN SIDE RAILS, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (152 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$5,500.001

14X8SF 1 Optional body - specify 
STEEL FLATBED 14-FT X 8-FT NO STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTURAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW,
ICC BUMPER, 3 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY
TAPE DOT APPROVED, 4-IN SIDE RAILS, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (175 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$5,850.001

16X8SF 1 Optional body - specify 
STEEL FLATBED 16-FT X 8-FT NO STAKE SIDES 3/16 STEEL FLOOR DIAMOND PLATE, 7-IN MAINSILLS
GUSSETED, CROSSMENBERS 4''STRUCTURAL CHANNEL ON 12'' CENTER, BULKHEAD WITH WINDOW,
ICC BUMPER, 4 WINCHES STRAPS ON SLIDERS, LIGHTS PRIMED AND PAINTED, REFLECTIVE SAFETY
TAPE DOT APPROVED, 4-IN SIDE RAILS, STAKE POCKET, WINCH BAR. (187 WHEELBASE REQUIRED) 1 

$6,400.001

26'AVB 1 Optional body - specify 
26' ALUMINUM VANBODY/ 102''WIDE/ 103'' HEIGHT HARWOOD FLOOR/ SLAT LINING. REAR DOOR 94''
(271 WHEELBASE REQUIRED)  1 

$14,300.001

KNUCLEBOOM20Y 1 Optional body - specify 
KNUCKLE BOOM W 20 FT REACH. 18FT/20 YARD DUMP BODY STAND UP OPERATORS PLATFORM LEVER
STYLE OPERATOR CONTROLS LED LIGHTING & REAR CORNER POST STROBES BARN STYLE REAR
DOORS, 270 DEGREE BOOM ROTATION, CONTINUOUS GRAPPLE ROTATION ANTI SCALPING BUCKET.  1 

$66,247.001

ARMLESST 1 Optional body - specify 
ARMLEASS TARP SYSTEM (REQUIRED KNUCLEBOOM20Y) 1 

$1,500.001

HJOYSTICK 1 Optional body - specify 
HYDRAULIC JOYSTICK CONTROLS (REQUIRED KNUCLEBOOM20Y) 1 

$4,100.001

Powder coating for utility body NA 
108" cab to axle Std 
120" cab to axle Std 
138" cab to axle Std 
156" cab to axle Std 
180" cab to axle Std 
186" cab to axle Std 

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3000RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission (3500RDS), or
approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD NA 
33,000 GVWR 108" CA NA 
33,000 GVWR 120" CA NA 
33,000 GVWR 156" CA NA 
33,000 GVWR 180" CA NA 
33,000 GVWR 186" CA NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 

2500LG 1 2,000 lb. lift gate 
2500 LB. 50X84 1 

$5,100.001

3300LG 1 3,000 lb. lift gate 
3300 LB 50X84 1 

$5,400.001

12 ton jack cab mounted, if available NA 
Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank outriggers, or
approved equivalent 

NA 

Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or approved
equivalent 

NA 

Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent NA 
Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs,
or approved equivalent 

NA 

Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support & chassis springs,
or approved equivalent 

NA 

BUZ 1 Backup alarm - Factory Installed $125.001

BUZ 1 Backup alarm - Dealer Installed $125.001

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of vision at
rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 

NA 

Optional equipment - specify NA 
BUC 1 Optional equipment - specify 

BACKUP CAMERA - DEALER INSTALL 7'' TFT LCD DISPLAY DUAL INPUT MONITOR. HEAVY DUTY 1/4''
CCD COLOR BACKUP CAMERA, 130 DEGREE PERIPHERAL VIEW. IP 68 WATER PROOF 1 

$995.001

23K 1 Optional equipment - specify 
13.2 FRONT AXLE CAP / 23K REAR AXLE CAP / 120K FRAME 1 

$3,100.001

Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA 
Temporary tag NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) 
SEE DEALER - VARIES BY GVW 1 

NA1

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) 
SEE DEALER - VARIES BY GVW AND MONTH OF THE YEAR 1 

NA1

Maintenance Plan - specify 
SEE DEALER 1 

$0.001

Maintenance Plan - specify 
SEE DEALER 1 

$0.001

Maintenance Plan - specify 
SEE DEALER 1 

$0.001

WARRANTY_05 1 Warranty - specify 
BASE VEHICLE-24 MONTHS UNLIMITED MILEAGE 1 ENGINE 36 MONTHS UNLIMITED MILEAGE 1
ENGINE-60 MONTHS 250000 MIL EX!'' COVERAGE (INCLUDES INJECTORS, FUEL SUPPL PUMP AND
TURBO 1 

Std1

HWARCH_05 1 Warranty - specify 
HINO WATCH ROADSIDE ASSISTANCE-3 YEAR UNLIMITED ROADSIDE ASSISTANCE INCLUDING
LOCKOUT, *OUT OF FUEL /DEF, BATTERY JUMPSTART, INFORMATION AND WARRANTY TOWING (2
YEARS COVERAGE). 1 

Std1

Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 

VEHICLE: 338
DEALER: Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc Truckmax, Inc
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00 $60,991.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

30,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (DUAL REAR WHEEL) - 4X2
SPECIFICATION #13

2019 Hino 338

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Hino 338 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model
and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $63,808.00 $63,808.00 $63,808.00 -- No bid -- 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

Gas engine in lieu of diesel NA 
4040970 1 Provide 6 speed manual with base engine - specify NA1 

Provide 7 speed manual with base engine - specify NA 
Air brakes if compatible with transmission Std 
Wheel seals Std 
AM/FM stereo radio $300.00 
Satellite radio NA 
On-Star NA 
Power Take Off (PTO) Std 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 
Delete Option - Specify NA 

 

Order Code Add Options

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

PBGX35 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3500RDSP Transmission 1 

$4,068.001 

PBCX 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Allison 3000RDSP 1 

$4,068.001 

CLDC 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
COLD PACKAGE CHROME- BLOCK HEATER, SIDE POWER, HEATED CHROME MIRRORS 1 

$13,380.001 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 

ALT180AIBATZC 1 Engine/transmission upgrade - specify 
Brushless Alternator (12V-180A) (requires G31 battery) WI Group 31 X 3 (700 CCA.x 3) 1 

$628.001 

Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Engine/transmission upgrade - specify NA 
Bi-fuel model - specify NA 
CNG prep - specify NA 
CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA 
Engine hour meter Std 

VEHICLE: 338 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $63,808.00 $63,808.00 $63,808.00 -- No bid --



Trans oil temp meter 
Allison 1 

Std1 

Allison authorized synthetic oil, TES 295 or equivalent (required for extended
warranty) 

Std 

Premium hoses Std 
STD50X2 1 Dual 45 gallon fuel tanks $903.001 

Air dryers Std 
Moisture ejectors Std 

RDLZA 1 Driver controlled differential lock $1,058.001 
Power windows, only NA 

PWDL 1 Power windows/door locks $403.001 
Speed control Std 
Tilt steering wheel Std 
Telescopic and tilt steering wheel Std 
AM/FM radio with single CD Std 
Side air bags NA 

3K 1 
3K 2 

Third key $37.001 2

Upgrade to 4x4 (specify factory or after market) NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Model upgrade - specify NA 
Crew cab (84" CA) $0.00 
Super cab (84" CA) NA 
Cutaway cab $0.00 

D68AR 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Air Ride Suspe113i011 - Hendrickson 1 

$1,908.001 

SEARSVIN 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Vinyl (Black), upgrade driver and si11gle passenger seat 1 

$1,300.001 

Z05XH 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Alcoa polished aluminum wheels (all six wheels) 1 

$1,900.001 

120k 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
120,000psi Frame Rail 1 

$718.001 

VPIPE 1 Optional cab and chassis equipment - specify 
Vertical Exhaust 1 

$1,087.001 

Left-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer installed NA 
Left & right-hand pillar mounted 6" spotlight with clear halogen bulb, dealer
installed 

NA 

Vent visors - stick-on style NA 
Rainshields - flange style NA 

VEHICLE: 338 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $63,808.00 $63,808.00 $63,808.00 -- No bid --



Spray-in liner (Rhino, Line-X or approved equivalent) 
see dealer 1 

$0.001 

see dealer 1 Knapheide under body tool boxes or approved equivalent $0.001 
FNDMIRL0 1 Fender or cowl mounted convex mirrors $243.001 
HORZA 1 Airhorn $100.001 
SAFETYKIT-LO 1 Safety kit, fire extinguishers & triangles $100.001 

Front stabilizer bars NA 
RSA 1 Rear shock absorbers $350.001 
HSPRING 1 Auxiliary rear springs 

Auxiliary rubber spring (11a w!23K, DRT, Air Suspension) 1 
$168.001 

Heated fuel water separator Std 
4614810/4612810 1 Tractor brake package (30,000 GVWR only) 

A&E Connections WithHose Tenna, 12'A&E Lines Coiled & Two 7-Way Plugs and Trailer Hand
Valve. 1 

$594.001 

Trailer towing package - specify 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Trailer towing package for air operated trailer brakes 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Trailer towing package for electric operated trailer brakes 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Mud flaps 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Full size spare tire & rim 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Jack and wheel wrench 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA 
Daytime running lights Std 
Immobilize daytime running lights Incl. 

KNAPHEIDE 1 Knapheide 6132 utility body or approved equivalent (requires 84" CA) 
See Dealer for specs and pricing  1 

$19,350.001 

FA00082161 1 Heil 2-3 yd. dump body with manual ground control tarp or approved equivalent
(requires 84" CA) 

$14,680.001 

FA00082167 1 5 yd. dump with manual ground control tarp (requires 84" CA) $14,758.001 
FA00081865 1 12 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 84" CA) $8,319.001 
FA00081876 1 12 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 84"

CA) 
$15,781.001 

FA00081868 1 14 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 108" CA) $8,743.001 
FA00081876 1 14 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 108"

CA) 
$15,781.001 
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FA00081869 1 16 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 120" CA) $9,131.001 
FA00082160 1 16 ft. contractors dump with manual ground control tarp, 14" sides (requires 120"

CA) 
$16,037.001 

FA00081870 1 18 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 138" CA) $9,627.001 
Jerr-Dan 1 19 ft. rollback wrecker with wheel lift (requires 120" CA) 

Jerr-Dan See Dealer for Specs and Pricing 1 
$0.001 

FA00081871 1 20 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 156" CA) $9,645.001 
Dealer 1 20 ft. van roll up door (requires 156" CA) 

Morgan, Kidron, Supreme and American Commercial 1 
$9,512.001 

Dealer 1 24 ft. van roll up door (requires 186" CA) 
Morgan, Kidron, Supreme and American Commercial 1 

$10,427.001 

FA00081872 1 24 ft. flat stake body with 40" sides all around (requires 186" CA) $10,240.001 
Petersen Ind. 1 Optional body - specify 

Petersen Ind.MODEL TL3 BASE LOADER W/Standard 1824 body. Route Assistant, Quad-sticks and
HDX bodies available see dealer for specs and pricing 1 

$62,006.001 

Pac-Mac KB20 1 Optional body - specify 
Standard 2018-19 Pac-Mac KB20 1824HJ HDX body and other options available see dealer for specs
and pricing  1 

$66,056.001 

SSES 1 Optional body - specify 
New Way Viper 20RL, New Way Viper 13RL Rear Loader deduct -$3,576.00 see dealer for optional
equipment and specs  1 

$51,714.001 

SSES 1 Optional body - specify 
New Way Cobra 20RL Rear Loader Refuse Body 1 

$53,413.001 

SSES 1 Optional body - specify 
Brush Hawg C-Model Grapple Loader Body 1 

$69,890.001 

Heil 1 Optional body - specify 
Heil PT 1000 20yd, Carahee 9yd REL $52,440.00 see dealer for additional options and pricing 1 

$63,769.001 

WEP 1 Optional body - specify 
E-Z PACK APOLLO A300C 20YD REAR LOADER, Chagnon Hiker Rear Loader 20yd $72,247.00  1 

$73,409.001 

WEP 1 Optional body - specify 
Galbreath Loaded Container Carrier with Rotator (SLCH), GALBREATH CH8000 CONTAINER
HANDLER WITH ROTATOR Deduct -$4,353.00 1 

$37,858.001 

Powder coating for utility body 
See Dealer 1 

$0.001 

108" cab to axle NC 
120" cab to axle NC 
138" cab to axle NC 
156" cab to axle NC 
180" cab to axle NC 
186" cab to axle NC 
33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission
(3000RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 
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33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 5 speed automatic transmission
(3500RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission
(3000RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 

NA 

33,000 GVWR Pck. - minimum 230 HP, 6 speed automatic transmission
(3500RDS), or approved equivalent - see optional wheelbase prices 
FAG06/R21-529AT 1 

$10,759.001 

33,000 GVWR factory approved 4WD NA 
33,000 GVWR 108" CA $250.00 
33,000 GVWR 120" CA $250.00 
33,000 GVWR 156" CA $250.00 
33,000 GVWR 180" CA $250.00 
33,000 GVWR 186" CA $250.00 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 
GVWR and CA upgrade - specify NA 

Heil 1 2,000 lb. lift gate $6,875.001 
Heil 1 3,000 lb. lift gate $7,315.001 

12 ton jack cab mounted, if available NA 
Auto Crane 50K-22 crane body with shelf package, 24" bumper with crank
outriggers, or approved equivalent 
See dealer for specs and pricing Auto Crane, STAHL and Steller bodies available along with Wielders
and Compressors.  1 

$0.001 

Auto Crane 6006EH electric hydraulic crane, boom support & chassis springs, or
approved equivalent 
See dealer for specs and pricing Auto Crane, STAHL and Steller bodies available along with Wielders
and Compressors.  1 

$0.001 

Auto Crane hydraulic outriggers, or approved equivalent 
See dealer for specs and pricing Auto Crane, STAHL and Steller bodies available along with Wielders
and Compressors.  1 

$0.001 

Auto Crane 6406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support &
chassis springs, or approved equivalent 
See dealer for specs and pricing Auto Crane, STAHL and Steller bodies available along with Wielders
and Compressors.  1 

$0.001 

VEHICLE: 338 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa Rush Truck Center - Tampa
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $63,808.00 $63,808.00 $63,808.00 -- No bid --



Auto Crane 8406 hydraulic crane, reservoir, PTO and pump, boom support &
chassis springs, or approved equivalent 
See dealer for specs and pricing Auto Crane, STAHL and Steller bodies available along with Wielders
and Compressors.  1 

$0.001 

BUA 1 Backup alarm - Factory Installed $112.001 
Backup alarm - Dealer Installed Incl. 
Backup camera with 3.5" LCD (rear mounted camera to provide wide angle field of
vision at rear of vehicle) - Factory Installed 
See dealer 1 

$0.001 

TCB 1 Optional equipment - specify 
40T or 25T Pintle pkg (including 1"plate,pintle and D-ringa) •Air liiU!.f and electric supplied by
dealer 1 

$1,550.001 

Container Systems 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Loadmaster Legacy 3-20 yd Renr Loader 18yd deduct -$230.00 26yd deduct $410.00 See dealer for 1 

$53,270.001 

Heil 1 Optional equipment - specify 
American 8000 lb Container Carrier 360 Rotator 1 

$33,873.001 

Discount 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Heil, Loadmaster, Pac-Mac, McNeilus, Labrie, New Way, EZ-Pack, Galbreath, Petersen Ind. GAR-P
Ledwell, Pikrite, Palfinger, Jerr-Dan and others available see dealer for specs and pricing. 1 

$0.001 

Discount 1 Optional equipment - specify 
15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any optional models bid. Discount applies
to a downgrade or an upgrade to Spec #13 only. 1 

$0.001 

UPB 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost plus FSA Fees. 1 

$0.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Palfinger M100L72 Hydraulic Loader Dual Stand Up Controls, 28 Yard Dump Body/ Single Door/ Hoist,
Auto Electric Tarp, 42" Bakker refuse grapple, 18" x 18" x 36" Underbody Tool Box, 4 Corner Corner
Strobe Light. 1 

$102,844.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Terex XTPRO 60 Forestry Unit (With Recommended Chassis Spec) 138" CA/33,000 GVWR 12,000
Front, 21,000 Rear 12 1/2' Chip Body with 4 Door Thru Box assembly 1 

$115,523.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Terex TC55 Optima Material Handler  1 

$156,910.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Terex TL50 Material Handler, Telescopic 1 

$159,401.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Terex LT40 Aerial - Telescopic 1 

$89,687.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
Terex C4047 TM Digger Derrick 1 

$181,981.001 

Pac-Mac 1 Optional equipment - specify 
KB20 1824HJ Grapple Loader 1 

$66,056.001 

Ring Power 1 Optional equipment - specify 
ARO ACC-80 Container Carrier 1 

$43,889.001 

Optional equipment - specify NA 
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Temporary tag Incl. 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) Incl. 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) Incl. 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 
Maintenance Plan - specify NA 

Allison 1 Warranty - specify 
Allison Transmission 60 month 1 

$928.001 

WARRANTY_05 1 Warranty - specify 
BASE VEHICLE- 24 MONTHS UNliMITED MILEAGE I ENGINE 36 MONTHS UNLIMITED
MILEAGE I ENGINE - 60 MONTHS, 250000 MIL EX!' COVERAGE (INCLUDES INJECTORS, FUEL
SUPPL PUMP AND TURBO1 1 

Std1 

HWATCH_05 1 Warranty - specify 
Hino Watch Roadside Assistance - 3-year unlimited roadside assistance including lockout, *out of
fuel/DEF, battery jumpstart, information, and warranty towing (2 year coverage). 1 

Std1 

Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify NA 
Diesel Warranty - specify 
0 1 

NA1 
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