
FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone Base Unit
Price

SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY (Specification #31)
 
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat T740 Western $49,781.10
 2019 Bobcat T740 Western -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat T740 Northern $49,781.10
 2019 Bobcat T740 Northern -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat T740 Central $49,781.10
 2019 Bobcat T740 Central -- NB --
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat T740 Southern $49,781.10
 2019 Bobcat T740 Southern -- NB --
 
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case TR310 Western $43,545.00
 2019 Case TR310 Western -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case TR310 Northern $41,472.00
 2019 Case TR310 Northern -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case TR310 Central $41,472.00
 2019 Case TR310 Central -- NB --
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case TR310 Southern $41,472.00
 2019 Case TR310 Southern -- NB --
 
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 279D Western $55,907.00
 2019 Caterpillar 279D Western -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 279D Northern $55,907.00
 2019 Caterpillar 279D Northern -- NB --
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 279D Central $55,907.00
 2019 Caterpillar 279D Central -- NB --
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Caterpillar 279D Southern $52,748.00
 2019 Caterpillar 279D Southern -- NB --
 
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 331G Western $54,275.00
 2019 John Deere 331G Western -- NB --
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 331G Northern $54,275.00

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 31.pdf


 2019 John Deere 331G Northern -- NB --
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 John Deere 331G Central $52,490.00
ALT - Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 331G Central $52,585.00
Everglades Equipment Group 2019 John Deere 331G Southern $52,490.00
ALT - Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 331G Southern $52,585.00
 
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Western $39,450.00
 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Western -- NB --
Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Northern $37,948.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Northern $39,250.00
Futch's Tractor Depot 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Central $37,948.00
ALT - Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Central $39,250.00
Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Southern $39,350.00
ALT - Creel Tractor 2019 Kubota SVL75-2 Southern $40,188.00
 
Cowin Equipment 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Western $68,630.00
 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Western -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Northern $68,000.00
 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Northern -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Central $68,000.00
 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Central -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Southern $68,000.00
 2019 Takeuchi TL12 Southern -- NB --
 
Cowin Equipment 2019 Volvo MCT135D Western $54,636.00
 2019 Volvo MCT135D Western -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo MCT135D Northern $55,000.00
 2019 Volvo MCT135D Northern -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo MCT135D Central $55,000.00
 2019 Volvo MCT135D Central -- NB --
Flagler ConstructionEquipment 2019 Volvo MCT135D Southern $55,000.00
 2019 Volvo MCT135D Southern -- NB --



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #31

2019 Kubota SVL75-2
The Kubota SVL75-2 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: $39,450.00 $37,948.00 $37,948.00 $39,350.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options
Western
& Southern

Northern
& Central

Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 
Optional equipment - specify NA NA 

 

Order Code Add Options
Western
& Southern

Northern
& Central

SVL75-2HF 1 
SVL75-2W 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
12.6 RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW
HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER, STANDARD 68" BUCKET. *SVL75-2HFC-12.6"
RUBBER TRACKS, AC ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH , FLOW
HYDRAULICS, MF GRIP & 14-PIN COUPLER: $10,080.00 1 
UPGRADE TO 15 INCH WIDE TRACK VERSION WITH LESS OVERALL GROUND PRESSURE AND
MORE STABILITY  2 

$6,156.001 $6,700.002

SVL75-2W 1 
SVL75-2C 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB,MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 74"
BUCKET. *SVL75-2FW- 15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK
COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER: $6,150.00  1 
A/C CAB VERSION OF BASE SPEC 2 

$4,825.001 $8,952.002

SVL75-2HW 1 
SVL75-2WC 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0 RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 74"
BUCKET. *SVL75-2HFW-15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB HYDRAULIC QUICK
COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER,STANDARD 74" BUCKET:
$7,250.00  1 
UPGRADE TO WIDE TRACK / A/C CAB VERSION OF BASE SPEC 2 

$5,950.001 $10,319.002

SVL75-2HWC 1 
SVL75-2HWC 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0" RUBBER TRACKS A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 74"
BUCKET. *SVL75-2HFWC-15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK
COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER: $11,215.00  1 
UPGRADE TO WIDE TRAC / A/C CAB / HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER SO OPERATOR DOES NOT
HAVE TO CLIMB IN AND OUT WHILE CHANGING IMPLEMENTS SAVING TIME AND INJURY
POSSIBILITY. 2 

$9,875.001 $11,219.002

SVL95-2S 1 
SVL75-2HFWC 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
MODEL UPGRADE: KUBOTA TIER 4 DIESEL 94.0 HP./17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS
CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH BOCE. *SVL95-2SH 17.7"
RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 80"
BUCKET WITH BOCE: $16,050.00 1 
UPGRADE TO HIGH FLOW /WIDE TRAC / A/C CAB / HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER SO
OPERATOR DOES NOT HAVE TO CLIMB IN AND OUT WHILE CHANGING IMPLEMENTS SAVING
TIME AND INJURY POSSIBILITY.  2 

$15,060.001 $12,719.002

VEHICLE: SVL75-2
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Futch's Tractor Depot Futch's Tractor Depot Ridge Equipment Co., Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $39,450.00 $37,948.00 $37,948.00 $39,350.00



SVL95-2SF 1 
SVL95 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOBS CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW
AUXILLARY HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14 PIN COUPLERN STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH BOCE.
*SVL95-2SHF- 17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB , HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER,
HIGH FLOW AUXILIARY HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER,STANDARD 80" BUCKET
WITH BOCE: $18,130.00  1 
UP GRADE TO 95 HORSE POWER ENGINE TO ALL MODELS 2 

$17,145.001 $16,915.002

SVL95-2SHC 1 
PROTECTIVE
DOOR 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 80"
BUCKET WITH BOCE. *SVL95-2SHFC-17.7" RUBBER TRACKS,A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC
QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW AUXILLARY HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER:
$21,880.00  1 
SPECIAL APPLICATION DOOR AND MOUNTING FOR PROTECTIVE USE WHEN USING
HYDRAULIC BREAKERS AND MULCHERS TO PROTECT OCCUPANT INSTALLED S6698/S6658 2 

$19,795.001 $3,498.002

KXB560Q 1 
S6676 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
HYDRAULIC BREAKER-INCLUDES MANUAL, SIDE PLATES, ONE MOIL POINT,ONE CHISEL
POINT, REQUIRED HYDRAULIC BREAKER HOSE KIT, HYDRAULIC BREAKER BRACKET, AND
SPECIAL APPLICATION DOOR FOR CAB/ROPS MODELS.  1 
STROBE LIGHT INSTALLED 2 

$17,896.001 $399.002

AP-SC7072 1 
S6679 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE FRONT MOUNT CUTTER WITH 7" CUTTING CAPACITY. SKID STEER
QUICK ATTACH. SVL95 ONLY.  1 
AIR RIDE SUSPENSION SEAT INSTALLED 2 

$13,063.001 $749.002

AP-AB84 1 
GRAPPLE 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 84" SWEEPING WIDTH ANGLE BROOM.  1 
AP-RG3068 68 IN ROOT GRAPPLE 2 

$6,999.001 $3,272.002

AP-PFL5548-93 1 
ANGLE
BROOM 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 48" 5500LBS PALLET FORKS. *AP-PFL5560-93 60" 5500LBS PALLET
FORKS: 1459  1 
72 IN ANGLE BROOM WITH MANUAL ANGLE 2 

$1,149.001 $5,369.002

AP-SGC2084 1 
POLE HOLE
DIGGER 2 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 84" CLAW GRAPPLE 1 
APSA2005 WITH 9 INCH BIT 2 

$5,159.001 $2,559.002

AP-SSG2524 1 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE STUMP GRINDER. 24" DIAMETER CUTTING WHEEL. 1 

$6,289.001 NA 

AP-STP25  1 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE TREE/POST PULLER. 1 

$1,936.001 NA 

AP-SA20-05 1 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE HYDRAULIC POST HOLE DIGGER WITH 12" DOUBLE FLIGHT AUGER.
*AUGER AVAILABLE FROM 6" TO 36". CONTACT DEALER FOR FITMENT AND PRICING.  1 

$2,739.001 NA 

AP-SRT76-50 1 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE HIGH FLOW SKID TILLER. 1 

$6,419.001 NA 

S6699 1 Optional equipment - specify 
STROBE LIGHT KIT INCLUDING S6676 WIRE HARNESS. FITS ALL MODELS. 1 

$244.001 NA 

S6678 1 Optional equipment - specify 
ROTATING LED BEACON LIGHT KIT INCLUDES WIRING HARNESS. FITS ALL MODELS. 1 

$414.001 NA 

VEHICLE: SVL75-2
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Futch's Tractor Depot Futch's Tractor Depot Ridge Equipment Co., Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $39,450.00 $37,948.00 $37,948.00 $39,350.00



S6679 1 Optional equipment - specify 
AIR SUSPENSION SEAT. FITS ALL MODELS. 1 

$529.001 NA 

77700-04757 1 Optional equipment - specify 
JENSEN AM/FM,WEATHER BAND,IPOD,BLUETOOTH RADIO PACKAGE. CAB MODELS ONLY 1 

$399.001 NA 

Temporary tag NA NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA NA 
Maintenance Plan – specify NA NA 
Maintenance Plan – specify NA NA 

3RD YEAR
EXTENDED
WARRANTY 2 

Warranty - specify 
24 MONTHS OR 2000 HOURS WHICHEVER OCCURS FIRST. 1 
COVER SAME AS BASIC ADDS 1 YEAR AND 1000 HRS 2 

Std1 $950.002

4TH YEAR
EXTENDED 2 

Warranty - specify 
ADDS 2 YEARS AND 2000 HRS 2 

NA $4,500.002

% Discount 1 
1% Discount 2 

Discount percentage off Manufacturers Current Published Retail prices for
non-specified options and any optional models bid. This discount ONLY APPLIES
to a downgrade or an upgrade to the model listed in this specification. It does not
apply to a completely different make or model. (The discount is applied to the
manufacturer's current published retail prices.) 

NA1 Std2

VEHICLE: SVL75-2
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Futch's Tractor Depot Futch's Tractor Depot Ridge Equipment Co., Inc.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $39,450.00 $37,948.00 $37,948.00 $39,350.00



FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LB OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #31

2019 Kubota SVL75-2

(Alternate Dealer Option)
The Kubota SVL75-2 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern 
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $39,250.00 $39,250.00 $40,188.00 

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

 



Order Code Delete Options Western
Northern
& Central Southern

SVL75-2H 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Hyd Coupler 3 

NA $1,700.003

SVL75-2W 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Wide Track Option 15" Wide Track 3 

NA $1,700.003

SVL75-2HW 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Hyd Coupler and Wide Track Option 3 

NA $3,000.003

SVL75-2C 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Cab A/C 3 

NA $5,300.003

SVL75-2HC 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Hyd Coupler and A/C Cab 3 

NA $6,600.003

SVL75-2WC 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Wide Track and A/C Cab 3 

NA $6,600.003

SVL75-2HWC 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Hyd Coupler Wide Track and A/C Cab 3 

NA $8,000.003

SVL75-2FW 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Wide Track Option and High Flow 29GPM 3 

NA $3,150.003

SVL75-2HFW 3 Optional equipment - specify 
Wide Track, Hyd Coupler and High Flow Option 29GPM 3 

NA $4,500.003

SVL75-2HFC 3 Optional equipment - specify 
A/C Cab Hyd Coupler and High Flow 29GPM 3 

NA $8,000.003

 

Order Code Add Options Western
Northern
& Central Southern

SVL75-2HF 2 
SVL75-2FWC 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
12.6 RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH
FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER, STANDARD 68" BUCKET.
*SVL75-2HFC-12.6" RUBBER TRACKS, AC ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK
COUPLER, HIGH , FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIP & 14-PIN COUPLER: $10,080.00 2 
A/C Cab Wide Track and High Flow Option 29GPM 3 

$6,156.002 $8,000.003

SVL75-2W 2 
SVL75-2HFWC 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB,MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER,
STANDARD 74" BUCKET. *SVL75-2FW- 15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS
CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS &
14-PIN COUPLER: $6,150.00  2 
A/C Cab Wide Track, Hyd Coupler and High Flow 29GPM 3 

$4,825.002 $9,700.003

SVL75-2HW 2 
AP-74LLC 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0 RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER,
STANDARD 74" BUCKET. *SVL75-2HFW-15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS
CAB HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN
COUPLER,STANDARD 74" BUCKET: $7,250.00 2 
74" Low Profile Long Floor Bucket 3 

$5,950.002 $1,810.003

VEHICLE: SVL75-2 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Creel Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $39,250.00 $39,250.00 $40,188.00



SVL75-2HWC 2 
KXB560Q 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
15.0" RUBBER TRACKS A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER,
STANDARD 74" BUCKET. *SVL75-2HFWC-15.0" RUBBER TRACKS, A/C ROPS/FOPS
CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN
COUPLER: $11,215.00  2 
Hyd Breaker, Also requires a S6693A Hose Kit, S6692A Mount Bracket and S6698 Special
Application Door 3 

$9,875.002 $12,200.003

SVL95-2S 2 
S6693A 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
MODEL UPGRADE: KUBOTA TIER 4 DIESEL 94.0 HP./17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN
ROPS/FOPS CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH
BOCE. *SVL95-2SH 17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC
QUICK COUPLER, STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH BOCE: $16,050.00 2 
Hose Kit 3 

$15,060.002 $630.003

SVL95-2SF 2 
S6692A 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOBS CAB, MECHANICAL QUICK COUPLER,
HIGH FLOW AUXILLARY HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14 PIN COUPLERN STANDARD
80" BUCKET WITH BOCE. *SVL95-2SHF- 17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, OPEN ROPS/FOPS
CAB , HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW AUXILIARY HYDRAULICS, MF
GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER,STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH BOCE: $18,130.00  2 
Mount Kit 3 

$17,145.002 $1,300.003

SVL95-2SHC 2 
S6698 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
17.7" RUBBER TRACKS, A/C ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER,
STANDARD 80" BUCKET WITH BOCE. *SVL95-2SHFC-17.7" RUBBER TRACKS,A/C
ROPS/FOPS CAB, HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLER, HIGH FLOW AUXILLARY
HYDRAULICS, MF GRIPS & 14-PIN COUPLER: $21,880.00  2 
Special Application Door 3 

$19,795.002 $3,300.003

KXB560Q 2 
K9926 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
HYDRAULIC BREAKER-INCLUDES MANUAL, SIDE PLATES, ONE MOIL POINT,ONE
CHISEL POINT, REQUIRED HYDRAULIC BREAKER HOSE KIT, HYDRAULIC BREAKER
BRACKET, AND SPECIAL APPLICATION DOOR FOR CAB/ROPS MODELS.  2 
Retractable Seat Belt 3" Wide 3 

$17,896.002 $80.003

AP-SC7072 2 
S6676 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE FRONT MOUNT CUTTER WITH 7" CUTTING CAPACITY.
SKID STEER QUICK ATTACH. SVL95 ONLY.  2 
Strobe Light Kit, S6680 wiring Kit also required 3 

$13,063.002 $200.003

AP-AB84 2 
S6680 3 

Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 84" SWEEPING WIDTH ANGLE BROOM.  2 
Wiring Kit 3 

$6,999.002 $41.003

AP-PFL5548-93 2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 48" 5500LBS PALLET FORKS. *AP-PFL5560-93 60" 5500LBS
PALLET FORKS: 1459  2 

$1,149.002 NA 

AP-SGC2084 2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE 84" CLAW GRAPPLE 2 

$5,159.002 NA 

AP-SSG2524 2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE STUMP GRINDER. 24" DIAMETER CUTTING WHEEL. 2 

$6,289.002 NA 

AP-STP25  2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE TREE/POST PULLER. 2 

$1,936.002 NA 

VEHICLE: SVL75-2 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Creel Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $39,250.00 $39,250.00 $40,188.00



AP-SA20-05 2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE HYDRAULIC POST HOLE DIGGER WITH 12" DOUBLE FLIGHT
AUGER. *AUGER AVAILABLE FROM 6" TO 36". CONTACT DEALER FOR FITMENT AND
PRICING.  2 

$2,739.002 NA 

AP-SRT76-50 2 Optional equipment - specify 
KUBOTA/LAND PRIDE CE HIGH FLOW SKID TILLER. 2 

$6,419.002 NA 

S6699 2 Optional equipment - specify 
STROBE LIGHT KIT INCLUDING S6676 WIRE HARNESS. FITS ALL MODELS. 2 

$244.002 NA 

S6678 2 Optional equipment - specify 
ROTATING LED BEACON LIGHT KIT INCLUDES WIRING HARNESS. FITS ALL
MODELS. 2 

$414.002 NA 

S6679 2 Optional equipment - specify 
AIR SUSPENSION SEAT. FITS ALL MODELS. 2 

$529.002 NA 

77700-04757 2 Optional equipment - specify 
JENSEN AM/FM,WEATHER BAND,IPOD,BLUETOOTH RADIO PACKAGE. CAB MODELS
ONLY 2 

$399.002 NA 

Temporary tag NA NA 
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) NA NA 
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA NA 
Maintenance Plan – specify NA NA 
Maintenance Plan – specify NA NA 
Warranty - specify 
24 MONTHS OR 2000 HOURS WHICHEVER OCCURS FIRST. 2 
2 Year 3 

Std2 Incl.3

Warranty - specify NA NA 
% Discount 1 
% Discount 2 
5% Discount 3 

Discount percentage off Manufacturers Current Published Retail prices for
non-specified options and any optional models bid. This discount ONLY
APPLIES to a downgrade or an upgrade to the model listed in this
specification. It does not apply to a completely different make or model.
(The discount is applied to the manufacturer's current published retail
prices.) 

1 NA2 Incl.3

VEHICLE: SVL75-2 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER: Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Ridge Equipment Co., Inc. Creel Tractor
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- $39,250.00 $39,250.00 $40,188.00




