Name of Dealership

Type of Vehicle

FLORIDA

ASSOCIATION OF

COUNTIES
—_—
All About Florida

FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

Zone

SKID STEER LOADER - 2800 LB OPERATING CAPACITY WHEELED ONLY (Specification #30

Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat A770 Western
2019 Bobcat A770 Western
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat A770 Northern
2019 Bobcat A770 Northern
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat A770 Central
2019 Bobcat A770 Central
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat A770 Southern
2019 Bobcat A770 Southern
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat S770 Western
2019 Bobcat S770 Western
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat S770 Northern
2019 Bobcat S770 Northern
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat S770 Central
2019 Bobcat S770 Central
Bobcat Company 2019 Bobcat S770 Southern
2019 Bobcat S770 Southern
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case SV340 Western
2019 Case SV340 Western
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case SV340 Northern
2019 Case SV340 Northern
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case SV340 Central
2019 Case SV340 Central
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case SV340 Southern
2019 Case SV340 Southern
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 272D Western
2019 Caterpillar 272D Western
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar 272D Northern

Base Unit
Price

$56,171.70
- NB --
$56,171.70
- NB --
$56,171.70
—-NB --
$56,171.70
- NB --

$46,401.60
- NB --
$46,401.60
- NB --
$46,401.60
—-NB --
$46,401.60
- NB --

$50,246.00
- NB --
$47,854.00
- NB --
$47,854.00
—-NB --
$47,854.00
- NB --

$48,667.00
—-NB --
$48,667.00


https://veba.flsheriffs.org/docs/FSA18-VEH16.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Heavy Equipment Award Spec 30.pdf

Ring Power Corporation

Kelly Tractor Co

Dobbs Equipment LLC

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Everglades Equipment Group
ALT - Dobbs Equipment LLC
Everglades Equipment Group
ALT - Dobbs Equipment LLC
Cowin Equipment

Flagler ConstructionEquipment

Flagler ConstructionEquipment

Flagler ConstructionEquipment

2019 Caterpillar 272D
2019 Caterpillar 272D
2019 Caterpillar 272D
2019 Caterpillar 272D
2019 Caterpillar 272D

2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G
2019 John Deere 330G

2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D
2019 Volvo MC 135D

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
* Central
Central

* Southern

Southern

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

- NB --
$48,667.00
- NB --
$46,727.00
—-NB --

$44,075.00

--NB --
$44,075.00

--NB --
$41,990.00
$42,650.00
$41,990.00
$42,650.00

$41,252.00
--NB --
$42,250.00
--NB --
$42,250.00
--NB --
$42,250.00
--NB --
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SKID STEER LOADER - 2800 LB OPERATING CAPACITY WHEELED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #30

2019 John Deere 330G

The John Deere 330G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $44,075.00 $44,075.00 $41,990.00 $41,990.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code

JD 320G !
3202

D 324G !
3242

Non-Specified Option
Discount 25% !

Order Code

JD 332G !
332 2

8060 !
CAB/AC 2

5204 !
HI-FLOW 2

3002 !
RIDE CTRL >

3100 !
REV. FAN 2

6501 !

QWIK-TACH 2

029KV !
CAM 2

330G
Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC
Western Northern
$44,075.00 $44,075.00
Delete Options

Optional equipment - specify
Downgrade to John Deere model 320G 1
DOWNGRADE TO JOHN DEERE 320G 2

Optional equipment - specify
Downgrade to John Deere model 324G 1

DOWNGRADE TO JOHN DEERE 324G 2
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will
be applied to all non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and

optional models.

Add Options

Optional equipment - specify
Upgrade to John Deere model 332G 1
UPGRADE TO JOHN DEERE 332G 2

Optional equipment - specify
Engine pre-cleaner
ENCLOSED CAB WITH AIR CONDITIONING 2

Optional equipment - specify

Enclosed cab with air conditioning 1
HIGH-FLOW HYDRAULICS 2

Optional equipment - specify
High-flow hydraulics 1
RIDE CONTROL 2

Optional ec}uipment - specify
Ride control
REVERSING FAN DRIVE 2

Optional equipment - specify

Reversing fan drive
POWER QUICK-ATTACH BUCKET COUPLER SYSTEM 2

Optional equipment - specify
GT80 Tined grapple 1
IN CAB REAR VIEW CAMERA 2

Everglades Equipment
Group

% Central
$41,990.00

Everglades Equipment
Group

* Southern
$41,990.00

Western Central
& Northern & Southern

$10,985.00"  (89,500.00)°

$7,860.00" | ($6,000.00)°

NA NA

NA NA

NA NA

NA NA

NA NA

NA NA

NA NA

NA! NA
Western Central

& Northern & Southern

$2,600.00"  $5,000.00°

$346.00" | $4,175.00°

$3,400.00"  $1,700.00°

$1,391.00" ' $1,150.00°

$960.00'  $760.00°

$646.00' ' $680.00°

$4,593.000  $820.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

OASOT !
WEIGHT >

8075 !
SVR DOOR ?

5001 !
AUGER 2

8042 !
P-BROOM >

5550 !
A-BROOM 2

0102K'V/1002/9000 '
BACKHOE 2

1520T !
S-GRAPPLE >

0302KV/AT394637 !
T-GRAPPLE 2

7500T/1006/9501/3000 !
MP BKT 2

03J1T/1001 !
FORKS >

9790T/AT394637 '
BLADE 2

8231T/AT348477 !
CPLANER 2

Non-Specified Option
Discount 25% |
DISCOUNT ?

330G

Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Everglades Equipment
Group

Western Northern % Central

$44,075.00 $44,075.00 $41,990.00

Optional equipment - specify
MP78B Multi-purpose bucket
COUNTERWEIGHTS, PRICED PER PAIR 2

Optional equipment - specify
Hazard warning lights
SEVERE DUTY CAB DOOR-AT438266 AND HARDWARE KIT 2

Optional equipment - specify
Powered quick-attach bucket coupler
PA30 AUGER DRIVE WITH 4" AUGER BIT 2

Optional equipment - specify
Rear view camera
BR72 PICK UP BROOM ATTACHMENT 2

Optional equipment - specify
Deluxe LED light package

BA84 ANGLE BROOM ATTACHMENT 2

Optional equipment - s[l)ecify
PA30B Auger drive with bit
BHI1 BACKHOE ATTACHMENT WITH BUCKET 2

Optional equipment - specify
BR72 72" pickup broom 1
GS78 SCRAP GRAPPLE 2

Optional equipment - specify
BA84 84" Angle broom 1

GT80 TINED GRAPPLE 2

Optional equipment - specify
BH11 Backhoe attachment with bucket 1
MP78B MULTI-PURPOSE BUCKET 2

Optional equipment - specify
45" Fork frame with 42" fork tines, quick-attach 1
48" RAIL PALLET FORKS 2

Optional equipment - specify
DBY6 96" Dozer blade |
DBY96 96" DOZER BLADE ATTACHMENT 2

Optional equipment - specify
24" Cold planer attachment with controls 1
24" COLD PLANER ATTACHMENT WITH CONTROLS 2

Optional equipment - specify

Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will
be applied to all non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and

optional models.

15% DISCOUNT OFF MSRP ON OPTIONS & NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONAL MODELS PER

SPEC #30, INCLUDES ANY FREIGHT & REQUIRED INSTALLATION COSTS 2

Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

Everglades Equipment

Group
* Southern
$41,990.00

$4,224.00"

$121.00"

$570.00"

$646.00"

$684.00"

$2.589.00'

$4,633.00"

$6.,645.00"

$13,876.00"

$832.00"

$6,773.00"

$22,880.00"

NA

NA
NA

$325.00°

$3.150.00°

$2,525.00°

$4,290.00°

$6.185.00°

$12,330.00°

$4,035.00°

$4.105.00>

$4,040.00°

$800.00°

$6.550.00°

$22,500.00°

Std?

NA
NA



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

2YR

3YR

330G

Dobbs Equipment LLC Dobbs Equipment LLC Everglades Equipment
Group

Western Northern % Central

$44,075.00 $44,075.00 $41,990.00

New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan — specify
Please contact your dealer for a quote.

Maintenance Plan — specify
Please contact your dealer for a quote.

Warranty - specify
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1
PARTS AND LABOR - DOES NOT INCLUDE TRANSPORTATION 2

Warranty - specify

Please contact your dealer for a quote. 1
POWERTRAIN-3 YEARS OR 2000HRS-DOES NOT INCLUDE TRANSPORTATION 2

Everglades Equipment
Group

* Southern
$41,990.00

NA
NA!

NA!

NA
NA

NA

Std?

Std?
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FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES

SKID STEER LOADER - 2800 LB OPERATING CAPACITY WHEELED ONLY
SPECIFICATION #30

2019 John Deere 330G

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The John Deere 330G purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $42,650.00 $42,650.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code
JD 320G 2

D 324G 2

Non-Specified Option
Discount 25% >

Order Code
JD 332G 2

8060 >
5204 2
3002 2
3100
6501 2
029KV 2
OASOT ?

8075 2

5001 2

330G (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western Northern
-- No bid -- -- No bid --
Delete Options

Optional equipment - specify

Downgrade to John Deere model 320G 2

Optional equipment - specify

Downgrade to John Deere model 324G 2

Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Central
$42,650.00

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Southern
$42,650.00

Western
& Central
Northern& Southern

$10,985.00°
$7.860.00°

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

NAZ

Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will be

applied to all non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and

optional models. 2

Add Options
Optional equipment - specify

Upgrade to John Deere model 332G 2

Optional equipment - specify
Engine pre-cleaner

Optional equipment - specify

Enclosed cab with air conditioning 2

Optional equipment - specify
High-flow hydraulics 2

Optional e%uipment - specify
Ride control

Optional equipment - specify

Reversing fan drive

Optional equipment - specify
GT80 Tined grapple 2

Optional equipment - specify
MP78B Multi-purpose bucket 2

Optional equipment - specify
Hazard warning lights 2

Optional equipment - specify

Powered quick-attach bucket coupler 2

Western
& Central
Northern& Southern

$2,600.00°
$346.00°
$3,400.00°
$1,391.00°
$960.00°
$646.00°
$4,593.00°
$4,224.00°
$121.00°

$570.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

8042 2

5550 2
0102KV/1002/9000 *
1520T >
0302KV/AT394637
7500T/1006/9501/3000 2
03J1T/1001 2
9790T/AT394637 >
8231T/AT348477 2

Non-Specified Option
Discount 25% >

330G (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Western Northern Central
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- $42,650.00

Optional equiprznent - specify

Rear view camera

Optional equipment - specify
Deluxe LED light package 2

Optional equipment - sgecify
PA30B Auger drive with bit

Optional equipment - specify
BR72 72" pickup broom 2

Optional equipment - specify
BA84 84" Angle broom 2

Optional equipment - specify
BH11 Backhoe attachment with bucket 2

Optional equipment - specify
45" Fork frame with 42" fork tines, quick-attach 2

Optional equipment - specify
DBI6 96" Dozer blade 2

Optional equipment - specify
24" Cold planer attachment with controls 2

Optional equipment - specify

Dobbs Equipment LLC
Southern
$42,650.00

$646.00°

$684.00°

$2,589.00°

$4,633.00°

$6.645.00°

$13,876.00°

$832.00°

$6,773.00°

$22,880.00°

Discount Option: A discount of 25% off manufacturers current published list price (MSRP) will be

applied to all non-specified factory options. This discount would apply to both base units, and

optional models.
Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan — specify
Please contact your dealer for a quote.

Maintenance Plan — specify
Please contact your dealer for a quote. 2

Warranty - specify

Please contact your dealer for a quote. 2

Warranty - specify

Please contact your dealer for a quote. 2

NAZ





