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”�We lead the refining 

industry in energy 

efficiency.”

www.marathonpetroleum.com

Marathon Petroleum Corporation provides the fundamental building blocks of prosperity. The 
transportation fuels and other products we manufacture, transport and sell benefit society by 
driving economic development and improving living standards for people from all socioeconomic 
backgrounds. At the same time, we continually improve our manufacturing processes and 
operations, making our critical work cleaner than ever before.

We lead the refining industry in energy efficiency. We have been a partner company under the 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency’s (EPA) ENERGY STAR® Program since 2009 and have 
made a corporate commitment to consider energy efficiency in all investment and operating 
decisions. Since the ENERGY STAR® Program began, Marathon Petroleum has received 33 of 
the 44 ENERGY STAR® designations awarded to U.S. refineries. This represents 75 percent of the 
recognitions — a disproportionately large share, considering our refineries represent less than 10 
percent of the total U.S. capacity.

We consistently make investments to improve environmental performance. At our six refineries 
owned from 2002 through 2014, gross throughputs increased by approximately 39 percent 
while we reduced our criteria air pollutant emissions by 59 percent. During the same period, our 
refineries reduced greenhouse gas emissions per barrel of throughput by more than 10 percent.

Marathon Petroleum is also a partner company in the EPA’s SmartWay Transport Partnership, 
which recognizes the best-performing freight carriers for carbon efficiency. We have scored in 
the best performance range in terms of grams of carbon dioxide per ton-mile for three straight 
years, placing us in the top 20 percent of the most efficient freight companies for our SmartWay 
category.

In addition to our environmental stewardship, we are actively engaged in the communities 
where we do business. We maintain open lines of communication with those who live near our 
refineries by meeting regularly with Community Advisory Panels (CAPs) made up of teachers, 
retirees, business owners, elected officials, activists and others. We provide the CAP members 
with information on our health, safety and environmental performance, as well as updates on 
significant projects. Just as important, we answer their questions and address their concerns.

The petroleum products that we manufacture, transport and market are critical to health, 
commercial activity and prosperity. Our products heat and cool our homes, are used in building 
materials that provide shelter from the elements, are integral to producing medical supplies and 
equipment, and enable farmers to feed the world. Our fuels empower people to travel to markets, 
schools, hospitals and community events. They allow businesses to provide goods and services to 
those who need them.

As we demonstrate throughout our operations, Marathon Petroleum is committed to doing this 
indispensable work while continuing to be a good neighbor and steward of our world’s resources. 

Gary R. Heminger
President and Chief Executive Officer
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