
The Gospel of John: Light in the Darkness
The Empty Tomb: Hope Springs Eternal,
John 20:1-10

The shock of this moment and the slow discovery that takes place

Man goes on a trip and leaves his mom and pet in the care of his brother. Calls his brother and
asks how the dog is doing.

“The dog is dead.” “How did that happen?” “I left the second floor window open not knowing the
dog would jump up onto the window seal. When I tried to coax it back the dog fell. I rushed the
dog to the vet but after several attempts to save your dog, she succumbed to the injuries from
the fall.”

“You have to let people into that type of news more slowly. You should have let that story unfold
over a few phone calls. Tell me about the fall and taking her to the vet. Then tell me the vet is
doing everything possible but its touch and go. Then tell me she didn’t make it.”

“How’s mom?” Long silence. “She’s out on the window seal.”

John 20:1 Now on the first day of the week Mary Magdalene came early to the tomb, while it
was still dark, and saw the stone already removed from the tomb.
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Luke 24:1-3 But on the first day of the week, at early dawn, they came to the tomb bringing the
spices which they had prepared. And they found the stone rolled away from the tomb, but when
they entered, they did not find the body of the Lord Jesus.

John 20:1 Now on the first day of the week Mary Magdalene came early to the tomb, while it
was still dark, and saw the stone already removed from the tomb.

John 20:2 So she ran and came to Simon Peter and to the other disciple whom Jesus loved,
and said to them, “They have taken the Lord from the tomb, and we do not know where they
have put Him.”

John 20:3-5 So Peter and the other disciple left, and they were going to the tomb. The two were
running together; and the other disciple ran ahead, faster than Peter, and came to the tomb first;
and he stooped to look in, and saw the linen wrappings lying there; however he did not go in.



Genesis 2:16-17 The Lord God commanded the man, saying, “From any tree of the garden you
may eat freely; but from the tree of the knowledge of good and evil you shall not eat, for in the
day that you eat from it you will surely die.”

First experience with the concept of death on a personal level

The reality of our adult experience with death grants us a look into the thinking of the followers
of Jesus. They had enough experience to know that His death was permanent, just like
everyone else.

He had told them that He would rise. They still could not believe it.

John 10:17-18 For this reason the Father loves Me, because I lay down My life so that I may
take it again. No one has taken it away from Me, but I lay it down on My own initiative. I have
authority to lay it down, and I have authority to take it up again.

John 11:25-26 Jesus said to her, “I am the resurrection and the life; he who believes in Me will
live even if he dies, and everyone who lives and believes in Me will never die.”

John 11:43-44 When He had said these things, He cried out with a loud voice, “Lazarus, come
forth.” The man who had died came forth, bound hand and foot with wrappings, and his face
was wrapped around with a cloth. Jesus said to them, “Unbind him, and let him go.”

John 16:16-17 “A little while, and you will no longer see Me; and again a little while, and you will
see Me.” Some of His disciples then said to one another, “What is this thing He is telling us, ‘A
little while, and you will not see Me; and again a little while, and you will see Me’; and, ‘because
I go to the Father’?”

John 16:18-20 So they were saying, “What is this that He says, ‘A little while’? We do not know
what He is talking about.” Jesus knew that they wished to question Him, and He said to them,
“Are you deliberating together about this, that I said, ‘A little while, and you will not see Me, and
again a little while, and you will see Me’? Truly, truly, I say to you, that you will weep and lament,
but the world will rejoice; you will grieve, but your grief will be turned into joy.

John 16:21-22 Whenever a woman is in labor she has pain, because her hour has come; but
when she gives birth to the child, she no longer remembers the anguish because of the joy that
a child has been born into the world. Therefore you too have grief now; but I will see you again,
and your heart will rejoice, and no one will take your joy away from you.

Romans 5:12 Therefore, just as through one man sin entered into the world, and death through
sin, and so death spread to all men, because all sinned.

The opening of 3 2 1 chapter on Adam



Hebrews 2:14-15 Therefore, since the children share in flesh and blood, He Himself likewise
also partook of the same, that through death He might render powerless him who had the power
of death, that is, the devil, and might free those who through fear of death were subject to
slavery all their lives.

Hebrews 2:17-18 Therefore, He had to be made like His brethren in all things, so that He might
become a merciful and faithful high priest in things pertaining to God, to make propitiation for
the sins of the people. For since He Himself was tempted in that which He has suffered, He is
able to come to the aid of those who are tempted.

John 20:3-5 So Peter and the other disciple left, and they were going to the tomb. The two were
running together; and the other disciple ran ahead, faster than Peter, and came to the tomb first;
and he stooped to look in, and saw the linen wrappings lying there; however he did not go in.

John 20:6-7 So Simon Peter also came, following him, and he entered the tomb; and he looked
at the linen wrappings lying there, and the face-cloth which had been on His head, not lying with
the linen wrappings but folded up in a place by itself.

John 20:8-10 So the other disciple who had first come to the tomb also entered then, and he
saw and believed. For they did not yet understand the Scripture, that He must rise from the
dead. So the disciples went away again to their own homes.


