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» oM John Hagan [hydrojohnhagan@aol.com]

Sent: Monday, December 20, 2010 11:26 AM

To: angel@plasticrevolutions.com 7L
Subject: Fwd: Duke agreement i }4’ / i@ &

Tilden will pick up the check this afternoon. / y " yg& fn 57 /’
s

Thanks, -t
Angel bl

--—Original Message-—---

From: Tilden Hagan <tilden@solardvnenc.com>

To: John Hagan <Hydrojohnhagan@aol com>; Chip Hagan <chagan@hagandavis.com>; David Hagan
<dhagan@haganproperties.com>

Sent: Fri, Dec 17, 2010 5:52 pm

Subject: Duke agreement

I'm bringing with me tomorrow the Power Purchase Agreemént (PPA) from

Duke which I'wve signed but when I return it to Duke I need to include

*he check for $28,901.59 from JDC Manufacturing. Let me know if it

would be best for me to leave it somewhere at the plant or if my Dad

can write a check from JDC. It needs to go out on Monday so we can be

sure they'll start their side of the construction as soon as possible

) \IO

to be done before year end. Q

Tilden '\(}‘ \O\‘O




