

Spring Meet 2015 Race Auction Results

1 **LD VIRGIL EARP** (GREYS OUTLAW-LD WEIHL DREAM)
M 12/ 7/2013 PETER LIMMER OR DEBRA BINEGAR
John Weber \$1 500.00

2 **BEAT THE HEAT** (FLYING COAL CITY-BRAKE N RUN)
M 12/27/2013 GLENN C. JONES
Scratched

3 **BF PAR NITRO** (BF FLYING STAN-BD'S NORA)
M 12/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Scratched

4 **KB'S ALANA** (DJAYS OCTANE-RAINBOW TRAIL)
F 12/ 9/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

5 **PJ REIGN SUPREME** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
F 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$47 000.00

6 **PJ COLLEGE CREEPN** (RHYTHMLESS-KB'S COLLEGE CAT)
M 12/17/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

7 **DANCIN SNICKERS** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL AVA)
F 12/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
Eric Rosch \$3 000.00

8 **KB'S GAZELLE** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKCASTLE STAR)
F 12/ 1/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Ricardo Pacheco \$4 750.00

9 **MONDAY NIGHT** (KIOWA MON MANNY-SMOOTH TEMPO)
M 12/27/2013 MYRTLE ERWIN
Scratched

10 **GOOD BY GEAR** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-SAN TAN RIGHTWON)
F 12/25/2013 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched

11 **ROCKANDROLLOVER** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-SAN TAN RIGHTWON)
M 12/25/2013 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Passed (\$6 500)

12 **CRAIGIE VALERO** (BD'S GRAYSON-BUDZ JENCY)
F 12/ 2/2013 CRAIGIE INC.
Passed (\$3 500)

13 **DS THE BIG WON** (P'S GIBBS-JS NAUT A BYTE)
M 12/20/2013 SHANNON HENRY OR DENNIS RIDER
Scratched

14 **KB'S GROVER** (YAHOO OMAR-JOKER MONDAY)
M 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Passed no bid.

15 **KB'S NUMERATOR** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKJACK ARCH)
F 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

16 **DS UNIQUE UNIT** (P'S GIBBS-JS NAUT A BYTE)
M 12/20/2013 SHANNON HENRY OR DENNIS RIDER
Scratched

17 **BF PAR NOVA** (BF FLYING STAN-BD'S NORA)
F 12/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Norman L. Rader \$5 500.00

18 **PJ CRANK IT** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
M 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Steve Sarras \$16 000.00

19 **KB'S MCMISSILE** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKJACK ARCH)
M 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader \$3 250.00

20 **DANCIN MILKYWAY** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL AVA)
M 12/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
Edward Bolton \$3 250.00

21 **SE'S FUEL LINE** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHE IS BASRA)
F 12/ 2/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Steve Sarras \$7 000.00

22 **KEEPER VUITTON** (YAHOO OMAR-KB'S JUMBO JET)
F 12/23/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

23 **PJ TAKEYOURTIME** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
F 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$32 000.00

24 **KB'S BUSHLEY** (DJAYS OCTANE-RAINBOW TRAIL)
M 12/ 9/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Crystal Carroll \$3 000.00

25 **JS TIM TATION** (PAT C CLEMENT-JS FIRST TOUCH)
M 12/12/2013 SHANNON HENRY
Scratched

26 **PJ SILVER IDOL** (RHYTHMLESS-SILVER IDOL)
F 12/18/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Jacobs Racing Kennel Inc. \$6 500.00

27 **SE'S FUEL TANK** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHE IS BASRA)
M 12/ 2/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Randy Finegan \$15 000.00

28 **QUIRKY MAINFRAME** (IRON TIME-BD'S HAVANA)
M 12/10/2013 JASON LIPARI
Scratched

29 **KB'S BLAINE** (DJAYS OCTANE-RAINBOW TRAIL)

M 12/ 9/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Tim Ertl \$3 500.00

30 PJ **COLLEGE BOUND** (RHYTHMLESS-KB'S COLLEGE CAT)
M 12/17/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

31 **KB'S BOULDER** (YAHOO OMAR-JOKER MONDAY)
M 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Craig Tasens \$2 000.00

32 **KEEPER HORNFROGS** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-GABLE ROSEANNE)
M 12/29/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

33 **JS SAVE THE DATE** (PAT C CLEMENT-JS FIRST TOUCH)
F 12/12/2013 SHANNON HENRY
Scratched

34 **SE'S FAST FINISH** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHE IS BASRA)
F 12/ 2/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Randy Finegan \$10 000.00

35 **KB'S LACROSSE** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKJACK ARCH)
F 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader \$6 000.00

36 **JS BUDDY RICH** (PAT C CLEMENT-JS CALL ME LUCKY)
M 12/30/2013 SHANNON HENRY
Scratched

37 **KEEPER DOLCE** (YAHOO OMAR-KB'S JUMBO JET)
F 12/23/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

38 **LD WYATT EARP** (GREYS OUTLAW-LD WEIHL DREAM)
M 12/ 7/2013 PETER LIMMER OR DEBRA BINEGAR
Eric Rosch \$2 000.00

39 **PJ THROW BACK** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
M 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Rodney Cooley \$8 500.00

40 **SE'S FAST PAWS** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHE IS BASRA)
F 12/ 2/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Randy Doubles \$6 000.00

41 **DANCIN SMORES** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL AVA)
M 12/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
James E. Blanchard \$2 000.00

42 **PJ PASS ME BY** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
F 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Vincent H. Savill \$6 250.00

43 **KB'S LULABELLE** (DJAYS OCTANE-RAINBOW TRAIL)
F 12/ 9/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Tornadic Greyhounds \$4 000.00

44 **DS SAVING GRACE** (P'S GIBBS-JS NAUT A BYTE)
F 12/20/2013 SHANNON HENRY OR DENNIS RIDER
Scratched

45 **FADED LOVE** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-SAN TAN RIGHTWON)
F 12/25/2013 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched

46 **KB'S TURNPIKE** (YAHOO OMAR-JOKER MONDAY)
M 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Passed (\$1 500)

47 **BF PAR NICKIE** (BF FLYING STAN-BD'S NORA)
F 12/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Scratched

48 **DANCIN PAYDAY** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL AVA)
M 12/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
Passed (\$1 250)

49 **KB'S ALEXA** (DJAYS OCTANE-RAINBOW TRAIL)
F 12/ 9/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Bentley Roberts \$5 000.00

50 **WILDERADO** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-SAN TAN RIGHTWON)
M 12/25/2013 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched

51 **PJ NOT FOR LONG** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
F 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Randy Finegan \$9 500.00

52 **BF PAR NIMBLE** (BF FLYING STAN-BD'S NORA)
F 12/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Scratched

53 **DS MISS B HAVEN** (P'S GIBBS-JS NAUT A BYTE)
F 12/20/2013 SHANNON HENRY OR DENNIS RIDER
Scratched

54 **KB'S ELEGANT** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKJACK ARCH)
F 12/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Brad Hess \$8 500.00

55 **CRAIGIE VICTORY** (BD'S GRAYSON-BUDZ JENCY)
F 12/ 2/2013 CRAIGIE INC.
Passed (\$2 500)

56 **KB'S LINDON** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-BLACKCASTLE STAR)
F 12/ 1/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Ray Wong \$2 500.00

57 **PJ BURNINITDOWN** (DJAYS OCTANE-PJ MICHELADA)
M 12/28/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Sarras Patterson Corrado \$85 000.00

58 **DANCIN REESES** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL AVA)
F 12/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
John Weber \$2 000.00

59 **KB'S FAIRWAY** (VENUS ESPINOSA-CV'S MAMA MIA)
F 1/ 7/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Eric Rosch \$3 250.00

60 **CARL DAIKELER** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
M 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

61 **BARTS MOONDUST** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
F 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Edward F. Garnder Jr. \$4 000.00

62 **JUSTGETNSTARTED** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
M 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Norman L. Rader \$9 500.00

63 **PJ ALL RIGHT NOW** (DJAYS OCTANE-BOC'S BONASARA)
M 1/25/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

64 **PULLANALLNIGHTER** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
F 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Scratched

65 **KB'S ROCK WIZARD** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING CHELYAN)
M 1/ 4/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

66 **BARTS MIDNITERUN** (TYRUR ALEX*-WORKHARDPLAYHARD)
F 1/19/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Passed (\$4 000)

67 **BODY BEAST** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
M 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Joseph M. Frenette \$5 000.00

68 **PJ NOTTHEONLYONE** (DJAYS OCTANE-BOC'S BONASARA)
F 1/25/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Ricardo Pacheco \$11 000.00

69 **BARTS METALLIC** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
M 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Ricardo Pacheco \$6 000.00

70 **KB'S EMERS** (VENUS ESPINOSA-CV'S MAMA MIA)
F 1/ 7/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Chris Palmieri Jr. \$2 000.00

71 **HARD TO BE COOL** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
M 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Kelly Everett \$3 000.00

72 **PJ IM TRIPPIN** (FLYING WESTOVER-KELSOS GETAMOON)
F 1/16/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Ricardo Pacheco \$6 500.00

73 **MAN SHES ON FIRE** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
F 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
James Zawisa \$17 500.00

74 **KB'S DEVILS DUE** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING CHELYAN)
M 1/ 4/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

75 **PJ GIVINOUTSMOKE** (DJAYS OCTANE-VAN'S CHICKSTER)
M 1/19/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

76 **BARTS CROSSROADS** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
M 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Tim Ertl \$6 750.00

77 **BARTS KIND HEART** (KC AND ALL-SEADON ENCHANTED)
F 1/ 4/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Passed (\$7 000)

78 **MOHICAN LIVE FOR** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING LIVE WIRE)
M 1/ 4/2014 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Scratched

79 **SHAKEOLOGY** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
F 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Joe Recker \$3 000.00

80 **KB'S CRINKLE** (TMC'S REMEDY-MISS ADELAIDE)
F 1/ 5/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

81 **BARTS OUTFMYWAY** (KC AND ALL-SEADON ENCHANTED)
M 1/ 4/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
S. Lester Raines \$11 500.00

82 **ON DEMAND** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
M 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
S. Lester Raines \$9 000.00

83 **KEEPER MIDLAND** (GABLE HOT DOG-GABLE TERESA)
M 1/ 8/2014 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

84 **SOUNDSGOODDONTIT** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
M 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Scratched

85 **BARTS GREY PAWS** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
M 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Edward Bolton \$8 750.00

86 **KB'S BRUNO** (TMC'S REMEDY-MISS ADELAIDE)

M 1/ 5/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

87 **PJ LOOKATMENOW** (DJAYS OCTANE-BOC'S BONASARA)
M 1/25/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
On-Line Racing \$15 000.00

88 **MILLS COMBAT** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
F 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Anthony Napolitano \$1 250.00

89 **PJ IN DUE TIME** (FLYING WESTOVER-KELSOS GETAMOVON)
M 1/16/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

90 **BARTS BETTHEFARM** (TYRUR ALEX*-WORKHARDPLAYHARD)
M 1/19/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Passed (\$5 000)

91 **KB'S SOPHIA** (VENUS ESPINOSA-CV'S MAMA MIA)
F 1/ 7/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader \$5 000.00

92 **MOHICAN LIVE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING LIVE WIRE)
M 1/ 4/2014 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Scratched

93 **PJ STRANGECLLOUDS** (DJAYS OCTANE-BOC'S BONASARA)
M 1/25/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Byron Jay Childs \$26 000.00

94 **BARTS MAKEN TIME** (KC AND ALL-SEADON ENCHANTED)
M 1/ 4/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Joe Recker \$1 250.00

95 **PJ TONY MONTANA** (FLYING WESTOVER-KELSOS GETAMOVON)
M 1/16/2014 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Rodney Cooley \$8 000.00

96 **SIPPIN ON FIRE** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
F 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Jason Hess \$2 000.00

97 **KB'S DELUXE** (VENUS ESPINOSA-CV'S MAMA MIA)
F 1/ 7/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader \$6 000.00

98 **BARTS BLUEMYMIND** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
M 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Randy Finegan \$9 750.00

99 **EXTREME FIX** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
F 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Kelly Everett \$5 000.00

100 **KEEPER MACON** (GABLE HOT DOG-GABLE TERESA)
M 1/ 8/2014 GREEN SMITH

Scratched

101 **KB'S PHILOMENA** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING CHELYAN)
F 1/ 4/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

102 **BARTS PLAN ON IT** (TYRUR ALEX*-WORKHARDPLAYHARD)
F 1/19/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Bentley Roberts or Tornadic Gr \$2 000.00

103 **TONY HORTON** (DRAGON FIRE-CRAIG'S GAL)
M 1/ 2/2014 KEVIN DALTON
Kelly Everett \$7 000.00

104 **KB'S FIONNA** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING CHELYAN)
F 1/ 4/2014 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

105 **BARTS HIHOSILVER** (TRENT LEE-BARTS MAGPIE)
M 1/ 9/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Robert Crossland \$4 000.00

106 **WHERE ARE U NOW** (KC AND ALL-RAIN OVER ME)
F 1/16/2014 KATE BARTLEY
Passed (\$12 500)

107 **FOOLIN NO ONE** (KIOWA MON MANNY-BARTS JUSTFOOLIN)
M 2/18/2014 KATE BARTLEY OR TRAVIS BARTLEY
Passed no bid

108 **ROC A BY PEPSI** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-ROC A BY IT'S E)
F 2/27/2014 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Passed (\$2 250)

109 **BARTS CHERRYPIE** (DEERFIELD MOVER*-BL'S CHERRYONTOP)
F 2/ 5/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
Passed (\$4 000)

110 **ALTO FANNY MAY** (TRENT LEE-SUNSAND FANNYMAY)
F 2/13/2014 RUFUS TATUM
Scratched

111 **DANCIN JABOBBY** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL WOLFGANG)
M 2/ 9/2014 PETER LIMMER
Janice T. Dermott \$2 500.00

112 **SE'S MOJO RISIN** (DJAYS OCTANE-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
M 2/20/2014 STEVEN A. WARD OR MATTHEW WARD
Michael Harris \$7 750.00

113 **BARTS CHICKFILA** (DEERFIELD MOVER*-BL'S CHERRYONTOP)
F 2/ 5/2014 RICK D. BARTLEY
James E. Blanchard \$3 100.00

114 **NOT FOOLIN** (KIOWA MON MANNY-BARTS JUSTFOOLIN)
M 2/18/2014 KATE BARTLEY OR TRAVIS BARTLEY
Tornadic Greyhounds \$1 250.00

115 **CURLY JONES** (DJAYS OCTANE-BETTY GRABLE)
M 2/11/2014 GLENN C. JONES
Passed no bid.

116 **SE'S RAINY DAY** (DJAYS OCTANE-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
F 2/20/2014 STEVEN A. WARD OR MATTHEW WARD
Vincent H. Savill \$7 500.00

117 **ROC A BY FANTA** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-ROC A BY IT'S E)
F 2/27/2014 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
H. Hal Gill \$7 000.00

118 **AIN'T NO FOOLIN** (KIOWA MON MANNY-BARTS JUSTFOOLIN)
M 2/18/2014 KATE BARTLEY OR TRAVIS BARTLEY
Ray Wong \$3 000.00

119 **MOE JONES** (DJAYS OCTANE-BETTY GRABLE)
M 2/11/2014 GLENN C. JONES
Scratched

120 **ALTO HALF PINT** (TRENT LEE-SUNSAND FANNYMAY)
M 2/13/2014 RUFUS TATUM
Joe Trudden \$1 500.00

121 **SE'S TOE TOE** (DJAYS OCTANE-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
M 2/20/2014 STEVEN A. WARD OR MATTHEW WARD
Scratched

122 **JUST FOOLIN** (KIOWA MON MANNY-BARTS JUSTFOOLIN)
M 2/18/2014 KATE BARTLEY OR TRAVIS BARTLEY
Kelly Everett \$5 500.00

123 **DANCIN DAMONEY** (HI NOON RENEGADE-SL WOLFGANG)
M 2/ 9/2014 PETER LIMMER
James E. Blanchard \$2 500.00

124 **ROC A BY SPRITE** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-ROC A BY IT'S E)
F 2/27/2014 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Passed (\$3 500)

125 **SE'S LA WOMAN** (DJAYS OCTANE-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
F 2/20/2014 STEVEN A. WARD OR MATTHEW WARD
Thomas A. Ferris \$17 500.00

126 **KUTE KID** (FLYING PENSKE-KUTE KINGSLEY)
M 9/20/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

127 **JHAWK REBELCHILD** (KC AND ALL-BRETT LEE QUEEN)
F 9/ 4/2013 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
S. Lester Raines \$12 000.00

128 **FAITHFUL FITNESS** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
M 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

129 **TK REVLON** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
John Weber \$1 000.00

130 **SE TALI SUNDANCE** (KC AND ALL-FLYING CASSEL)
M 9/17/2013 STEVEN A. WARD OR PENNY D. WICK
Rodney Cooley \$76 000.00

131 **CECI MIKANDA** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
F 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

132 **TK ESTEE LAUDER** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Passed (\$1 250)

133 **QUIRKY PALADIN** (KC AND ALL-BRETT LEE QUEEN)
M 9/ 4/2013 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
Kathleen Jones \$2 750.00

134 **CRAIGIE TRAGER** (KIOWA MON MANNY-MANI SWEET)
M 9/21/2013 CRAIGIE INC.
Passed no bid.

135 **GLAMOUR PUSS** (P'S GIBBS-RK'S YAHOO.COM)
F 9/24/2013 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched

136 **DANGEROUSMISSION** (FLYING COAL CITY-INSTANT MONEY)
M 8/ 3/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Randy Finegan \$5 500.00

137 **TK ZEPPELIN** (LONESOME CRY-CAJUN FANTASY)
M 9/28/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Scratched

138 **HS IRIS** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
F 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

139 **BF PAR SNAPPER** (SUPER LEE-BF FLYING GRACE)
M 8/21/2013 R & F KENNEL INC. OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Tim Ertl \$12 250.00

140 **SE'S DARK KNIGHT** (DJAYS OCTANE-TALI MONDAY)
M 8/ 3/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

141 **WP'S LARIAT** (DJAYS OCTANE-COUNTESS CINDY)
M 8/28/2013 JASON LIPARI
Steve Sarras \$15 000.00

142 **TK CREEDENCE** (LONESOME CRY-CAJUN FANTASY)
F 9/28/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Scratched

143 **DANGEROUS GOLDIE** (FLYING COAL CITY-INSTANT MONEY)

F 8/ 3/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

144 **BR REPEAT** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
M 9/17/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR ROBERT LAMBERT
S. Lester Raines \$21 000.00

145 **ABS SIX PACK** (BELLA INFRARED-ABILENE ABBY)
M 8/ 2/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

146 **BR REAPER** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
M 9/17/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR ROBERT LAMBERT
Jason Hess \$5 500.00

147 **RUIDOSO** (MARYVILLE RUMBLE*-MRL TOOTALOU)
M 9/24/2013 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR MRL METALS LLC
Scratched

148 **KB'S MAIN MAN** (COUSY-WWW BOSS HOGG)
M 8/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Passed no bid.

149 **TD ETHAN** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
M 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

150 **BITS OF SABLE** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
F 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

151 **WINDY MARKO** (KC AND ALL-DM MAXINE)
M 9/16/2013 DAVID STRONG
Ray Wong \$2 500.00

152 **KB'S LODI** (PACIFIC MILE*-KB'S SABINA LASS)
F 9/18/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Jerry Kramer \$2 000.00

153 **HS ROMAN** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-HS HONEY)
M 9/13/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

154 **UNCLE LAWTON** (SHONN-GABLE CHEDDAR)
M 9/17/2013 RYAN J. O'DONNELL
Scratched

155 **BF PAR SNIPER** (SUPER LEE-BF FLYING GRACE)
M 8/21/2013 R & F KENNEL INC. OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Norman L. Rader \$9 250.00

156 **ABS ALMIGHTY** (BELLA INFRARED-ABILENE ABBY)
F 8/ 2/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

157 **KB'S RAPPER** (PACIFIC MILE*-KB'S SABINA LASS)
F 9/18/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Passed no bid

158 **TD FERGIE** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
F 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

159 **KIOWA POLICEMAN** (DRAGON FIRE-DECO BRANDI JETT)
M 9/14/2013 VINCE BERLAND
Randy Finegan \$20 000.00

160 **TK MOTHERS WAY** (LONESOME CRY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 8/23/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Scratched

161 **SE'S REAL MCCOY** (KC AND ALL-FLYING CASSEL)
F 9/17/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

162 **KB'S APOLLO** (COUSY-WWW BOSS HOGG)
M 8/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

163 **HS MAYFLOWER** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
F 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

164 **BITS OF BLACK** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
M 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

165 **JHAWKCLOYDRIVERS** (KC AND ALL-BRETT LEE QUEEN)
M 9/ 4/2013 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$20 000.00

166 **FLYIN BLACKWIDOW** (IRUSKA ALL STAR-SUPER FANTASTIC)
F 9/25/2013 VINCE BERLAND
Passed (\$2 000)

167 **KUTE GUY** (FLYING PENSKE-KUTE KINGSLEY)
M 9/20/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

168 **DANGEROUS MOVES** (FLYING COAL CITY-INSTANT MONEY)
M 8/ 3/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Passed (\$1 500)

169 **TK CENTRALIA** (BD'S GRAYSON-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
F 9/13/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Joseph M. Frenette \$8 250.00

170 **DANCIN WAYLON** (HI NOON RENEGADE-EL DIVAS DOMAIN)
M 9/ 4/2013 PETER LIMMER
Dennis Hampton \$5 000.00

171 **RAGGEDY MOON** (BD'S GRAYSON-MIGHTY MIMI)
F 8/ 7/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Jason Hess \$4 000.00

172 **CRAIGIE TELLER** (KIOWA MON MANNY-MANI SWEET)
M 9/21/2013 CRAIGIE INC.
Kayruth Abernathy \$5 000.00

173 **HS NAKED LADY** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
F 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

174 **UPTOWN** (MARYVILLE RUMBLE*-MRL TOOTALOU)
M 9/24/2013 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR MRL METALS LLC
Scratched

175 **BITS OF GOLD** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
M 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

176 **BR REASON** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
M 9/17/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR ROBERT LAMBERT
Passed no bid.

177 **TK MAYBELLINE** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Passed no bid.

178 **SUPERLIFE** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
F 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Jeffrey Knight \$2 000.00

179 **TALI MOONSHADOW** (FLYING BERDYCH-AMF ROYALSENDOFF)
F 9/27/2013 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
Passed no bid.

180 **WINDY GABBY** (KC AND ALL-DM MAXINE)
F 9/16/2013 DAVID STRONG
Deborah Strickland \$4 750.00

181 **BF PAR STINGER** (SUPER LEE-BF FLYING GRACE)
M 8/21/2013 R & F KENNEL INC. OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Passed no bid

182 **TD COSMO** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
M 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

183 **KB'S JONAH** (COUSY-WWW BOSS HOGG)
M 8/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

184 **TD BOSCO** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
M 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

185 **PAR BEN HUR** (FLYING COAL CITY-PAR LAHAR)
M 9/28/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Ricardo Pacheco \$7 000.00

186 **SE'S BEAR CLAW** (KC AND ALL-FLYING CASSEL)
M 9/17/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

187 **TK SEPHORIA** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
John Weber \$1 250.00

188 **DANGEROUS DOLLAR** (FLYING COAL CITY-INSTANT MONEY)
F 8/ 3/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

189 **CV BLACK KNIGHT** (PLUTO TYME-FLYING AERONAUT)
M 8/19/2013 VINCE BERLAND OR CRAIG E. SMITH
Passed (\$3 500)

190 **MODIFIED SERIES** (KC AND ALL-DM MAXINE)
M 9/16/2013 DAVID STRONG
Norman L. Rader \$9 000.00

191 **HS MARIGOLD** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
F 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

192 **BF PAR SWALLOW** (SUPER LEE-BF FLYING GRACE)
F 8/21/2013 R & F KENNEL INC. OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
James E. Blanchard \$1 500.00

193 **TK FARTHER ALONG** (LONESOME CRY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
M 8/23/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Garth Bolton \$5 000.00

194 **HS FLAMINGO** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
M 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

195 **ABS GALORE** (BELLA INFRARED-ABILENE ABBY)
F 8/ 2/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

196 **KB'S KAYDEN** (LONESOME CRY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
M 8/23/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

197 **BR REAL DEAL** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
M 9/17/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR ROBERT LAMBERT
Kelly Everett \$7 750.00

198 **WP'S CINDERELLA** (DJAYS OCTANE-COUNTESS CINDY)
F 8/28/2013 JASON LIPARI
Thomas A. Ferris \$33 000.00

199 **QUIRKY PLUTARCH** (KC AND ALL-BRETT LEE QUEEN)
M 9/ 4/2013 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
Norman L. Rader \$7 500.00

200 **HS GLADIATOR** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-HS HONEY)

M 9/13/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

201 **TALI NIGHT SKY** (FLYING BERDYCH-AMF ROYALSENDOFF)
M 9/27/2013 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

202 **KUTE KING** (FLYING PENSKE-KUTE KINGSLEY)
M 9/20/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

203 **BITS OF TOFFEE** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
F 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGTH
Scratched

204 **FLYING REMEDY** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
F 9/17/2013 VINCE BERLAND
Scratched

205 **VANBURG** (MARYVILLE RUMBLE*-MRL TOOTALOU)
M 9/24/2013 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR MRL METALS LLC
Scratched

206 **TURBO FIRE** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
M 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

207 **CRAIGIE MUNSON** (KIOWA MON MANNY-MANI SWEET)
M 9/21/2013 CRAIGIE INC.
Passed (\$5 000)

208 **TD DRONE** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
M 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

209 **TK SUNNY SIDE** (LONESOME CRY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 8/23/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Passed no bid.

210 **BITS OF BLUE** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
M 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGTH
Scratched

211 **JHAWK SPEEDDEMON** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S HARPER)
M 8/25/2013 JASON LIPARI OR JAMES ROSGA
Norman L. Rader \$7 500.00

212 **VESTED** (KC AND ALL-DM MAXINE)
M 9/16/2013 DAVID STRONG
S. Lester Raines \$41 000.00

213 **WP'S ROAD KING** (DJAYS OCTANE-COUNTESS CINDY)
M 8/28/2013 JASON LIPARI
Steve Sarras \$13 000.00

214 **KB'S SPECIAL** (PACIFIC MILE*-KB'S SABINA LASS)
F 9/18/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Edward F. Gardner Jr. \$2 250.00

215 **PIYO** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
M 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

216 **BR RESOLVE** (TMC'S REMEDY-FLYING ROSECREST)
M 9/17/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR ROBERT LAMBERT
Randy Finegan \$5 000.00

217 **KB'S MR. ED** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO PAULA)
M 8/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Ricardo Pacheco \$3 750.00

218 **PAR TROJAN** (BD'S FLIP-A STAR THERESE)
M 8/20/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Scratched

219 **SE TALI CIMARRON** (KC AND ALL-FLYING CASSEL)
M 9/17/2013 STEVEN A. WARD OR PENNY D. WICK
Scratched

220 **SHE'S BLUE** (KC AND ALL-DM MAXINE)
F 9/16/2013 DAVID STRONG
Passed (\$6 600)

221 **BITS OF BELLA** (BELLA INFRARED-TOP SHOT)
F 9/28/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

222 **HS SORCERESS** (FLYIN MAN OF GOD-HS HONEY)
F 9/13/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

223 **BF PAR SWIFT** (SUPER LEE-BF FLYING GRACE)
F 8/21/2013 R & F KENNEL INC. OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Passed no bid.

224 **UNDERFIRE** (MARYVILLE RUMBLE*-MRL TOOTALOU)
F 9/24/2013 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR MRL METALS LLC
Scratched

225 **HOME MADE MONEY** (FLYING COAL CITY-INSTANT MONEY)
F 8/ 3/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Michael Frino \$5 000.00

226 **QUIRKY ONSLAUGHT** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S HARPER)
M 8/25/2013 JASON LIPARI OR JAMES ROSGA
Edward F. Gardner Jr. \$3 750.00

227 **TK LOREAL** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Passed no bid.

228 **JHAWK ROLLTIDE** (KC AND ALL-BRETT LEE QUEEN)
M 9/ 4/2013 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
Norman L. Rader \$11 500.00

229 **TK COVER GIRL** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-TK SPRING LOADED)
F 8/16/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Scratched

230 **TD ADELE** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
F 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

231 **AMPLIFIED LIFE** (CTW SPEEDY TRENT-DRIVEN PROMPTLY)
F 8/ 1/2013 KEVIN DALTON
Scratched

232 **ABS SO HARD** (BELLA INFRARED-ABILENE ABBY)
M 8/ 2/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO OR SUE BOATRIGHT
Scratched

233 **TD GWEN** (RHYTHMLESS-PENROSE DENA)
F 9/ 6/2013 NICK S. DE SALVO OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

234 **TK O HAPPY DAY** (LONESOME CRY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 8/23/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Ursula O'Donnell \$3 500.00

235 **RHAPSODY** (SHONN-GABLE CHEDDAR)
F 9/17/2013 RYAN J. O'DONNELL
Passed (\$4 750)

236 **HS SUNFLOWER** (PAT C CLEMENT-HS OPAL)
M 8/28/2013 WILLIS HILL
Scratched

237 **SE'S REAL DEAL** (KC AND ALL-FLYING CASSEL)
F 9/17/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
S. Lester Raines \$26 000.00

238 **KUTE DUKE** (FLYING PENSKE-KUTE KINGSLEY)
M 9/20/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

239 **TK STEVIE RAY** (LONESOME CRY-CAJUN FANTASY)
M 9/28/2013 MARTY D. TANNER
Vincent H. Savill \$2 500.00

240 **BA LITTLE PENG** (FARLOE BLACK*-VALLERI DEER)
F 10/ 1/2013 AUSTIN KING OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Ricardo Pacheco \$1 500.00

241 **KEEPER URSULA** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-KEEPER NORITAKE)
F 10/ 7/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

242 **QUIRKY MENTOR** (WW TIME WARP-GABLE DUFFY)
F 10/10/2013 JASON LIPARI
Norman L. Rader \$4 500.00

243 **PJ CRYSTAL CLEAR** (FLYING COAL CITY-CHINESE BREAD)
F 10/13/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Danny Clayton \$6 000.00

244 **MEXICAN CHICA** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
F 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

245 **BF PAR KINGSMAN** (BF FLYING STAN-KELSOS LEMONDROP)
M 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
James E. Blanchard \$4 250.00

246 **KEEPER BEE STING** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-GABLE MOLLY BEE)
M 10/23/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

247 **KB'S MISFIRE** (PACIFIC MILE*-PEPPERED BAKIN)
M 10/28/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
John Weber \$2 000.00

248 **PAR FIVE HOUR** (SUPER LEE-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
F 10/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Norman L. Rader \$3 750.00

249 **SE'S UHAUL MICK** (RED RANGER-FLYING ZAHARIAS)
M 10/ 1/2013 STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

250 **PJ ICE KING** (FLYING COAL CITY-CHINESE BREAD)
M 10/13/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Michael Harris \$20 000.00

251 **PAR VICKY** (RICO'S VINTAGE-CRY GIMMICK)
F 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Anthony Napolitano \$1 250.00

252 **PJ SIZZLIN HOT** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-UCME SMOKE N ACE)
F 10/12/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Norman A. Bitterman Jr. \$12 000.00

253 **MEXICAN HONDO** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
M 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Bentley Roberts \$2 000.00

254 **KB'S DEXTER** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S BY A MILE)
M 10/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Steve Sarras \$5 750.00

255 **PAR RED BULL** (SUPER LEE-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
M 10/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Tim Ertl \$13 000.00

256 **KIOWA HALF MOON** (BOB'S SKEET-FLYING NEW MOON)
M 10/31/2013 VINCE BERLAND
Scratched

257 **PJ NEED TO SPEED** (LONESOME CRY-GREYS RICOCHET)

M 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Michael Harris \$46 000.00

258 **KB'S REBEL** (PACIFIC MILE*-PEPPERED BAKIN)
M 10/28/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Coleen Pace \$4 500.00

259 **PAR OCTANE** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/ 9/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Scratched

260 **PJ LACKOFWISDOM** (FLYING WESTOVER-SR MIDNIGHT MOON)
F 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$13 000.00

261 **PJ SPEED TRAP** (LONESOME CRY-GREYS RICOCHET)
F 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$30 000.00

262 **KB'S CHARMER** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S BY A MILE)
F 10/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Jeffrey Knight \$3 000.00

263 **MEXICAN SENORITA** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
F 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

264 **PAR ODELLE** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/ 9/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Scratched

265 **PAR VINTAGE** (RICO'S VINTAGE-CRY GIMMICK)
M 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Passed no bid.

266 **PJ ST PIERRE** (DJAYS OCTANE-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
M 10/24/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Norman L. Rader \$11 000.00

267 **KB'S MINECRAFT** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S BY A MILE)
M 10/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Randy Finegan \$10 000.00

268 **BF PAR KLASSY** (BF FLYING STAN-KELSOS LEMONDROP)
F 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Passed no bid.

269 **SE'S RED ROSE C** (NMS SWEET THING-FLYING WINSLET)
F 10/ 4/2013 DOUGLAS G. CAREY OR STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

270 **MEXICAN BRONCO** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
M 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

271 **PAR ODESSA** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S RAVEN)
F 10/ 9/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Scratched

272 **PJ WONDER LAND** (FLYING WESTOVER-SR MIDNIGHT MOON)
F 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$12 000.00

273 **KB'S CRISP BAKIN** (PACIFIC MILE*-PEPPERED BAKIN)
M 10/28/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Robert Herber \$3 000.00

274 **KB'S STARLA** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S BY A MILE)
F 10/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Passed no bid.

275 **BF PAR KLONDIKE** (BF FLYING STAN-KELSOS LEMONDROP)
F 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR R & F KENNEL INC.
Passed no bid. \$0.00

276 **PJ ECLIPSE** (FLYING COAL CITY-CHINESE BREAD)
M 10/13/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
On-Line Racing \$7 000.00

277 **KEEPER JAFAR** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-KEEPER NORITAKE)
M 10/ 7/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

278 **SE'S RED RAGE C** (NMS SWEET THING-FLYING WINSLET)
F 10/ 4/2013 DOUGLAS G. CAREY OR STEVEN A. WARD
Scratched

279 **KEEPERBEEFURIOUS** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-GABLE MOLLY BEE)
M 10/23/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

280 **KB'S SCREAMER** (PACIFIC MILE*-PEPPERED BAKIN)
M 10/28/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Jerry Kramer \$2 000.00

281 **PAR VELVET** (RICO'S VINTAGE-CRY GIMMICK)
F 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Jason Hess \$6 000.00

282 **PJ SPEED DEMON** (LONESOME CRY-GREYS RICOCHET)
F 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Deborah Stricklaned \$20 000.00

283 **PJ PRETYBOYFLOYD** (DJAYS OCTANE-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
M 10/24/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Rodney Cooley \$31 000.00

284 **MEXICAN CHARRA** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
F 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched

285 **BA FARLOE CAT** (FARLOE BLACK*-VALLERI DEER)
F 10/ 1/2013 AUSTIN KING OR BOBBY JOE PARKER
Passed no bid.

286 **PAR OCTAGON** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/ 9/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Scratched

287 **KEEPER BEE SWARM** (HL'S TOD N TYLER-GABLE MOLLY BEE)
M 10/23/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

288 **PAR ENERGY** (SUPER LEE-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
F 10/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Norman L. Rader \$8 000.00

289 **PJ LET IT BE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-UCME SMOKE N ACE)
F 10/12/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Phyllis Savill \$10 500.00

290 **PJ SILVER MOON** (FLYING COAL CITY-CHINESE BREAD)
F 10/13/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
James Rosga \$4 500.00

291 **PAR SPEED BALL** (SUPER LEE-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
M 10/ 3/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
James Blanchard \$4 500.00

292 **KB'S KATANA** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S BY A MILE)
F 10/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Jason Hess \$4 250.00

293 **KB'S CUTE CINDY** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-SPRY DEROSA)
F 10/ 5/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Chris Palmieri Jr. \$2 750.00

294 **PJ SPEED BALL** (LONESOME CRY-GREYS RICOCHET)
F 10/22/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Scratched

295 **PAR OMAR** (DJAYS OCTANE-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/ 9/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Scratched

296 **DANGEROUS FIRE** (LONESOME CRY-LOUD RUMBLE)
M 10/13/2013 GREGORIO LEYVA
Passed no bid.

297 **PAR VICTORY** (RICO'S VINTAGE-CRY GIMMICK)
F 10/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Ricardo Pacheco \$3 000.00

298 **MULBERRY MISTY** (BOB'S SKEET-MULBERRY SHANA)
F 11/ 3/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Passed (\$2 000)

299 **MARKSMAN** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
M 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Passed no bid.

300 **CLEAR VALUE** (BELLA INFRARED-FACE VALUE)
M 11/17/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

301 **WALL FLOWER** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
F 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Passed no bid.

302 **TNT SEXTON** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-WWK COLD MAY)
M 11/10/2013 ROSS TAPLIN OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

303 **LOVE THAT TIGER** (PG TIGER-SUNSANDS EVE)
F 11/ 1/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

304 **PJ PARTY FAVOR** (DJAYS OCTANE-SAN TAN PARTY ON)
F 11/ 2/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Vince Berland \$10 000.00

305 **GUILTY** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
M 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Scratched

306 **MULBERRY FREEZIN** (BOB'S SKEET-MULBERRY SHANA)
M 11/ 3/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Passed no bid.

307 **CATCH THAT TIGER** (PG TIGER-SUNSANDS EVE)
M 11/ 1/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

308 **PJ KATNISS** (DJAYS OCTANE-BLACKJACK CRUNCH)
F 11/21/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Steve Sarras \$13 000.00

309 **TNT NELSON** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-WWK COLD MAY)
F 11/10/2013 ROSS TAPLIN OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

310 **JAVA OLYMPIC** (FLYING PENSKE-TORNADO TOES)
M 11/26/2013 JASON MARTIN
Scratched

311 **OAKS QUIGLEY** (DJAYS OCTANE-ROOFTOP GABBY TO)
M 11/ 1/2013 MICK HYMES
Scratched

312 **DANCIN BOMBAY** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-GABLE AEROSMITH)
F 11/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
Randy Finegan \$6 250.00

313 **PJ IDONTGETTIRED** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BIKINI BAR)
M 11/ 5/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Michael harris \$20 000.00

314 **TNT EKELER** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-WWK COLD MAY)

M 11/10/2013 ROSS TAPLIN OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

315 **MULBERRY SUNNY** (HI NOON HERO-MULBERRY DREAMER)
M 11/24/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Kathleen Jones \$3 500.00

316 **PJ NINA NINE** (DJAYS OCTANE-CANTTELLMENOTHIN)
F 11/18/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Terry Scott \$11 000.00

317 **GREAT DAME** (TYRUR ALEX*-SUNSAND PEARL)
F 11/23/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

318 **LAST SCORE** (TYRUR ALEX*-SUNSAND PEARL)
F 11/23/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

319 **PJ NUKE EM** (DJAYS OCTANE-CANTTELLMENOTHIN)
F 11/18/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Rodney Cooley \$12 000.00

320 **TNT SPROLES** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-WWK COLD MAY)
F 11/10/2013 ROSS TAPLIN OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Scratched

321 **MULBERRY COOL** (BOB'S SKEET-MULBERRY SHANA)
M 11/ 3/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Scratched

322 **PJ PARTY HARDY** (DJAYS OCTANE-SAN TAN PARTY ON)
M 11/ 2/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Danny Clayton \$8 000.00

323 **JAVA PATRIOT** (FLYING PENSKE-TORNADO TOES)
M 11/26/2013 JASON MARTIN
Scratched

324 **KEEPER GETAGRIP** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-GABLE AEROSMITH)
M 11/ 2/2013 GREEN SMITH
Scratched

325 **PJ IJUSWANAPARTY** (DJAYS OCTANE-SAN TAN PARTY ON)
M 11/ 2/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Norman A. Bitterman Jr. \$8 000.00

326 **MULBERRY MUGY** (BOB'S SKEET-MULBERRY SHANA)
M 11/ 3/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Scratched

327 **SKYBOX** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
F 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Scratched

328 **KEEP THAT TIGER** (PG TIGER-SUNSANDS EVE)
M 11/ 1/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON

Scratched

329 **AMAZING VALUE** (BELLA INFRARED-FACE VALUE)
F 11/17/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

330 **TNT LOCKETT** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-WWK COLD MAY)
M 11/10/2013 ROSS TAPLIN OR TOM G. TAPLIN
Passed (\$5 750)

331 **PJ SHOTGUNRIDER** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BIKINI BAR)
M 11/ 5/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Steve Sarras \$9 000.00

332 **SINKER** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
M 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Scratched

333 **PJ GUTSOVERFEAR** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BIKINI BAR)
M 11/ 5/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Steve Sarras \$9 500.00

334 **DESIGNER VALUE** (BELLA INFRARED-FACE VALUE)
F 11/17/2013 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched

335 **KISS THAT TIGER** (PG TIGER-SUNSANDS EVE)
F 11/ 1/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

336 **PJ PLUTARCH** (DJAYS OCTANE-BLACKJACK CRUNCH)
M 11/21/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Thomas A. Ferris \$20 000.00

337 **KNOWN AFFILIATE** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
M 11/18/2013 RYAN J. O'DONNELL
Scratched

338 **BACHELOR** (GREAT SON-SEEGOLD SERAFINA)
M 11/18/2013 URSULA O'DONNELL
Scratched

339 **PJ NEGATIVENANCY** (DJAYS OCTANE-CANTELLMENOTHIN)
F 11/18/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Terry Scott \$10 000.00

340 **BIG CIGAR** (TYRUR ALEX*-SUNSAND PEARL)
M 11/23/2013 HARLAND V. OLSON
Scratched

341 **DANCIN BACARDI** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-GABLE AEROSMITH)
F 11/ 2/2013 PETER LIMMER
John Gagovits \$2 000.00

342 **MULBERRY DALE** (HI NOON HERO-MULBERRY DREAMER)
M 11/24/2013 MICK MASSA OR DAVID STRONG
Scratched