

Spring Meet 2015 Brood Auction Results

1 **TIGER GIRL** (FLYING PENSKE-FLYING EXQUISITE)
F 10/ 2/2009 VINCE BERLAND
David L. Hays \$2500.00

2 **DAPHNE** (LONESOME CRY-WW HEART BREAKER)
F 3/23/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

3 **FLYING METALLEAF** (FLYING HYDROGEN-CTW TWANG THANG)
F 2/ 6/2012 VINCE BERLAND
Victor Jay Rangel \$3750.00

4 **TY KAY WILLING** (BALLYMAC FLIGHT*-KIOWA SUE MARY)
F 10/27/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Anthony Napolitano \$750.00

5 **FLYING TREASURY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING MONA LISA)
F 10/28/2007 VINCE BERLAND
David L. Hays \$4000.00

6 **LUCKY BETTY** (KIOWA PRETENCE-SOL BRANDY)
F 2/14/2011 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

7 **ELECTRIC WISP** (SUPERMAN FAST-SWEET DRAGON)
F 10/13/2011 MICHAEL A. LASKY
Scratched

8 **DE'S SPUN** (GABLE DODGE-EUPHRATES)
F 10/24/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

9 **VENUS BASALDUA** (KIOWA MON MANNY-SOL VENUS)
F 10/10/2009 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC. OR VINCENT H. SAV
Mick Ryan \$500.00

10 **FLYING HUMIDITY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KAY V KEEP WET)
F 8/19/2010 VINCE BERLAND
Larry Pollard \$3000.00

11 **JIM LEAD** (WW APPLE JAX-FLYING SLOWLY)
F 1/ 3/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Melissa Schmidt \$1750.00

12 **FLYING EYELET** (FLYING PENSKE-FLYING BUTTONS)
F 7/11/2009 VINCE BERLAND
S. Lester Raines \$3000.00

13 **BESSIE** (TROJAN CRUZE-FLYING BROOKSIDE)
F 6/15/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Debra Binegar \$500.00

14 **GABLE NIBLETS** (WATERVIEW STAR-GABLE INDIA)
F 6/11/2008 GREEN SMITH
Philip Harris \$1000.00

15 **FLYING EXCLAIM** (FLYING GUNMAN-FLYING EXQUISITE)
F 5/22/2012 VINCE BERLAND
Tim Ertl \$2750.00

16 **CLEVER SARA** (FLYING HYDROGEN-KIOWA CLEVERGIRL)
F 9/22/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

17 **ROC A BY BUTTONS** (SOPRANO DRIVE-FLYIN UNDERSTUDY)
F 3/ 1/2012 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Melissa Schmidt \$3000.00

18 **MOHICAN DUTCHESS** (KIOWA BET DUTCH-KIOWA SUGARFREE)
F 4/17/2013 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

19 **TNJ DIAMOND** (HEART RUMBLE*-TNJ SNOW CONE)
F 11/17/2010 URSULA O'DONNELL
Passed no bid.

20 **FLYING APPLETARA** (WW APPLE JAX-FLYING TARA)
F 5/24/2011 VINCE BERLAND
Larry Pollard \$3500.00

21 **SUPER WOMAN** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BAYSUPERSTITIOUS)
F 8/20/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Jerry Barber \$750.00

22 **EXPLOSIVE TRENT** (TRENT LEE-ONECO ESMERELDA)
F 3/ 1/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES LLC
Robert Crossland \$2250.00

23 **KAY ROCK SOLID** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-RAISING ROCK)
F 9/18/2011 VINCE BERLAND
Steve Ward \$3000.00

24 **GOLD FRAMED PRINT (-)**
Tim Ertl (\$1250) \$0.00

25 **JANE MADDY** (BD'S GRAYSON-FLYING MEADE)
F 5/ 2/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

26 **FLYING FINNISH** (STAN'S BOY FLYER-FLYING SNAP ON)
F 3/23/2011 VINCE BERLAND
Paul P. Bitterman \$7000.00

27 **KIOWA TAM TIPPIE** (KIOWA PRETENCE-KAY TAM TAMMY)
F 2/20/2011 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Edward E. Bolton \$750.00

28 **KB'S ROCKY ROAD** (LONESOME CRY-TEMPO ARTIC FOX)
F 12/11/2008 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

29 **KIOWA JILL BOOM** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-LAZY K JILL)

F 7/ 7/2009 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Norman L. Rader \$750.00

30 **WILMA WISHBONE** (TYRUR ALEX*-GARNET AUTUMN)
F 9/26/2011 JOSEPH M. FUSARO JR.
Frederick A. Fulchino \$1000.00

31 **ROC A BY DANCER** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING EMOTION)
F 1/30/2010 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

32 **KIOWA LEER KAY** (KELSOS FUSILEER-KIOWA KAY TIPTON)
F 7/ 5/2012 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Brant Taplin \$750.00

33 **FLYING SNOOKI** (NMS SWEET THING-FLYING MANCINI)
F 8/26/2011 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

34 **GREYHOUND ASHTRAY** (-)
Cindy Gale (\$85.00)

35 **KAY OUTRAGE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KIOWAFILMFORTUNE)
F 2/20/2011 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

36 **GABLE GISELLE** (GABLE TABASCO-GABLE WENDY)
F 9/19/2009 GREEN SMITH
Passed no bid.

37 **FLYING NARCISSA** (BD'S GRAYSON-FLYING WITNESS)
F 2/26/2012 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

38 **KIOWA CAT COTTON** (LONESOME CRY-LAZY K TOP CAT)
F 7/ 1/2009 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Debra Binegar \$500.00

39 **ROC A BY SHOGIRL** (SOPRANO DRIVE-FLYIN UNDERSTUDY)
F 3/ 1/2012 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Donna Barr \$750.00

40 **KIOWA VICTORY** (DRAGON FIRE-KIOWA HART DONNA)
F 6/20/2009 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

41 **CUSTOM TRENT** (TRENT LEE-GIFTED WHISTLER)
F 8/29/2008 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES LLC
Passed no bid.

42 **CRAIG'S GAL** (FLYING STANLEY-VJ'S KINTES GAL)
F 4/12/2008 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

43 **KIOWA AQUAMARINE** (TRENT LEE-SOL MACARIA)
F 5/16/2009 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.

Rachelle Henry \$2250.00

44 **ROC A BY SHU SHU** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FIRST HAND SMOKE)
F 1/22/2011 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Steven A. Ward \$1500.00

45 **KIOWA RED VALLEY** (FLYING COAL CITY-FLYING RED RIVER)
F 10/14/2011 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Brant Taplin \$1750.00

46 **MANTLE CLOCK** (-)

Ricardo Pacheco (\$150)

47 **SIMPLICITY RED** (GABLE DODGE-TOVI THE PROUD)
F 12/ 7/2012 VINCE BERLAND
Edward F. Garnder Jr. \$750.00

48 **KIOWA SHOOK** (FUZZYS CANNON-KIOWA JSK SOL)
F 10/11/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Jerry Barber \$750.00

49 **GABLE SIGHTS** (GABLE SOUR CREAM-RJ'S B DOG)
F 10/25/2010 GREEN SMITH
Passed no bid.

50 **ROC A BY GYPSY** (FLYING HYDROGEN-FIRST HAND SMOKE)
F 12/ 3/2011 HAROLD L. MILLER OR VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.

51 **KIOWA TY TCI** (KAY V TATOO TONY-KIOWA TIFFANY)
F 5/27/2010 SMITH GREYHOUNDS INC.
Passed no bid.

52 **FLYING BERGEN** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GABLE ACADIA)
F 7/ 5/2008 VINCE BERLAND
Passed no bid.