

NGA Spring Meet Brood Auction Results

- 1 **MULBERRY SATIN** (FLYING PENSKE-JR'S PRESTIGE)
F 2/20/2008 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$3,500.00
- 2 **FLEET FEAT CAT** (DODGEM BY DESIGN-SUNFLOWER SUZY*)
F 1/19/2008 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$750.00
- 3 **AWESOME FEATHER** (WW APPLE JAX-CRAIGIE SO SOON)
F 2/11/2010 H. HAL GILL
Purchaser: Kenneth Biehle, \$1,000.00
- 4 **FLYING BASIE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GABLE ACADIA)
F 10/ 3/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: N.J. Sherck, \$1,000.00
- 5 **IRUSKA KINETIC** (DODGEM BY DESIGN-IRUSKA HIALEAH)
F 1/31/2007 BOB RIGGIN
Purchaser: Passed (\$1,000),
- 6 **DE'S PREMONITION** (GABLE DODGE-EUPHRATES)
F 10/24/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
- 7 **SKATE PARCHY** (OSWALD COBBLEPOT-BOW COMEBACK)
F 4/20/2010 DEAN MINER
Purchaser: Kenneth Biehle, \$2,000.00
- 8 **KR GRETA** (FLYING PENSKE-KELSOS SILKY)
F 6/ 1/2009 JOE RECKER
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$1,000.00
- 9 **FLYING OLEVIA** (GABLE DODGE-FLYING MONA BALE)
F 5/18/2009 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$600.00
- 10 **RC ALL FIRED UP** (EXTRUDING DREAM-RC HIEDI HO)
F 5/ 3/2010 COLEEN PACE OR HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Passed (\$750),
- 11 **LUXURIOUS TRENT** (TRENT LEE-BEYOND REPROACH)
F 4/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Purchaser: Melissa Schmidt, \$3,750.00
- 12 **RAISING ROCK** (P'S RAISING CAIN-GREYS MAGIC ROCK)
F 2/28/2009 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$6,250.00
- 13 **MULBERRY SHANA** (FLYING PENSKE-JR'S PRESTIGE)
F 2/20/2008 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Ashley Lail, \$2,750.00
- 14 **FLYING KRAIT** (WW APPLE JAX-JR'S PURELUCK)
F 10/ 5/2007 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: N.J. Sherck, \$3,000.00
- 15 **BI'S BEACH GIRL** (RHYTHMLESS-BI'S HUNTER)
F 3/29/2011 DIANNA C. OR JOSEPH A. DOUGLAS
Purchaser: Ray Wong, \$2,500.00
- 16 **FLYING FINCH** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-HAPPY RUCKUS)
F 11/24/2005 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: William Randle, \$1,000.00
- 17 **IRUSKA TOO COOL** (COOL PERFORMANCE-IRUSKA CARPIDIEM)
F 3/ 4/2007 BOB RIGGIN
Purchaser: Victor Jay Rangel, \$3,000.00
- 18 **CTW LILWHITELIE** (SUPER LEE-CTW POP A WHEELY)
F 12/ 2/2010 DEAN MINER
Purchaser: Rod Boatright, \$2,500.00
- 19 **FLYING WELLSBURG** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING CRESTLINE)
F 6/24/2006 VINCE BERLAND

Purchaser: Tim Ertl, \$2,250.00
20 **RB GRACIE JO** (KIOWA MON MANNY-RB GRACELAND JO)
F 6/24/2009 JOE RECKER
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
21 **RC BEYONCE** (DEERFIELD SITE*-RC POWER AMY)
F 4/17/2008 HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Passed (\$750),
22 **FLYING KINNEY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GABLE KISATCHIE)
F 10/10/2009 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Tim Ertl, \$3,500.00
23 **WHISTLER'S WRATH** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-SOFT TRENT)
F 8/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Purchaser: Robert Crossland, \$3,500.00
24 **TIGER LOVE** (FLYING PENSKE-FLYING EXQUISITE)
F 10/ 2/2009 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$8,000.00
25 **RK'S JEOPARDY** (CAYMAN WENT-RK'S WANNABELOVE)
F 4/16/2006 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
26 **READY TWO PUNCH** (D'S KLINGER-SWEEPING BEAUTY)
F 7/ 3/2010 DIANNA C. OR JOSEPH A. DOUGLAS
Purchaser: Phillip Pruett, \$2,700.00
27 **FLYING JOJO** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FUZZYS ROADRUNER)
F 7/ 7/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
28 **WILD FOR YOU** (ELWAY DRIVE-MARION JONES)
F 11/ 3/2006 MICHAEL A. LASKY
Purchaser: Scratched,
29 **CTU SIDE PARTY** (KC AND ALL-GREYS RED RIBBON)
F 4/27/2011 BOBBY JOE PARKER AND JOSEPH A. OR DIANNA
Purchaser: Charles Sabanty, \$5,250.00
30 **FLYING INFINITI** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FLYING BARCHETTA)
F 7/14/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$2,000.00
31 **RC FRENCH KISS** (DEERFIELD SITE*-RC HOT STUFF)
F 4/ 9/2009 HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
32 **GIFTED WHISTLER** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-GIFTED)
F 10/16/2006 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES
Purchaser: Mark C. Adams, \$900.00
33 **KIOWA PESINA** (DRAGON FIRE-KAY V SWEET KAY)
F 4/ 2/2011 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$10,000.00
34 **MULBERRY DREAMER** (DEERFIELD SITE*-MULBERRY DUSTY)
F 3/ 2/2009 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
35 **MISS PHENOMENON** (HK'S PHENOMENON-WHISTLER'S MISS)
F 8/ 2/2008 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
36 **FLYING AERONAUT** (STAN'S BOY FLYER-KAY V SAY WHO)
F 11/ 7/2007 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$5,750.00
37 **IRUSKA KITTLE** (DODGEM BY DESIGN-IRUSKA HIALEAH)
F 1/31/2007 BOB RIGGIN
Purchaser: Kenneth Biehle, \$3,000.00
38 **FLYING SEASIDE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-FUZZYS SEAHAWK)
F 10/14/2005 VINCE BERLAND

Purchaser: Tim Ertl, \$3,250.00
39 **KELLS MISTY MAY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KARAOKE CAT)
F 6/15/2011 MICHAEL A. JACKSON OR JOHN DALTON
Purchaser: Jeff Cole, \$4,000.00
40 **FLYING AFLAME** (FLYING HYDROGEN-BLAZIN ALMA)
F 3/ 9/2008 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Joseph M. Fusaro, Jr., \$4,000.00
41 **RC RAISING SAND** (EXTRUDING DREAM-RC HIEDI HO)
F 5/ 3/2010 COLEEN PACE OR HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Brant Taplin, \$3,000.00
42 **FLYING SNAP** (FLYING PENSKE-FLYING BUTTONS)
F 7/11/2009 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: N.J. Sherck, \$3,500.00
43 **SOFT TRENT** (TRENT LEE-SOFT MELODY)
F 12/ 6/2005 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$1,750.00
44 **BAYSUPERSTITIOUS** (FLYING PENSKE-DALCASH EAGLE*)
F 5/17/2006 VINCE BERLAND
Purchaser: Ursula O'Donnell, \$1,750.00