

NGA Spring Meet Race Auction Results

- 1 **HEAT SEEKER** (BLAZIN WILDFIRE-CDN COLD SNAP)
M 12/29/2012 JUDI BOULTON
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 2 **CTW NOTGONNABEG** (LONESOME CRY-CTW MAKE IT WORK)
F 12/14/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
- 3 **FIRE DOWN BELOW** (FLYING PENSKE-ELECTRA CHICK)
F 12/ 2/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 4 **PJ FANCY CAT** (DJAYS OCTANE-THATAWAY CAT)
F 12/15/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Arlyn D. Hall, \$2,250.00
- 5 **KB'S ICE CHEST** (YAHOO OMAR-BACKWOOD HANNAH)
F 12/12/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$16,000.00
- 6 **TB'S SKY CAPTAIN** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
M 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$16,000.00
- 7 **MISS KAY** (BLAZIN WILDFIRE-CDN COLD SNAP)
F 12/29/2012 JUDI BOULTON
Purchaser: Coleen Pace, \$5,000.00
- 8 **KB'S COCOA** (YAHOO OMAR-BACKWOOD HANNAH)
F 12/12/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$5,000.00
- 9 **TB'S HOT PURSUIT** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
F 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jerry Kramer, \$4,250.00
- 10 **MIGHTY QWUIN** (FLYING PENSKE-ELECTRA CHICK)
M 12/ 2/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 11 **PJ GOTOCHURCH** (DJAYS OCTANE-CTW HAIR RAISING)
F 12/ 5/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$14,000.00
- 12 **PAR GO BOY** (TRENT LEE-BD'S GILDA)
M 12/25/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$3,750.00
- 13 **PJ FATHER DAVE** (DJAYS OCTANE-CTW HAIR RAISING)
M 12/ 5/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$50,000.00
- 14 **KB'S BABY HAWK** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-KEEPER DESIGN)
F 12/17/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$2,750.00
- 15 **GEZ SHIRLEY** (GABLE DODGE-TOVI THE PROUD)
F 12/ 7/2012 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 16 **PJ ROMANCE ME** (DJAYS OCTANE-UCME FASTROMANCE)
F 12/24/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 17 **SIMPLICITY RED** (GABLE DODGE-TOVI THE PROUD)
F 12/ 7/2012 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 18 **TURBO CAL** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO WIND BLOWN)
M 12/ 9/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Scratched,
- 19 **TB'S FAMOUS AMOS** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
M 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE

Purchaser: Jerry Patterson, \$8,750.00
20 **PJ CROBAT** (KIOWA MON MANNY-NEVER AGAIN CAT)
M 12/ 4/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$3,500.00
21 **TURBO CERDIC** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO WIND BLOWN)
M 12/ 9/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
22 **RICHARD PARKER** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BEYOND REPROACH)
M 12/12/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: Joseph Frenette, \$8,000.00
23 **TB'S FLO RITA** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
F 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
24 **PJ CHANCY** (KIOWA MON MANNY-NEVER AGAIN CAT)
F 12/ 4/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$6,500.00
25 **CTW KUPCAKE** (LONESOME CRY-CTW FANNY FLASH)
F 12/22/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
26 **DANCIN BINIONS** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-EL HOT PEPPER)
M 12/19/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Scratched,
27 **KB'S MORENO** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-KEEPER DESIGN)
M 12/17/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
28 **GEZ TONY** (GABLE DODGE-TOVI THE PROUD)
M 12/ 7/2012 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Tornadic Greyhounds, \$2,250.00
29 **BLAZIN BONFIRE** (BLAZIN WILDFIRE-CDN COLD SNAP)
F 12/29/2012 JUDI BOULTON
Purchaser: Passed (\$6,500),
30 **EYES EASY** (DEFRIM BALE*-SITE FORSOREEYES)
M 12/12/2012 MICHAEL D. STRICKLAND
Purchaser: Scratched,
31 **KB'S SEA BREEZE** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-KEEPER DESIGN)
F 12/17/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$5,000.00
32 **TURBO CARTER** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO WIND BLOWN)
M 12/ 9/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Scratched,
33 **REIGN SUPREME** (FLYING PENSKE-ELECTRA CHICK)
M 12/ 2/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
34 **TB'S DUKE NUKEM** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
M 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$10,750.00
35 **BLAZIN HELLFIRE** (BLAZIN WILDFIRE-CDN COLD SNAP)
F 12/29/2012 JUDI BOULTON
Purchaser: Passed (\$2,500),
36 **PJ COMMUNION** (DJAYS OCTANE-CTW HAIR RAISING)
F 12/ 5/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
37 **KB'S PLAY ZONE** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-KEEPER DESIGN)
F 12/17/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$5,000.00
38 **TURBO CARLOS** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO WIND BLOWN)
M 12/ 9/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS

Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$10,500.00
39 **CTW NERO** (LONESOME CRY-CTW MAKE IT WORK)
M 12/14/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Scratched,
41 **PJ NO ROMANCE** (DJAYS OCTANE-UCME FASTROMANCE)
M 12/24/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$2,500.00
42 **KB'S BABA JANE** (YAHOO OMAR-KEEPER BOW LING)
F 12/30/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Tornadic Greyhounds, \$1,750.00
43 **PAR GRETA** (TRENT LEE-BD'S GILDA)
F 12/25/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$5,000.00
44 **TB'S STAR POWER** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
M 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$2,500.00
45 **EXPERT TEXPERT** (FLYING PENSKE-ELECTRA CHICK)
M 12/ 2/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
46 **CTW NITROUS** (LONESOME CRY-CTW MAKE IT WORK)
M 12/14/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Scratched,
47 **KB'S ZIGZAG ZOE** (SWITZLER JAMMIN-KEEPER DESIGN)
F 12/17/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Chris Palmieri, \$5,000.00
48 **PJ CHARZARD** (KIOWA MON MANNY-NEVER AGAIN CAT)
M 12/ 4/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: James Rosga, \$4,750.00
49 **PJ CHICKERITA** (KIOWA MON MANNY-NEVER AGAIN CAT)
F 12/ 4/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
50 **CTW KLONDIKE** (LONESOME CRY-CTW FANNY FLASH)
M 12/22/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Scratched,
51 **QUIRKY KINGDOM** (FLYING WESTOVER-CROBAT)
M 04/16/2014 JASON LIPARI
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$3,750.00
52 **TB'S GO PRO** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-TEMPO DEE OH GEE)
M 12/ 6/2012 TROY BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jerry Patterson, \$7,000.00
53 **PJ GETBACKCAT** (DJAYS OCTANE-THATAWAY CAT)
F 12/15/2012 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Jesse Walker, \$1,250.00
54 **GEZ SWEET** (GABLE DODGE-TOVI THE PROUD)
F 12/ 7/2012 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Scratched,
55 **KB'S FLY FISHER** (YAHOO OMAR-BACKWOOD HANNAH)
M 12/12/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Ray Wong, \$1,100.00
56 **JIGGY WIDDIT** (FLYING PENSKE-ELECTRA CHICK)
F 12/ 2/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
57 **GOGO ASHLEY** (PFANNYS TINY TIM-CV'S MOLLY)
F 1/ 2/2013 SHAWN PFANNENSTIEL
Purchaser: Scratched,
58 **PAR VIXEN** (RICO'S VINTAGE-KELSOS GINSENG)
F 1/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$2,750.00
59 **BLAZINGIRLONFIRE** (PADDY WHACKER-BLAZIN SPITFIRE)
F 1/ 8/2013 JUDI BOULTON
Purchaser: Dean Miner, \$7,500.00
60 **PJ SAZERAC** (BD'S GRAYSON-GREYT STAR)
F 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$2,500.00
61 **HS BING** (FLYING COAL CITY-HS OPAL)
M 1/ 1/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Passed (\$3,250),
62 **KB'S TIN EAGLE** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING EXORCIST)
M 1/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Chris Palmieri, \$1,250.00
63 **PJ CASH GAME** (DJAYS OCTANE-BLACKJACK CRUNCH)
F 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$3,000.00
64 **PAR DECK** (LONESOME CRY-OSHKOSH DACEY)
M 1/25/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$2,250.00
65 **GOGO LISA** (PFANNYS TINY TIM-CV'S MOLLY)
F 1/ 2/2013 SHAWN PFANNENSTIEL
Purchaser: Joseph Frenette, \$10,000.00
65 **KB'S BUS STOP** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
F 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
67 **HS TOOTIE FRUITY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-MRL TOOTALOU)
F 1/26/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Scratched,
68 **HS TOOT TOOT** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-MRL TOOTALOU)
F 1/26/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Scratched,
69 **PJ REFINED** (PG TIGER-GREYS RICOCHET)
F 1/30/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$52,500.00
70 **DEJA VUE** (PADDY WHACKER-BLAZIN SPITFIRE)
F 1/ 8/2013 MELISSA SCHMIDT
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$7,500.00
71 **MR. SHILLELAGH** (PADDY WHACKER-CDN CRAZY TO GO)
M 1/25/2013 LISA RICHES
Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$40,000.00
72 **KB'S CRAZY EYES** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
F 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$5,250.00
73 **PJ AFFABLE** (PG TIGER-GREYS RICOCHET)
F 1/30/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
74 **HS GEORGIA** (LONESOME CRY-WWW BETTY DAVIS)
F 1/27/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Scratched,
75 **BLAZIN HOTTIE** (PADDY WHACKER-BLAZIN SPITFIRE)
F 1/ 8/2013 MELISSA SCHMIDT
Purchaser: Scratched,
76 **KB'S ROCKET DOG** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
M 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jerry Patterson, \$5,250.00
77 **PJ DEBONAIR** (PG TIGER-GREYS RICOCHET)
M 1/30/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Randy Doubles, \$6,500.00
78 **HS EMERALD** (FLYING COAL CITY-HS OPAL)
F 1/ 1/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$12,500.00
79 **KB'S FAST N ALL** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
M 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$1,500.00
80 **PJ RESILIENT** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-UCME RETRO)
M 1/27/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Randy Doubles, \$4,500.00
81 **PJ PLAYMATE** (DJAYS OCTANE-DJAYS JUST PLAYN)
F 1/27/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$4,500.00
82 **KB'S SAND CRAB** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
M 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Chris Palmieri, \$1,250.00
83 **PJ INSANEFLASH** (DJAYS OCTANE-PACIFIC FLASH)
F 1/16/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
84 **AMANDA SELF** (FLYING WESTOVER-REAL IMAGE)
F 1/14/2013 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
85 **PJ RUSTY NAIL** (BD'S GRAYSON-GREYT STAR)
M 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$5,500.00
86 **RUBY RUSH** (PADDY WHACKER-CDN CRAZY TO GO)
F 1/25/2013 LISA RICHES
Purchaser: Passed (\$2,500),
87 **KB'S FAST SHERRY** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING EXORCIST)
F 1/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$4,000.00
88 **PAR VELOCITY** (RICO'S VINTAGE-KELSOS GINSENG)
F 1/ 1/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$2,750.00
89 **KB'S WINDSOR** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING EXORCIST)
M 1/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Ray Wong, \$3,000.00
90 **PJ PLAYTIME** (DJAYS OCTANE-DJAYS JUST PLAYN)
M 1/27/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Daniel W. Clayton, \$3,000.00
91 **HS TOOTSIE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-MRL TOOTALOU)
F 1/26/2013 WILLIS HILL
Purchaser: Scratched,
92 **EMILY SHARP** (FLYING WESTOVER-REAL IMAGE)
F 1/14/2013 TWILITE KENNELS, LLC
Purchaser: Passed (\$2,750),
93 **PJ JOUSTER** (FLYING PENSKE-UCME HOLDONTIGHT)
M 1/25/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
94 **KB'S BRASH LADY** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING EXORCIST)
F 1/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Bentley Roberts, \$2,000.00
95 **PAR DOMINIC** (LONESOME CRY-OSHKOSH DACEY)
M 1/25/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$4,750.00
96 **CRAZY DIAMOND** (PADDY WHACKER-CDN CRAZY TO GO)
F 1/25/2013 LISA RICHES

Purchaser: Passed (\$2,250),
97 **BLOWIN HI DOUGH** (PADDY WHACKER-BLAZIN SPITFIRE)
M 1/ 8/2013 MELISSA SCHMIDT

Purchaser: Scratched,
98 **GOGO PAIGE** (PFANNYS TINY TIM-CV'S MOLLY)
F 1/ 2/2013 SHAWN PFANNENSTIEL

Purchaser: Passed (\$2,250),
99 **LEAPING LORENZO** (KELSOS LORENZO-PG IN THE NEWS)
M 1/11/2013 GARY COSSEL

Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$5,500.00
100 **PJ RICCO SUAVE** (PG TIGER-GREYS RICOCHET)
M 1/30/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$22,000.00
101 **GOGO GRACIE** (PFANNYS TINY TIM-CV'S MOLLY)
F 1/ 2/2013 SHAWN PFANNENSTIEL

Purchaser: Scratched,
102 **HS RUBY** (FLYING COAL CITY-HS OPAL)
F 1/ 1/2013 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: Scratched,
103 **KB'S SKY KATY** (YAHOO OMAR-FLYING EXORCIST)
F 1/11/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Yadwinder Singh Dod, \$1,250.00
104 **KB'S JET PACK** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
M 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Scratched,
105 **PJ GETPLAYED** (DJAYS OCTANE-DJAYS JUST PLAYN)
F 1/27/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: John Weber, \$3,250.00
106 **PJ TEXASHOLDEM** (DJAYS OCTANE-BLACKJACK CRUNCH)
M 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$25,000.00
107 **KB'S WILD HEART** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
F 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Vincent H. Savill, \$6,000.00
108 **KB'S JETT LEE** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
M 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Edward F. Gardner, Jr., \$3,000.00
109 **PJ DIPLOMATIC** (PG TIGER-GREYS RICOCHET)
M 1/30/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Plum Creek Kennel, \$10,500.00
110 **PJ AMERICANO** (BD'S GRAYSON-GREYT STAR)
M 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$5,250.00
111 **DANCIN SNOWHITE** (EL PASSION-DANCIN REBA)
F 1/ 4/2013 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: Chris Palmieri, \$2,750.00
112 **HS YAHOO** (FLYING COAL CITY-HS OPAL)
M 1/ 1/2013 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: H. Hal Gill, \$5,000.00
113 **PJ PLAYDAY** (DJAYS OCTANE-DJAYS JUST PLAYN)
F 1/27/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$3,750.00
114 **PJ OMAHA** (DJAYS OCTANE-BLACKJACK CRUNCH)
M 1/26/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Scratched,
115 **KB'S BOOM TOWN** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-KB'S MIMOSA)
F 1/17/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Edward F. Gardner, Jr., \$1,750.00
116 **HS TEE REX** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-MRL TOOTALOU)
M 1/26/2013 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: Scratched,
117 **NO SUGAR TO NITE** (PADDY WHACKER-CDN CRAZY TO GO)
F 1/25/2013 LISA RICHES

Purchaser: Passed (\$3,250),
118 **PAR SCARLET** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
F 2/ 2/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: Scratched,
119 **RC SHOWOFF** (BONAFIDE TOP DOG-RC SHOW BIZ)
F 2/24/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING

Purchaser: Scratched,
120 **DANCIN EXCALIBUR** (EL PASSION-HI NOON HOTTIE)
M 2/ 3/2013 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: Jay Squared Racing, \$3,750.00
121 **AMIGOS POLKA** (RHYTHMLESS-PEPPERED BAKIN)
F 2/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Sam C. Tidwell, \$5,000.00
122 **PJ DROP STEP** (DJAYS OCTANE-BIKINI BAR)
M 2/ 8/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Scratched,
123 **TB'S MONSTAR** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-SHERIFF BREES)
M 2/26/2013 TROY BIEHLE

Purchaser: Vince Berland, \$3,750.00
124 **AMIGOS TANGO** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO REMARKABLE)
M 2/15/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Scratched,
125 **DANCIN MOHICAN** (EL PASSION-HI NOON HOTTIE)
M 2/ 3/2013 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: Geoff Collins, \$3,500.00
126 **PJ EXQUISITE** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
F 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Joseph Trudden, \$4,000.00
127 **RC TOP BIZ** (BONAFIDE TOP DOG-RC SHOW BIZ)
M 2/24/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING

Purchaser: Scratched,
128 **KB'S ELECTRAFY** (LONESOME CRY-TOKEN LADY A)
F 2/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: John Weber, \$2,500.00
129 **KB'S LANDROVER** (LONESOME CRY-TOKEN LADY A)
M 2/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$6,000.00
130 **PJ ALLEY OOP** (DJAYS OCTANE-BIKINI BAR)
M 2/ 8/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Scratched,
131 **AMIGOS CHA CHA** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO REMARKABLE)
F 2/15/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Craig Tasens, \$1,250.00
132 **RC UNO DOG** (TMC'S REMEDY-RC BEYONCE)
M 2/18/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$10,250.00
133 **PJ WICKED** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
F 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$19,000.00
134 **PJ CHOICE** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
F 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Tim Ertl, \$9,000.00
135 **CTW OLAYINKA** (DJAYS OCTANE-CTW POLE DANCER)
F 02/02/2013 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Edward F. Gardner, Jr., \$3,500.00
136 **AMIGOS WOBBLE** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO REMARKABLE)
F 2/15/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: John Weber, \$2,250.00
137 **PJ COGNAC** (DJAYS OCTANE-BI'S SMOOTH MOVE)
M 2/ 4/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Daniel W. Clayton, \$3,250.00
138 **AMIGOS SWING** (RHYTHMLESS-PEPPERED BAKIN)
F 2/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Craig Tasens, \$2,750.00
139 **RC BIZZIE BIZ** (BONAFIDE TOP DOG-RC SHOW BIZ)
F 2/24/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING

Purchaser: Scratched,
140 **AMIGOS RUMBA** (LONESOME CRY-KB'S MISS KEELIN)
F 2/13/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Joseph Trudden, \$3,250.00
141 **PJ EXCELLENT** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
F 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Scratched,
142 **DANCIN HOOTERS** (EL PASSION-HI NOON HOTTIE)
F 2/ 3/2013 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: John Weber, \$2,500.00
143 **TB'S MARVEL** (ATASCOCITA BOWL-SHERIFF BREES)
F 2/26/2013 TROY BIEHLE

Purchaser: Scratched,
144 **PAR SLIPPY** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-ASTAR STORMYLADY)
F 2/ 2/2013 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$2,000.00
145 **PJ SAKE** (DJAYS OCTANE-BI'S SMOOTH MOVE)
M 2/ 4/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$3,000.00
146 **KB'S CLASS CLOWN** (LONESOME CRY-TOKEN LADY A)
M 2/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Vincent H. Savill, \$3,500.00
147 **PJ FAST BREAK** (DJAYS OCTANE-BIKINI BAR)
M 2/ 8/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Clyde Mount, \$4,000.00
148 **AMIGOS JITTERBUG** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO REMARKABLE)
F 2/15/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Michael Seeger, \$1,750.00
149 **RC UFOLLOWME** (BONAFIDE TOP DOG-RC SHOW BIZ)
F 2/24/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING

Purchaser: Scratched,
150 **AMIGOS SALSA** (RHYTHMLESS-PEPPERED BAKIN)
F 2/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$3,250.00
151 **AMIGOS TWIST** (RHYTHMLESS-PEPPERED BAKIN)
F 2/16/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$6,000.00
152 **DANCIN CAESARS** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-EL REGINA)
M 2/ 4/2013 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: John Weber, \$2,000.00
153 **PJ SLAM DUNK** (DJAYS OCTANE-BIKINI BAR)
F 2/ 8/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN

Purchaser: Scratched,
154 **KB'S MEGALITE** (LONESOME CRY-TOKEN LADY A)
F 2/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Edward F. Gardner, Jr., \$2,000.00
155 **AMIGOS WALTZ** (LONESOME CRY-TURBO REMARKABLE)
M 2/15/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE OR MARTY D. TANNER
Purchaser: Yadwinder Singh Dod, \$1,100.00
156 **PJ DOUBLEDRIbble** (DJAYS OCTANE-BIKINI BAR)
M 2/ 8/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Roger Spiess, \$3,750.00
157 **RC MARCO POLO** (BONAFIDE TOP DOG-RC SHOW BIZ)
M 2/24/2013 HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Scratched,
158 **PJ GRAND** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
M 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Kent Loomer, \$2,750.00
159 **PJ SUPERIOR** (TYRUR ALEX*-UCME DRAWINGDEAD)
M 2/20/2013 VICTOR JAY RANGEL OR PAUL P. BITTERMAN
Purchaser: Plum Creek Kennel, \$27,000.00
160 **KB'S POPA DOG** (LONESOME CRY-TOKEN LADY A)
M 2/14/2013 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$3,000.00
161 **YO I FEEL FINE** (ODD ULYSSES-TOPAZ SALLYHALLY)
M 8/26/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR GAY FRIEDLI
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$11,000.00
162 **GO BON BASELINE** (TRENT LEE-GO BON JITTERBUG)
F 9/21/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH
Purchaser: Scratched,
163 **CTW GRONCKLE** (LONESOME CRY-SHELBOURNE JESS*)
M 8/27/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Kent Loomer, \$1,750.00
164 **AJ'S JETHRO** (USS RACEWAY-USS COOL CHOICE)
M 9/24/2012 JEFFREY D. JUNK OR ARDEN L. PHIFER
Purchaser: Scratched,
165 **KB'S CANDY KING** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
M 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$4,250.00
166 **JB'S OFF N WAY** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
M 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$9,000.00
167 **ANN COULTER** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
F 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$1,500.00
168 **SE'S CHARLIE** (RED RANGER-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
M 8/ 5/2012 BRUCE A. ARNHOLD OR STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Micahel L. Harris, \$8,750.00
169 **KB'S NIGHT ROCK** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
M 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$35,000.00
170 **JB'S FREEFLOW** (YAHOO OMAR-NIGHT OF MAGIC)
M 8/19/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Anthony Napolitano, \$1,250.00
171 **TK SWEET BY N BY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 9/10/2012 MARTY D. TANNER
Purchaser: H. Hal Gill, \$20,000.00
172 **SE'S WATCHER WIN** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHEISBANANAS)
F 8/ 8/2012 STEVEN A. WARD

Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$14,000.00
173 **GO BON DUE SOUTH** (TRENT LEE-GO BON JITTERBUG)
F 9/21/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH
Purchaser: Scratched,
174 **TK ROCK OF AGES** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 9/10/2012 MARTY D. TANNER
Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$20,000.00
175 **KB'S ATLAS** (OSWALD COBBLEPOT-KB'S SUN RACER)
M 8/11/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$10,000.00
176 **MITEY LOKI** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KELSOS GUM DROP)
M 9/29/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$7,500.00
177 **KB'S CHESNEE** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$3,750.00
178 **GLENN BECK** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
M 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$1,250.00
179 **CTW AFTERSHOCK** (CTW COUNTN MONEY-CTW POP A WHEELY)
M 9/12/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Roger Spiess, \$2,750.00
180 **AJ'S WARRIOR** (USS RACEWAY-USS COOL CHOICE)
M 9/24/2012 JEFFREY D. JUNK OR ARDEN L. PHIFER
Purchaser: Passed (\$15,000),
181 **YOUR UGLY** (GET OVER-VALLERI DEER)
F 8/23/2012 AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Passed (\$1,500),
182 **CLOSED ACCOUNT** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 MARK C. ADAMS
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$15,000.00
183 **YO SPICY ENTREE** (ODD ULYSSES-TOPAZ SALLYHALLY)
M 8/26/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR GAY FRIEDLI
Purchaser: Jim Abernathy, Jr., \$3,000.00
184 **KB'S FLAME BOY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
M 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
185 **PIECES OFA DREAM** (FLYING PENSKE-ELEVENTH HOUR)
M 9/10/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$3,000.00
186 **JB'S LOOK NO MO** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
F 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Anthony Napolitano, \$1,250.00
187 **KB'S KEY CARGO** (FLYING COAL CITY-BOW MY WAY)
M 9/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jerry Kramer, \$1,500.00
188 **KB'S OASIS** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: H. Hal Gill, \$22,000.00
189 **FARAWAY EYES** (RHYTHMLESS-WAVE ON WAVE)
F 9/30/2012 JOE LAIL
Purchaser: Scratched,
190 **KB'S IRONMAN** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
M 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$18,000.00
191 **JB'S KNOCKEM OUT** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
F 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT

Purchaser: John Weber, \$2,250.00
192 **MITEY ZOAR** (ODD ULYSSES-TOPAZ SALLYHALLY)
M 8/26/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$4,500.00
193 **CTW A TEAM** (CTW COUNTN MONEY-CTW POP A WHEELY)
M 9/12/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed (\$4,000),
194 **LISTEN LIVE** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
M 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: Ray Wong, \$2,250.00
195 **SE'S BRAVO UNIT** (RED RANGER-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
M 8/ 5/2012 BRUCE A. ARNHOLD OR STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Terry Scott, \$16,000.00
196 **SE'S FOX TRAP** (RED RANGER-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
F 8/ 5/2012 BRUCE A. ARNHOLD OR STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Scratched,
197 **QUICKSILVER GIRL** (RHYTHMLESS-WAVE ON WAVE)
F 9/30/2012 JOE LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
198 **KB'S SWIFT HOPE** (OSWALD COBBLEPOT-KB'S SUN RACER)
F 8/11/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
199 **YO MYSTIC FOG** (FLYING PENSKE-ELEVENTH HOUR)
M 9/10/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR GAY FRIEDLI
Purchaser: Scratched,
200 **BRETT BAIER** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
M 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$12,000.00
201 **KB'S DAREDEVIL** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
M 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$4,750.00
202 **SE'S BUILT TOUGH** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHEISBANANAS)
M 8/ 8/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Joseph Trudden, \$12,000.00
203 **TK ILL FLY AWAY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
M 9/10/2012 MARTY D. TANNER
Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$24,000.00
204 **QUIRKY GODDESS** (BD'S GRAYSON-BRETT LEE MALLIE)
F 8/18/2012 JASON LIPARI OR MARVIN CHRISMAN
Purchaser: Scratched,
205 **KB'S NICE TRICK** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
F 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$6,000.00
206 **MITEY MAXIMUS** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KELSOS GUM DROP)
M 9/29/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Robert Thorne, \$2,750.00
207 **JB'S SHAKE IT UP** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
F 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Anthony Napolitano, \$1,100.00
208 **GO BON BACKCOURT** (TRENT LEE-GO BON JITTERBUG)
M 9/21/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH
Purchaser: Scratched,
209 **KB'S CEDAR KEY** (FLYING COAL CITY-BOW MY WAY)
M 9/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$1,500.00
210 **CTW NIGHT FURY** (LONESOME CRY-SHELBOURNE JESS*)
M 8/27/2012 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Scratched,
211 **ROLL OVER ROVER** (GET OVER-VALLERI DEER)
M 8/23/2012 AUSTIN KING

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
212 **GO BON DOODLEBUG** (TRENT LEE-GO BON JITTERBUG)
M 9/21/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH

Purchaser: Scratched,
213 **JB'S PASSIN THRU** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
F 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT

Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$7,500.00
214 **KB'S DUST BIRD** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
F 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Leslie Csokasy, \$3,000.00
215 **KB'S GREER** (FLYING COAL CITY-KB'S AUTUMN DOVE)
M 9/ 9/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Scratched,
216 **AJ'S MINNOW** (USS RACEWAY-USS COOL CHOICE)
M 9/24/2012 JEFFREY D. JUNK OR ARDEN L. PHIFER

Purchaser: Scratched,
217 **CREAM PUFF** (GET OVER-VALLERI DEER)
M 8/23/2012 AUSTIN KING

Purchaser: Scratched,
218 **KB'S ZION** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
219 **GO BON SO WAT** (TRENT LEE-GO BON JITTERBUG)
F 9/21/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH

Purchaser: Scratched,
220 **TED CRUZ** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
M 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON

Purchaser: Scratched,
221 **KICKN UP MUD** (NMS SWEET THING-SOBE CREAMSUGAR)
M 9/23/2012 TIMOTHY DONAHUE

Purchaser: Scratched,
222 **WAY TOO SPICY** (RHYTHMLESS-WAVE ON WAVE)
F 9/30/2012 JOE LAIL

Purchaser: Scratched,
223 **JB'S HEADIN HOME** (FLYING COAL CITY-GABLE INDIA)
M 9/ 2/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT

Purchaser: Jesse Walker, \$1,100.00
224 **KB'S PALM HARBOR** (FLYING COAL CITY-BOW MY WAY)
M 9/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$2,750.00
225 **LOVIN GOOD VIBE** (RHYTHMLESS-WAVE ON WAVE)
F 9/30/2012 JOE LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON

Purchaser: Scratched,
226 **KB'S CABLE BOY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
M 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: James E. Blanchard, \$1,500.00
227 **CTW ADSILA JO** (CTW COUNTN MONEY-CTW POP A WHEELY)
F 9/12/2012 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
228 **KB'S TUNDRA** (OSWALD COBBLEPOT-KB'S SUN RACER)
F 8/11/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Tim Ertl, \$1,000.00
229 **TK AMAZING GRACE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BEAUTIFUL BRIDE)
F 9/10/2012 MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$40,000.00
230 **SE'S DELTA FORCE** (RED RANGER-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
F 8/ 5/2012 BRUCE A. ARNHOLD OR STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Vincent H. Savill, \$2,000.00
231 **JB'S FREESTYLE** (YAHOO OMAR-NIGHT OF MAGIC)
M 8/19/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Anthony Napolitano, \$1,100.00
232 **KB'S LIVE OAK** (FLYING COAL CITY-BOW MY WAY)
M 9/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jerry Kramer, \$1,400.00
233 **KB'S PARAGON** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Edward F. Gardner, Jr., \$3,500.00
234 **HILLSONG UNITED** (MY ROOSTER-SOFT TRENT)
F 9/22/2012 KEVIN DALTON
Purchaser: David Robinette, \$20,000.00
235 **QUIK KICK CALVIN** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KELSOS GUM DROP)
M 9/29/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR GAY FRIEDLI
Purchaser: Scratched,
236 **SE'S COME N THRU** (DJAYS OCTANE-AS SHEISBANANAS)
M 8/ 8/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$35,000.00
237 **SE'S ALPHA** (RED RANGER-SE'S RACEN RAINY)
M 8/ 5/2012 BRUCE A. ARNHOLD OR STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Scratched,
238 **WAR DIVA** (FLYING PENSKE-ELEVENTH HOUR)
F 9/10/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Tom G. Taplin, \$6,750.00
239 **CTW CHANGEWING** (LONESOME CRY-SHELBOURNE JESS*)
F 8/27/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
240 **RC PROM QUEEN** (EXTRUDING DREAM-RC GIRLFRIEND)
F 8/ 5/2012 HAROLD E. HOLDING
Purchaser: Scratched,
241 **KB'S PINNACLE** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-KB'S BLUE BAYOU)
F 9/13/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$7,250.00
242 **KB'S QUICK TIP** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-BI'S HUNTER)
F 9/21/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Roger Spiess, \$7,250.00
243 **AJ'S VIE** (USS RACEWAY-USS COOL CHOICE)
F 9/24/2012 JEFFREY D. JUNK OR ARDEN L. PHIFER
Purchaser: Scratched,
244 **MITEY QUIK KICK** (ODD ULYSSES-TOPAZ SALLYHALLY)
M 8/26/2012 GREGORIO LEYVA OR CURTIS JOHNSON
Purchaser: Jim Abernathy, Jr., \$3,500.00
245 **CTW ALHAMBRA** (CTW COUNTN MONEY-CTW POP A WHEELY)
F 9/12/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed (\$3,500),
246 **DIESEL BURNER** (GET OVER-VALLERI DEER)
M 8/23/2012 AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Scratched,
247 **PAR CRAVER** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BD'S RAVEN)
F 10/29/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Pat Dalton, \$11,000.00
248 **KB'S SHERLOCK** (YAHOO OMAR-KEEPERRADEPISODE)
M 10/ 1/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
249 **GO BON LOCKEDUP** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GO BON NICE LEE)
F 10/12/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH

Purchaser: Scratched,
250 **KNOWZEE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GABLE CHEDDAR)
F 10/10/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL

Purchaser: Julia Ward, \$3,500.00
251 **PAR DEJAVU** (DJAYS OCTANE-D'S DAFFY)
F 10/ 3/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: Charter Kennel, \$27,000.00
252 **LADEGO** (WW TIME WARP-GIT N STORMY)
M 10/13/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR GREGORY DEUEL

Purchaser: Scratched,
253 **GO BON JAILBREAK** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GO BON NICE LEE)
M 10/12/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH

Purchaser: Scratched,
254 **TK BRANDED MAN** (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
M 10/16/2012 MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$5,000.00
255 **O'REILY** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-DRIVEN LEE)
M 10/13/2012 KEVIN DALTON

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
256 **PAR DRAGON** (DJAYS OCTANE-D'S DAFFY)
M 10/ 3/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: Vince Berland, \$10,000.00
257 **SABOTAGE** (WW TIME WARP-GIT N STORMY)
M 10/13/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR GREGORY DEUEL

Purchaser: Passed (\$5,000),
258 **JUST CAUGHT FIRE** (BORDER PATROL-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
M 10/16/2012 GLENN C. JONES

Purchaser: Scratched,
259 **LIMBAUGH** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-DRIVEN LEE)
M 10/13/2012 KEVIN DALTON

Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$5,750.00
260 **TK MAMA TRIED** (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
M 10/16/2012 MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$4,000.00
261 **JSK PICKLES** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
F 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
262 **RUNNING FIRE** (BORDER PATROL-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
F 10/16/2012 GLENN C. JONES

Purchaser: Scratched,
263 **FRESH POPCORN** (DJAYS OCTANE-CHICAGO BELLE)
F 10/10/2012 DAVID STRONG

Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$6,750.00
264 **JSK GRANTZ** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
M 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
265 **HS HONEY BEE** (BD'S GRAYSON-HS HONEY)
F 10/ 7/2012 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: Scratched,
266 **CTW CLAIR BEDIZ** (LONESOME CRY-QUICK TRENT)
F 10/30/2012 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Scratched,
267 **HS HONEY BUN** (BD'S GRAYSON-HS HONEY)
F 10/ 7/2012 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: Scratched,
268 **PAR COLLECTOR** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/29/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: James Blanchard, \$4,500.00
269 **JSK SUGAR LUMP** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
F 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC

Purchaser: Jim Rosga, \$3,000.00
270 **SOCKS ON FIRE** (BORDER PATROL-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
F 10/16/2012 GLENN C. JONES

Purchaser: Scratched,
271 **HS HONEY COMB** (BD'S GRAYSON-HS HONEY)
F 10/ 7/2012 WILLIS HILL

Purchaser: Scratched,
272 **SALTY POPCORN** (DJAYS OCTANE-CHICAGO BELLE)
F 10/10/2012 DAVID STRONG

Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$5,750.00
273 **PAR DEMANDER** (DJAYS OCTANE-D'S DAFFY)
M 10/ 3/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$9,000.00
274 **WINDY RIO** (RHYTHMLESS-WINDY RITA)
F 10/14/2012 DAVID STRONG OR ALAN MURRAY

Purchaser: Robert Thorne, \$8,000.00
275 **CTW MERYL DAVIS** (LONESOME CRY-QUICK TRENT)
F 10/30/2012 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Scratched,
276 **TK RAMBLIN FEVER** (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
M 10/16/2012 MARTY D. TANNER

Purchaser: Vince Berland, \$5,500.00
277 **RAGING FIRE** (BORDER PATROL-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
M 10/16/2012 GLENN C. JONES

Purchaser: Scratched,
278 **CTW AJA EVANS** (LONESOME CRY-QUICK TRENT)
F 10/30/2012 DAVID R. PECK

Purchaser: Scratched,
279 **SHES ON FIRE** (BORDER PATROL-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
F 10/16/2012 GLENN C. JONES

Purchaser: Scratched,
280 **KB'S CONWAY** (YAHOO OMAR-KEEPERRADEPISODE)
M 10/ 1/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Scratched,
281 **JSK TATER TOT** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
M 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC

Purchaser: Lee Mundus, \$2,250.00
282 **LIFE OF PI** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-DRIVEN LEE)
M 10/13/2012 KEVIN DALTON

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
283 **GO BON INMATE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GO BON NICE LEE)
F 10/12/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH

Purchaser: Scratched,
284 **BD'S RANA** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BD'S RAVEN)
F 10/29/2012 WILLIAM S. DENTON

Purchaser: Passed (\$1,250),
285 **ILLUMINATE** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-DRIVEN LEE)
M 10/13/2012 KEVIN DALTON

Purchaser: Blu Too Kennel, \$14,250.00
286 **PAR CROWN** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/29/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER

Purchaser: Jason Lipari, \$2,250.00
287 **BROWER** (WW TIME WARP-GIT N STORMY)
M 10/13/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR GREGORY DEUEL
Purchaser: Scratched,
288 **JSK MACHO MAN** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
M 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC
Purchaser: Scratched,
289 **PAR CONTRACT** (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-BD'S RAVEN)
M 10/29/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Edward Bolton, \$1,500.00
290 **GO BON JAILBIRD** (KIOWA SWEET TREY-GO BON NICE LEE)
M 10/12/2012 GORDON OR BONNIE J. HEATH
Purchaser: Scratched,
291 **KB'S SWEENEY** (YAHOO OMAR-KEEPERRADEPISODE)
F 10/ 1/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$3,000.00
292 **PAR DANCER** (DJAYS OCTANE-D'S DAFFY)
M 10/ 3/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER
Purchaser: Jim Rosga, \$3,000.00
293 **JSK TROY BOY** (TEMPO PETROCELLI-JSK EBONY)
M 10/17/2012 JS KRAMER, LLC
Purchaser: Scratched,
294 **QUITE WELCOME** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-FISCHERS PET)
F 11/23/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR BRENT JONAS
Purchaser: Scratched,
295 **DANCIN WESTIN** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-SL JEAN)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Jason Hess, \$8,500.00
296 **TURBO CAPRICE** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Scratched,
297 **SE'S ALWAYS ON** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
M 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Scratched,
298 **CTW PICATINNEY** (TRENT LEE-CTW POWDER BASE)
M 11/ 9/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Coleen Pace, \$6,500.00
299 **KB'S ROCKWALL** (COLDWATER KONOW-RAINBOW TRAIL)
M 11/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Jim Rosga, \$3,750.00
300 **NEXT ADDITION** (KIOWA MON MANNY-WHATS NEXT)
M 11/ 3/2012 GEOFF COLLINS
Purchaser: Scratched,
301 **DANCIN JIMDANDY** (EL PASSION-SEEGOLD JANE)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
302 **TURBO CHRISSY** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Passed (\$1,500),
303 **TURBO SADIE** (BOB'S SKEET-C YA HIGH CARD)
F 11/22/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Purchaser: Scratched,
304 **KB'S COLGATE** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
305 **DANCIN FOXWOODS** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-SL JEAN)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER

Purchaser: Robert Lambert, \$4,000.00
306 **PRIDDY** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
F 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
307 **HAPPY CLAPPER** (CLAPPIN THUNDER-BD'S REGAN)
M 11/12/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Passed (\$1,250),
308 **COME ON MAN** (DJAYS OCTANE-JAMMIN ANNA)
M 11/ 8/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR
Purchaser: Scratched,
309 **GO HOME** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
F 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: James Zawisa, \$5,000.00
310 **KB'S GOLD RIDER** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
M 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$6,250.00
311 **FLASH RIGHT BY** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
M 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
312 **JB'S HARD LINK** (DRAGON FIRE-FLYIN DAYDREAMER)
M 11/10/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Jeffrey Knight, \$4,000.00
313 **SE'S PHOTO RUN** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
F 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Randy Finegan, \$15,000.00
314 **CUERVO SHOT** (HI NOON HERO-TOP SHOT)
M 11/17/2012 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Passed (\$26,000),
315 **WHITE NIGHT** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
M 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: S. Lester Raines, \$26,000.00
316 **KB'S CREDIT RATE** (MY ROOSTER-WHISTLER'S ANNIE)
M 11/ 3/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
317 **TURBO SAMANTHA** (BOB'S SKEET-C YA HIGH CARD)
F 11/22/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Purchaser: Scratched,
318 **SLICK ANNIE** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
F 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
319 **PATCHED UP** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-FISCHERS PET)
F 11/23/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR BRENT JONAS
Purchaser: Scratched,
320 **DANCIN TELL JACK** (EL PASSION-SEEGOLD JANE)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
321 **TURBO POWER** (CLAPPIN THUNDER-BD'S REGAN)
M 11/12/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Scratched,
322 **DROP TOP** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
F 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: Gloria Dorsey, \$7,500.00
323 **NEXT DECISION** (KIOWA MON MANNY-WHATS NEXT)
M 11/ 3/2012 GEOFF COLLINS
Purchaser: Scratched,
324 **KB'S GUMBALLS** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
325 **TURBO CASEY** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
M 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Scratched,
326 **LOBO GO** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
F 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
327 **COUNSELOR** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
M 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: Thomas A. Ferris, \$43,000.00
328 **KB'S GOLD FEVER** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: John Weber, \$3,000.00
329 **CTW YACK ATTACK** (LONESOME CRY-CTW SWEET TRENT)
M 11/ 3/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Scratched,
330 **SE'S ALL I NEED** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
F 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Vincent H. Savill, \$9,500.00
331 **TURBO CHARITY** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Michael R. Seeger, \$3,000.00
332 **TURBO CAYLA** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
333 **CLEAN ENERGY** (CLAPPIN THUNDER-BD'S REGAN)
F 11/12/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Scratched,
334 **JB'S HARD COPY** (DRAGON FIRE-FLYIN DAYDREAMER)
M 11/10/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
335 **KB'S FLEET FEET** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Donna Barr, \$3,500.00
336 **DANCIN MANDALAY** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-SL JEAN)
F 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
337 **SE'S EYEWITNESS** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
M 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Plum Creek Kennel, \$32,500.00
338 **KB'S RAPID FLOW** (COLDWATER KONOW-RAINBOW TRAIL)
M 11/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Robert Thorne, \$4,500.00
339 **TURBO SAL** (BOB'S SKEET-C YA HIGH CARD)
M 11/22/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Purchaser: Scratched,
340 **NOON SHOT** (HI NOON HERO-TOP SHOT)
M 11/17/2012 WAYNE STRONG
Purchaser: Joseph Trudden, \$16,000.00
341 **HI MAINTENANCE** (DJAYS OCTANE-JAMMIN ANNA)
F 11/ 8/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR
Purchaser: Scratched,
342 **CTW ZEN MASTER** (LONESOME CRY-FUZZYS CORAL SEA)
M 11/20/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Randy Doubles, \$4,500.00
343 **KB'S LADY GINGER** (MY ROOSTER-WHISTLER'S ANNIE)
F 11/ 3/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: {assed no bid,
344 **TURBO SHARISE** (BOB'S SKEET-C YA HIGH CARD)
F 11/22/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Purchaser: Scratched,
345 **DANCIN FLAMINGO** (EL PASSION-SEEGOLD JANE)
F 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Jim Rosga, \$3,250.00
346 **KB'S WORLDWIDE** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
M 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Scratched,
347 **GOLDILOCKS** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
F 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: Robert Britton, \$20,000.00
348 **SE'S EXCLUSIVE** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
F 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Scratched,
349 **HOT STOVE** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-FISCHERS PET)
M 11/23/2012 ROBERT CROSSLAND OR BRENT JONAS
Purchaser: Passed (\$3,500),
350 **TURBO CASSIE** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Richard Maddock, \$3,000.00
351 **SE'S SPIRIT RUN** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
M 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Scratched,
352 **ZERO** (KIOWA MON MANNY-TNJ KASA KID)
F 11/ 2/2012 URSULA O'DONNELL
Purchaser: James Blanchard, \$3,500.00
353 **SOLAR POWER** (CLAPPIN THUNDER-BD'S REGAN)
F 11/12/2012 BOBBY JOE PARKER OR AUSTIN KING
Purchaser: Garth Bolton, \$4,000.00
354 **KB'S TRICKY LADY** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$15,000.00
355 **SE'S AFTER DARK** (BD'S GRAYSON-TALI MONDAY)
F 11/19/2012 STEVEN A. WARD
Purchaser: Steve Sarras, \$15,000.00
356 **TURBO CARMEL** (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-YAHOO OMEGA)
F 11/30/2012 EDWARD GARDNER, JR. OR CHRIS POLITIS
Purchaser: Scratched,
357 **TEQUILA SHOT** (HI NOON HERO-TOP SHOT)
F 11/17/2012 DAVID STRONG
Purchaser: Scratched,
358 **BD'S REGINA** (CLAPPIN THUNDER-BD'S REGAN)
F 11/12/2012 WILLIAM S. DENTON
Purchaser: Scratched,
359 **JB'S HARD CORE** (DRAGON FIRE-FLYIN DAYDREAMER)
M 11/10/2012 TROY BIEHLE OR JOHN BURNETT
Purchaser: Norman L. Rader, \$11,000.00
360 **KB'S HEY BABY** (COLDWATER KONOW-RAINBOW TRAIL)
F 11/26/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: T. Roventini & W. McCarthy, \$2,500.00
361 **VIRGINIA BELLE** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
F 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
362 **KB'S FIREDANCER** (MY ROOSTER-BI'S SUGAR MOMMA)
F 11/ 2/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE

Purchaser: Passed no bid,
363 **DANCIN HARDROCK** (LS JACK WILLIAMS-SL JEAN)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Joseph M. Fusaro, Jr., \$2,000.00
364 **MONA MCVIE** (FLASH RIGHT-FLOSSY FLASHER)
F 11/24/2012 ASHLEY LAIL OR DARRELL JIMMERSON
Purchaser: Scratched,
365 **CTW PRISTINA** (TRENT LEE-CTW POWDER BASE)
F 11/ 9/2012 DAVID R. PECK
Purchaser: Passed (\$3,000),
366 **DANCIN BELLAGIO** (EL PASSION-SEEGOLD JANE)
M 11/26/2012 PETER LIMMER
Purchaser: Passed no bid,
367 **FRAMAGE** (DJAYS OCTANE-JAMMIN ANNA)
F 11/ 8/2012 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR
Purchaser: Scratched,
368 **KB'S GATEWAY JOE** (MY ROOSTER-WHISTLER'S ANNIE)
M 11/ 3/2012 KENNETH BIEHLE
Purchaser: Craig Tasens, \$1,250.00